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Drug Free Workplace Certificate Form YES YES YES
PRICE SHEET
PART 1
1. ARMAFLEX 11/8 (1 1/8" X 1/2") _ T11/812 _
PART NUMBER No Bid $.32/FT No Bid
UNIT PRICE '
2. ARMAFLEX 13/8 (13/8"X1/2") ) T113812 )
PART NUMBER No Bid $.41/ FT No Bid
UNIT PRICE '
3. ARMAFLEX 1 5/8 (15/8" X 1/2") _ T115812 _
PART NUMBER No Bid $.41/FT No Bid
UNIT PRICE '
4. SPLIT ARMAFLEX 7/8 ( 7/8" X 1/2")
PART NUMBER No Bid $.31/FT No Bid
UNIT PRICE
5. SPLIT ARMAFLEX 1 3/8 (13/8" X 1/2")
PART NUMBER No Bid $.40/FT No Bid
UNIT PRICE
6. FLEXIBLE ALUMINUM DUCT 3" _ 1053 _
PART NUMBER No Bid $.59/FT No Bid
UNIT PRICE '
7. T BAR CEILING GRILLE s
( PERFORATED ) 24" X 24" ) RFNP )
PART NUMBER No Bid $13.15 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
8. DOOR GRILLE 20" X 20" ) 6722020 )
PART NUMBER No Bid $9.13 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
9. 28 GUAGE 16" ELBOWS ) 1111628GA )
PART NUMBER No Bid $9.02 No Bid

UNIT PRICE
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10. A-48 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.90 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
11. A-52 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.98 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
12. A-54BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.04 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
13. A-56 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.07 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
14. A-60 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.16 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
15. A-48 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.32 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
16. A-31 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.44 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
17. B-34 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.02 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
18. B-35 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.06 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
19. A-33 BELT
No Bid $1.49 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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20. B-38 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.27 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
21. B-40 BELT ) _
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.37 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
22. B-41 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.92 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
23. BX-42 BELT ) _
PART NUMBER No Bid $4.61 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
24. B-46 BELT ) _
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.68 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
25. BX-48 BELT ) :
PART NUMBER No Bid $5.16 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
26. BP-51 BELT ) :
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.88 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
27. B-55BELT ) :
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.98 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
28. B-56 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.02 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
29. B-58 BELT
No Bid $2.98 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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30. B-59 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.06 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
31. B-60 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.09 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
32. A-36 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.58 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
33. A-37 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.63 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
34. A-38 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.65 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
35. A-39 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.68 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
36. B-73 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.61 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
37. 4L-670 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.00 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
38. 3VX850 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $10.73 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
39. 5L-850 BELT _ _
No Bid $3.63 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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40. A-44 BELT . ;
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.83 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
41. A-41 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.73 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
42. A-26 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.97 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
43. B-100 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $4.94 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
44. B-64 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.25 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
45. B-86 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $9.60 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
46. 3L-200 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.07 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
47. 3L-210 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.07 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
48. 3L-220 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.07 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
49. 3L-240 BELT
No Bid $1.07 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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50. 3L-260 BELT . .
AR NUMBER No Bid $1.08 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
51. 3L-340 BELT . .
AT NUMBER No Bid $1.22 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
52. 4L-230 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.22 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
53. 4L-240 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.22 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
54. 41-250 BELT . .
DART NUMBER No Bid $1.22 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
55. 4L-270 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.16 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
56. 4L-290 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.19 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
57. 4L-300 BELT . .
DART NUMBER No Bid $1.21 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
58. 4L-320 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.23 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
59. 4L-330 BELT . .
No Bid $1.27 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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60. 4L-360 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.39 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
61. 4L-370 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.36 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
62. 4L-380 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.38 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
63. 4L-390 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.43 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
64. 4L-400 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.45 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
65. 4L-410 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.48 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
66. 4L-420 BELT ) )
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.49 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
67. 4L-430 BELT ) )
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.52 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
68. 4L-440 BELT ) )
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.55 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
69. 4L-460 BELT ) )
No Bid $1.60 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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70. 4L-470 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.62 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
71. 4L-480 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.63 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
72. 41L-490 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.64 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
73. 4L-500 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.67 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
74. 4L-520 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.69 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
75. 4L-540 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.74 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
76. 4L-560 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.79 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
77. 4L-570 BELT . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.80 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
78. 4L-660 BELT
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.99 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
79. 4L-680 BELT
No Bid $2.03 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE




TABULATION SHEET FOR:

[0 o <
<
BID #SDOC 04-48 CJ 8< R o2 5 59
— > [}
DATE/TIME: 6/23/04 @ 2:00 PM S E @ % _% 2 *2 ;g,;
READ BY:Linda Ciraldo o s 25 ¢ S
L= - N7} o
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee S§s5% ogE o
8=3 58 E a2
Ke] [ el —
20§ 2339 ¥5 8
<5z ma ¥ =XO
80. 4L-870 BELT ) _
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.62 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
81. 5L-420 BELT ) _
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.03 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
82. 5L-580 BELT ) _
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.62 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
83. 5L-600 BELT ) _
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.66 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
84. B-70 BELT ) _
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.49 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
85. B-71 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.53 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
86. B-67 BELT _ _
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.37 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
87. B-96 BELT ) :
PART NUMBER No Bid $4.78 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
88. 4R3VX1060 BELT ) _
PART NUMBER No Bid $62.91 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
89. A-40 BELT _ _
No Bid $1.70 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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90. A-42 BELT _ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.78 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
91. AX-46 BELT _ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $9.97 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
92. A-47 BELT _ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.88 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
93. 2" X 60 YARDS GREY DUCT TAPE _ PC6092 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $3.05 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
94. 2" WIDE PEEL BACK PLAIN ALUMINUM 488550
TAPE PART - i
No Bid No Bid
NUMBER ! $3.87 !
UNIT PRICE
95. PERMA GUM ( BLOCK) _ VG22 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $4.07 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
96. TAPE INSULATION CORK _ VCT1 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $4.82 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
97. TAPE INSULATION FOAM _ K501 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $5.92 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
98. 3" WIDE ALUMINUM PLAIN FOIL TAPE No Bid 488350 No Bid
PART NUMBER $5.62
UNIT PRICE
99. UNIVERSAL MOTOR #671 MAG671 .
PART NUMBER $91.61 $54.67 No Bid

UNIT PRICE




TABULATION SHEET FOR:

) o
> <
BID #SDOC 04-48 CJ 8<% o< 5 59
=1 (4p]
DATE/TIME: 6/23/04 @ 2:00 PM §2% £ 8. 28
o £ 5
READ BY:Linda Ciraldo T 5a £gg S
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee 8&§E a E = ]
S 228 | sge | %
8 u,—) 5] é % 2 [$} 2 =
<o Z naX =~0
100. UNIVERSAL MOTOR #791 MAG791 .
PART NUMBER $166.16 $106.10 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
101. UNIVERSAL MOTOR #350 MAG350 .
PART NUMBER $68.62 $42.50 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
102. UNIVERSAL MOTOR #158 460V
"ONLY" $166.15 LAAEIE No Bid
PART NUMBER $109.57
UNIT PRICE
103. UNIVERSAL MOTOR #150 230 V/
"ONLY" $170.52 LAAEIEY No Bid
PART NUMBER $94.54
UNIT PRICE
104. UNIVERSAL MOTOR #529 "ONLY" MAG529 .
PART NUMBER $67.36 $38.81 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
105. BLOWER WITH MOTOR #2C067
PART NUMBER No Bid $65.51 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
106. COPELAND MOTOR #050-0251-00
"ONLY" No Bid $78.68 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
107. DAYTON MOTOR #5K574
PART NUMBER No Bid $117.42 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
108. UNIVERSAL MOTOR #573 MAG573 .
PART NUMBER $68.69 $43.86 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
109. ICE MACHINE CLEANER NICKEL SAFE 0405803
GALLON SIZE No Bid - : No Bid
PART NUMBER $36.90

UNIT PRICE
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110. 12.0Z. CAN EXPANDING FOAM 45516
SEALANT No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $3.63
UNIT PRICE
111. 4 MFD AEROVOX 370 VOLT CAP43T0
CAPACITOR No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $2.04
UNIT PRICE
112. 124-156 MFD 125 VOLT GAPACITOR _ CAP124115 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.65 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
113. 15 MFD 370 VOLT CAPAGITOR CAP15370
(OVAL) No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $3.56
UNIT PRICE
114. SA-175 7/8 SIGHT GLASS
PART NUMBER No Bid $13.26 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
115 VST-44 UNION T'S
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.45 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
116. 1/4" ACCESS VALVE _ CD8404 :
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $1.00 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
117. 5/16" ACCESS VALVE _ CD8405 :
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $1.36 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
118. 3/8" ACCESS VALVE _ CD8406 :
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.41 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
119. FAN HUB 5/8 MAGNETEK #7261 _ 60-7658-04 :
PART NUMBER No Bid 40 42 No Bid

UNIT PRICE
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120. FAN HUB 1/2 . 60-7658-05 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $5.61 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
121. SUCTION LINE FILTER #F-48 ALCO
PART NUMBER No Bid $19.39 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
122. #Y594G 1252 STAT WITH SUBBASE
HONEYWELL $82.94 $57.93 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
123. #T7874D1165 HONEYWELL STAT .
PART NUMBER $95.68 $65.43 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
124. #T87F1859 HONEYWELL "ONLY" .
PART NUMBER $24.85 $21.85 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
125. RANCO #101-1410 TEMP CONTROL
"ONLY" $69.91 $33.54 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
126. PARAGON ELECT #8141-20 "ONLY"
PART NUMBER $180.24 FEELEY No Bid
UNIT PRICE $108.71
127. TIMER DEFROST FRIGID RANCO
#732-323 No Bid No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
128. KIT MOUNTING MOTOR 5 5/8 MAG 1223A
#1223 40.16 No Bid
PART NUMBER $ $8.09
UNIT PRICE
129. RANCO #K-3001 CONTROL WATER
COOLER No Bid $21.92 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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130. TIMER DEFROST GE #WR9X363 _ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $21.79 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
131. SOLID STATE DELAY TIMER #TD-69W No Bid SUPTDE9 No Bid
PART NUMBER $3.89
UNIT PRICE
132. CAMSTAT #CIVA-5 TIME DELAY _ : _
PART NUMBER No Bid No Bid No Bid
UNIT PRICE
133. DELAY ON MAKER TIMER MARS 40301
#32391 No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $8.13
UNIT PRICE
134. HEATER CUTLER HAMMER #H1047 No Bid $8.91 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
135. HEATER SIEMENS #SASFH28 _ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $7.97 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
136. FURNAS HEATER #E32 _ FURE32 :
PART NUMBER No Bid $7.87 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
137. CRANKCASE PRESSURE
REGULATION VALVE SPORLAN CROT-6-
0/60/ 7/8 ODF SPORLAN "ONLY" No Bid $43.03 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
138. ICE MACHINE FLOAT VALVE
CRYSTAL TIP #01128200 No Bid $33.97 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE




TABULATION SHEET FOR:

) o
> > <

BID #SDOC 04-48 CJ $<8 o5 5
— (4p]

DATE/TIME: 6/23/04 @ 2:00 PM 5 E 2 £ g - 2 ;&;

. . (@] = (0]

READ BY:Linda Ciraldo - S T8 g o
22 25 ¢ g

RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee S5 agE £
8= g 5o £ =
0 = ~ (%) (o] ©
3L T o 2 o2 <
<o Z naX =~0

139. DIVERSIFIED ELEC. TIMER #AC-200-5-

24 No Bid No Bid No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

140. BARBER COLMAN HYDRAULIC

ACTUATOR #MA-5213-0-0-3 $163.50 EC AR No Bid

PART NUMBER $140.23

UNIT PRICE

141. HONEYWELL ACTUATOR

#ML6161A2009 $41.29 $35.82 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

142. AAF FAN SWITCH #4EAL8735 : .

PART NUMBER No Bid $39.65 No Bid

UNIT PRICE

143. RANCO #010-2054 CONDENSER FAN

CYCLE "ONLY" $74.02 $41.87 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

144. TRANSFORMER POWER H/W AT 88A

1047 "ONLY" $48.47 $37.36 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

145. HONEYWELL #14003294004 REPACK

KIT "ONLY" $32.52 $38.57 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

146. CARRIER TEMP SENSOR

#HN68GA242 No Bid $69.32 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

147. TRANE OIL PRESSURE SWITCH

#CNT0553 $117.45 $128.93 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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148. TIMER CARRIER #HK35AA005 "ONLY" No Bid $79.29 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
149. POWER CAGE ASSEMBLY 7 TON
ALCO #X-22440-B6B No Bid $15.43 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
150. ACUSTATS 72 DEG. . S72 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $3.86 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
151. ALCO #X-22440-B2B "ONLY"
PART NUMBER No Bid $27.25 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
152. PAN TREATMENT #SCM182 FLOW SCM182HT
PLUS No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $24.46
UNIT PRICE
153. AEROVOX 10 MFD 370 VOLT . CAP10370 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $2.48 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
154. AERO 124-149 MFD 330 VOLT . CAP124330 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $5.56 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
155. SIGHT GLASS 3/8" (SWEAT) _ SA135 _
PART NUMBER No Bid $7.74 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
156. AUX CONTACT N/OPEN #C320KA1
CUTLER HAMMER No Bid $38.74 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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157. AUX CONTACT N/CLOSED
#C320KA02 CUTLER HAMMER No Bid $33.17 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
158. MCDONNELL FLOW, FS-8W "ONLY"
PART NUMBER $91.17 $109.59 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
159. THERMOSTAT #T874B1019
HONEYWELL "ONLY" $83.36 $57.81 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
160. T-STAT SUB BASE CARRIER
#99TZ900401 No Bid CEEOLETE 1O No Bid
PART NUMBER BID
UNIT PRICE
161. THERMOSTAT #T991A-1426 .
PART NUMBER $159.38 $135.36 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
162. SUB STAT #Q539J-1006 SUPER TRAD
"ONLY" $15.48 $9.12 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
163. ACUSTAT #LAH-11E CONTROL . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $29.68 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
164. SPORLAN #RC4864 . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $10.52 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
165. SPORLAN #RC4864-HH . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $16.37 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
166. SPORLAN #RC10098-HH
No Bid $36.48 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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167. VALVE TOP LINE 5/16 MODEL #QTM-1 No Bid $1.93 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
168. HONEYWELL TRANSFORMER
#AT140A1018 "ONLY" $10.84 $8.19 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
169. CARRIER SENSOR #30GB660002
"ONLY” No Bid $118.00 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
170. SHAFT COUPLING AAF #GCA500015A No Bid $137.00 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
171. FLOAT SWITCH BECKETT MODEL
#1502 No Bid $5.89 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
172. RAYCHEM HEAT SYSTEM KIT #H900 No Bid WGH900 No Bid
PART NUMBER $17.92
UNIT PRICE
173. BARBER COLMAN VALVE PACKING
KIT CONTROLINE #YBA 635 $34.04 $29.77 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
174. CONDUCTIVITY PROBE SENSOR
CARRIER #782010 No Bid No Bid No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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175. ICE MACHINE FAN MOTOR 1/40 HP

115V RPM 1550 AMP 1.1 ROT CCWLES AO AO126

SMITH No Bid $19.40 No Bid

PART NUMBER :

UNIT PRICE

176. MAGNETIC STARTER CLASS #8536

SQUARE D #5C0O3U02 No Bid $254.70 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

177. SPORLAN ME 195250 VALVE

PART NUMBER No Bid $68.01 No Bid

UNIT PRICE

178. SPORLAN COIL KIT 208/240V 50-60 HZ

#MKC-2 No Bid $18.56 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

179. RAYCHEM CABLE HEATING PIPE WGW516P

#W51-6P No Bid No Bid

PART NUMBER $21.90

UNIT PRICE

180. CABLE HEATING 220V EASY HEAT W5212L

B12-2 No Bid No Bid

PART NUMBER $27.03

UNIT PRICE

181. SPORLAN COIL KIT 120V 50-60 HZ MKC1120

#MKC-1 No Bid No Bid

PART NUMBER $15.84

UNIT PRICE

182. PRESSURE CONTROL 450 HIGH

#33359 No Bid $13.47 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

183. PRESSURE CONTROL 40 LOW #MPL-

7014 No Bid $17.41 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE
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184. TRANE CIRCUIT BOARD #X13690093- BRDO0613
01-7/BRD0613 240.31 No Bid
PART NUMBER $ $202.82
UNIT PRICE
185. MOTOR SHAFT BUSHING 1/2 X 5/8 . 1487A .
PART NUMBER No Bid $11.73 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
186. ALCO EXPANSION VALVE
#TCLE 5 HW No Bid $69.48 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
187. ALCO POWER CAGE ASSY 10 TON
#X22440-B7B No Bid $13.96 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
188. KON-TROLE DRAIN PAN TABLETS
100 CT. #PT-151 No Bid $21.51 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
189. DETECTO SOAP #SCM 805-08
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.58 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
190. ACID TEST KIT 1-TIME . TA1 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $6.21 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
191. AEROVOX 5 MFD 370 VA . CAP5370 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.73 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
192. 7.5 MFD 370 V CAPACITOR . CAP75370 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.24 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
193. 6 MFD 370 V CAPACITOR . CAP6370 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.36 No Bid

UNIT PRICE
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194. SIGHT GLASS 5/8 (SWEAT) . SA15S :
PART NUMBER No Bid $9.60 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
195. SIGHT GLASS 1/2 (SWEAT) . SA14S .
PART NUMBER No Bid $9.28 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
196. 7.5 MFD 440 V RUN CAPACITOR . CAP75440 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $2.81 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
197. CONDENSER MOTOR FAN RAIN 1383A
CAPS 5/8" No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $2.55
UNIT PRICE
198. 1/2 MAGNETEK RAIN CAP #1383A . 1330A .
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.55 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
199. WHITE ROGERS CONTROL TEMP
#1609-101 $43.36 $24.60 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
200. HONEYWELL T-STAT SUBBASE
#Q674E1049 "ONLY" $20.70 $14.15 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
201. JOHNSON CONTROL AIR LIMIT
#P20EB-2C $35.07 $29.71 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
202. HONEYWELL T-STAT HEAT/COOL
#T651A2028 "ONLY" $38.49 $33.32 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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203. HONEYWELL T-STAT #T675A-1508
"ONLY" $74.12 $55.74 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
204. RANCO LOW PRESSURE SWITCH
#A22-1129 $55.82 $29.58 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
205. DSC SYSTEM MANAGER OMNIZONE
#DSC-GE "ONLY" No Bid $257.64 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
206. RANCO LOW PRESSURE CONTROL
#010-1402 $73.39 $38.66 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
207. POLLEY BROWNING 1 VP 56Y 5/8 . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $45.56 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
208. SHAFT BUSHING BUSH SPLIT 5/8 -1/2 No Bid 1487A No Bid
PART NUMBER $11.73
UNIT PRICE
209. KASON HANDLE #K-55 . K-55-20 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $290.48 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
210. HONEYWELL TRANSFORMER
#ATB7A-1106 "ONLY" $21.43 $15.49 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
211. 240/480 PRI 120 SEC 50/60 HZ MAG
#636-1191 No Bid $152.94 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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212. DONGAN TRANSFORMER 480/120
#33-100L No Bid $54.35 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
213. McQUAY TRANSFORMER #AAF
735003531 No Bid $36.98 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
214. DONGAN TRANSFORMER 460/230 (X-
4) #33-100D "ONLY" No Bid $55.74 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
215. TRANSFORMER #AAF 4EPB7717
"ONLY" No Bid $229.80 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
216. YELLOW OR BLUE 3" SELF STICK
FIBERGLASS TAPE No Bid FELLEZl T No Bid
PART NUMBER $3.19
UNIT PRICE
217. LOVEJOY SURE-FLEX #7JE
PART NUMBER No Bid $19.53 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
218. MAKEUP VALVE 1" WATTS FOR
CARRIER XL23 CHILLER No Bid FL11000 No Bid
PART NUMBER $20.81
UNIT PRICE
219. SIEBE ACTUATOR DRIVE CP 8391-931
#CP 8391-913 $159.67 ’ $134.00
PART NUMBER $73.56
UNIT PRICE
220. FLUSH MOUNT DIAL THEMOMETER
#6142-20 COOPER No Bid LIl No Bid
PART NUMBER $15.07

UNIT PRICE
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221. MAMAC TEMPERATURE SENSOR #TE
205-P-17 No Bid $29.41 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
222. FLOAT VALVE C/T #80016401 . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $11.03 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
223. MAMAC SENSOR
#TE-205-C-7-A-2A $16.21 $18.82 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
224. MAMAC PILOT ASSY #RE-440-2 .
PART NUMBER $11.58 $14.11 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
225. COLMAN VALVE ACUATOR MP5213
#MP-5213-0-0-3 196.70 165.48
PART NUMBER ____ 3 $169.16 $
UNIT PRICE
226. COLMAN T-STAT #TP8101-0-0-1 TP8101
PART NUMBER $127.83 $100.64 $107.66
UNIT PRICE
227. T-STAT CONTROL BOARD
#USC-221 No Bid $56.47 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
228. HONEYWELL SENSOR #T7770A1006 . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $29.73 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
229. MAMAC SENSOR #TE-205-E-17 .
PART NUMBER $11.58 $33.82 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
230. 3/4" WATTS FLOAT VALVE #2X525
No Bid $15.82 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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231. FLOW PLUS BLOCK #602 _ SCM1816 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $11.68 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
232. LEAK LOCK 4 OZ. _ SCMCLLM .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $3.20 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
233. 35 MFD 440 V CAPACITOR _ CAP35440 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $6.21 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
234. 35 MFD 370 V CAPACITOR _ CAP35370 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $4.94 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
235. AERO M 36-43 250 V CAPACITOR _ CAP36230 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $2.00 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
236. 270-324 MFD 110/125 V CAPACITOR _ CAP270115 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $2.07 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
237. HONEYWELL WATER VALVE AMB410A1029
#M16410A1011 i
PART NUMBER $55.45 Rk No Bid
UNIT PRICE
238. HARD START CAPACITOR #SPP-6 _ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $8.11 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
239. ASCO REPAIR KIT #302272 _
PART NUMBER $70.00 $63.23 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
240. ELMIN VIBRAT 1 5/8 _ VE158 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $32.43 No Bid

UNIT PRICE
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241. ELMIN VIBRAT 1 7/8 . VE78 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $11.61 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
242. ELMIN VIBRAT 1 1/8 . VE118 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $14.45 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
243. T-STAT SUBBASE #Q674B-1075
"ONLY" $19.93 $12.77 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
244. JOHNSON AIR LIMIT CONTROL
#P20EB-1C $34.35 $27.27 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
245. TIME CONTROL #8145-20 .
PART NUMBER $163.11 $87.31 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
246. SIEMENS ACROSS THE LINE
STARTER 3PH NEMA 1 #SA SXLC0480 No Bid $243.94 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
247. MAGNETEK 240/120 TRANSFORMER
DRY-TYPE #211-0211 No Bid No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
248. CARRIER CRANK CASE HEATER #06
EA 660-148 No Bid $50.74 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
249. CYSTAL TIP FLOAT ARM #895- 21056400
210564B-0 No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $14.82

UNIT PRICE
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250. YORK WATER SENSOR #325-25195
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE

No Bid

$91.10

No Bid

251. YORK LP TRANSDUCER KIT
#325-28643-600

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

No Bid

$464.49

No Bid

252. YORK LP TRANSDUCER
#025-28939-000

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

No Bid

$443.72

No Bid

253. YORK LP TRANSDUCER
#025-28938-000

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

No Bid

$443.72

No Bid

254. DEFROST CONTROLLER #8141-20
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE

$180.24

$108.71

No Bid

255. PENN CONTROL #P74-FA-1
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE

$93.34

$87.14

No Bid

256. FUSE 2 1/2 A FOR LENNOX
TRANSFORMER #66247

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

No Bid

$0.47

No Bid

257. 15 A 500V FUSES #F1Q15A
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

258. TRM 6/10 AMP FUSES
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

259. MODULE 115V T1 COPELAND
#998-0424-01

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

No Bid

998052410
$147.26

No Bid
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260. HONEYWELL #AT87A-1049 "ONLY" .
PART NUMBER ____ $28.32 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
261. OIL PRESSURE SWITCH
#HKO060VB006 No Bid $131.68 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
262. BEARINGS 1 1/4" OIL LIGHT #AFF
4ACE2256A No Bid $45.29 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
263. HENRY VALVE CO #9713 INDICATOR
CAP ASSY #MI-3 No Bid $9.98 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
264. TEMP. SENSOR FOR CARRIER XL23
CHILLER #HH 79NZ 047 3" No Bid $61.88 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
265. TRANSDUCER #HK05YZ002 : .
PART NUMBER No Bid $395.88 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
266. 1" SENSOR FOR CARRIER XL23
CHILLER #HH79NZ059 No Bid $47.70 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
267. CABLE ASSY FOR CARRIER XL23
CHILLER #HH79NZ048 No Bid $28.41 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
268. JEFFERSON TRANSFORMER .075KVA
240/120 MAGNETEK #211-211 No Bid No Bid No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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269. 5'HOSE W/4" EXHAUST EXHAUST
HOOD PIPER COLLAR (DRYER VENT) No Bid DAVHA-4 No Bid
PART NUMBER $4.03
UNIT PRICE
270. CARRIER CRANK CASE HEATER #06
DA 660-076 No Bid $82.35 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
271. RAYCHEM HEATING CABLE 115 V WHB12950
#W GRD-H612-250' No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $2.59/FT
UNIT PRICE
272. RAYCHEM HEATING CABLE 240 V WGHE22080
#W GRD-H622-250' No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $2.91/FT
UNIT PRICE
273. LOCKING BOX #BTG-UK 77-PG12 BTGUK2 .
PART NUMBER 190-068 $16.43 $10.33 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
274. GUARD #BTG 54VLW 190-067 .
PART NUMBER $21.53 $11.64 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
275. VACUM PUMP OIL (GALLON) _ 13204 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $7.49 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
276. REFRIGERATION OIL
(#300 VIRGINIA) No Bid L352 No Bid
PART NUMBER $8.62
UNIT PRICE
277. 8" BALL FLOAT _ FL1P8PF )
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $9.00 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
278. JEPCO HEATER #JP-100-3 "ONLY"
No Bid $11.44 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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279. JEPCO HEATER #JP-202 "ONLY"
PART NUMBER No Bid $22.06 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
280. JEPCO HEATER #JP-101 "ONLY"
PART NUMBER No Bid $12.38 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
281. JEPCO HEATER #JP-204-2 "ONLY"
PART NUMBER No Bid $22.07 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
282. CYRY-TIP WATER VALVE (#19283500
CENTRIFUGAL PUMP) No Bid CEROLETE L No Bid
PART NUMBER BID
UNIT PRICE
283. JOHNSON #P28AA-1 PROTECTOR, P28AAIC
LUBE, OIL "ONLY" 117.94 No Bid
PART NUMBER ____ 3 $96.48
UNIT PRICE
284. JOHNSON #P45NCA-12 PROTECTOR,
LUBE, OIL (PENN CONT.) "ONLY" $105.55 FRENCAIEE No Bid
PART NUMBER $86.33
UNIT PRICE
285. DUAL PRESSURE CONTROL #P70MA- P70MA1C
1"ONLY" 96.35 No Bid
PART NUMBER ____ 3 $84.60
UNIT PRICE
286. T-STAT METAL GUARD #BTG-54VL .
PART NUMBER 190-065 $21.53 $11.64 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
287. SYNTHETIC COMPRESSOR OIL PP23B2104005
#SW220 No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $102.35/GAL

UNIT PRICE
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288. CARRIER PROCESSOR BOARD

#32GB500884 No Bid $1,160.93 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

289. 16 CU SPORLAN LIQUID SWEAT

DRYER #C163S No Bid $9.44 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

290. 16 CU SPORLAN LIQUID FLARE

DRYER #C163 No Bid $9.44 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

291. 16 CU SPORLAN SWEAT REV DRYER

#HPC163SHH No Bid $19.50 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

292. 16 CU SPORLAN FLARE REV DRYER

#HPC163HH No Bid $19.50 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

293. 16 CU SPROLAN LIQUID SWEAT

DRYER #C164S No Bid $18.32 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

294. 30 CU SPORLAN LIQUID SWEAT

DRYER #C304S No Bid $18.84 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

295. 30 CU SPORLAN LIQUID FLARE

DRYER #C304 No Bid $18.84 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

296. 16 CU SPORLAN SWEAT REV DRYER

#HPC164SHH No Bid $19.83 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE




TABULATION SHEET FOR:

) o
> > <
BID #SDOC 04-48 CJ $<8 o5 5
=1 (4p]
DATE/TIME: 6/23/04 @ 2:00 PM 5 E 2 £ g - 2 §
. . (@] = (0]
READ BY:Linda Giraldo 5 S 25 ¢ o4
e g - 2= 9 3~
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee Ss® ogE &S
§, = g _q:’ QG NS &
2L s S o2 =
<o Z naX =~0
297. 16 CU SPORLAN FLARE REV DRYER
#HPC164HH No Bid $19.83 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
298. 16 CU SPORLAN LIQUID SWEAT
DRYER #C165S No Bid $10.71 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
299. 16 CU SPORLAN SUCTION SWEAT
DRYER #C164STHH No Bid $15.52 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
300. 30 CU SPORLAN LIQUID SWEAT
DRYER #C305S No Bid $17.56 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
301. 16 CU SPORLAN LIQUID FLARE
DRYER #C165 No Bid $10.71 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
302. 30 CU SPORLAN LIQUID FLARE
DRYER #C305 No Bid $16.91 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
303. 16 CU SPORLAN SWEAT REV DRYER
#HPC165SHH No Bid $20.29 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
304. 16 CU SPORLAN FLARE REV DRYER
#HPC165HH No Bid $20.29 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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305. 16 CU SPORLAN SUCTION SWEAT
DRYER #C165STHH
PART NUMBER . .
UNITPRICE No Bid $15.52 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
306. 30 CU SPORLAN SUCTION SWEAT
DRYER #C305STHH No Bid $23.56 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
307. 16 CU SPORLAN SUCTION SWEAT
DRYER #C166STTH No Bid $16.63 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
308. 30 CU SPORLAN SUCTION SWEAT ——
DRYER #306STHH No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER ___ $24.79
UNIT PRICE
309. 16 CU SPROLAN LIQUID SWEAT
DRYER #C167S No Bid $17.97 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
310. 30 CU SPORLAN LIQUID SWEAT
DRYER #C4178 No Bid $23.97 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
311. 16 CU SPORLAN SUCTION SWEAT
DRYER #C167STHH No Bid $16.63 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
312. 30 CU SPORLAN SUCTION SWEAT
DRYER #C307STHH No Bid $24.79 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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313. 30 CU SPORLAN SUCTION SWEAT
DRYER #C309STHH No Bid C305STHH No Bid
PART NUMBER $23.56
UNIT PRICE
314. 30 CU SPORLAN SUCTION SWEAT
DRYER #C4311STHH No Bid $56.89 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
315. GLOBEMASTER 5/8" VALVE
PACKLESS BEARINGS #A-14842 "ONLY" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
316. GLOBEMASTER 7/8" VALVE
PACKLESS BEARINGS #A-15250 "ONLY" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
317. GLOBEMASTER 1 3/8" VALVE
PACKLESS BEARINGS #A-15252 "ONLY" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
318. SPORLAN 7/8" FILTER DRYER #C-967-
T"ONLY" No Bid $99.65 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
319. SPORLAN 1/8" FILTER DRYER #C-969-
T"ONLY" No Bid $116.72 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
320. SPORLAN 3/8" FILTER DRYER #C-
9611-T "ONLY" No Bid $116.36 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
321. 1/4" FLARE NUT . NS4-4 .
PART NUMBER No Bid o No Bid

UNIT PRICE
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322. 3/8" FLARE NUT _ NS4-6 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.33 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
323. 1/2" FLARE NUT _ NS4-8 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $.44 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
324. 5/8" FLARE NUT _ NS4-10 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.60 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
325. 1/4" COUPLINGS _ CcO14 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.34 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
326. 5/16" COUPLINGS _ CO516 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.36 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
327. 3/8" COUPLINGS _ CcO038 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.16 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
328. 1/2" COUPLINGS _ co12 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.20 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
329. 5/8" COUPLINGS _ CO58 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $.47 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
330. 7/8" COUPLINGS _ co78 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.31 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
331. 11/8" COUPLINGS _ co118 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.61 No Bid

UNIT PRICE
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332. 13/8" COUPLINGS _ CcO138 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $1.06 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
333. 15/8" COUPLINGS _ CO158 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.40 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
334. 21/8" COUPLINGS _ Cco218 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.31 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
335. 5/8" 45 DEGREE COPPER ELBOW _ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $0.37 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
336. 7/8" 45 DEGREE COPPER ELBOW . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $0.37 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
337. 11/8" 45 DEGREE COPPER ELBOW i i
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.56 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
338. 1 3/8" 45 DEGREE COPPER ELBOW i i
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.15 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
339. 1/4" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $2.24 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
340. 5/16" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $1.06 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
341. 3/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $0.93 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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342. 1/2" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $1.11 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
343. 5/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $0.98 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
344. 7/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $2.46 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
345. 1 1/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $1.96 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
346. 1 3/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $2.83 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
347. 15/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $2.79 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
348. 3/8" 90 DEGREE SHORT RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $0.58 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
349. 1/2" 90 DEGREE SHORT RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $0.58 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
350. 5/8" 90 DEGREE SHORT RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $0.60 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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351. 3/4" 90 DEGREE SHORT RADIUS

COPPER ELBOW No Bid $1.18 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

352. 7/8" 90 DEGREE SHORT RADIUS

COPPER ELBOW No Bid $1.05 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

353. 1 1/8" 90 DEGREE SHORT RADIUS

COPPER ELBOW No Bid $1.42 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

354. 1 3/8" 90 DEGREE SHORT RADIUS

COPPER ELBOW No Bid $3.74 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

355. 3/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS

COPPER STREET ELBOW No Bid $1.06 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

356. 1/2" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS

COPPER STREET ELBOW No Bid $1.99 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

357. 5/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS

COPPER STREET ELBOW No Bid $1.43 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

358. 3/4" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS

COPPER STREET ELBOW No Bid $1.68 No Bid

PART NUMBER

UNIT PRICE

359. 7/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS

COPPER STREET ELBOW No Bid $1.78 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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360. 1 1/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER STREET ELBOW No Bid $2.53 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
361. 1 3/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER STREET ELBOW No Bid $3.74 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
362. 5/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER STREET ELBOW No Bid $1.43 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
363. 1/8 X 1/4" UNION FLARE . U1-4A .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.58 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
364. 1/4 X 1/4" UNION . U-4B .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $.62 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
365. 2 1/8" 90 DEGREE LONG RADIUS
COPPER ELBOW No Bid $18.09 No Bid
PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
366. 3/4 X 5/8" COPPER REDUCER _ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $0.75 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
367. 3/8 X 1/4" COPPER REDUCER . .
PART NUMBER No Bid $0.92 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
368. 1/2 X 3/8" COPPER REDUCER _ .
PART NUMBER ____ No Bid $0.31 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
369. 7/8 X 3/4" COPPER REDUCER _ .
No Bid $0.53 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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370. 3/4 X 7/8" COPPER MALE ADAPTOR No Bid AD783 aMT No Bid
PART NUMBER $.71
UNIT PRICE
371. 1/8 X 7/8" COPPER REDUCER
PART NUMBER No Bid $0.98 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
372. 13/8" X 1 1/8" COPPER REDUCER
PART NUMBER No Bid $1.36 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
373. 1 5/8" X 1 3/8" COPPER REDUCER
PART NUMBER No Bid $2.26 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
374. 1/4" FL X 3/8" FL. COPPER UNION _ UR364 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $.92 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
375. 7/8" COPPER SWEAT FEMALE AD783 4FMIT
ADAPTOR No Bid No Bid
PART NUMBER $.71
UNIT PRICE
376. 3/4" COPPER COUPLING
PART NUMBER No Bid $0.44 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
377. STEVECO 90-230 DP2030A5004 .
PART NUMBER $18.08 $12.41 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
378. STEVECO 90-231 _ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $12.41 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
379. STEVECO 90-232
$29.92 $12.70 No Bid

PART NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
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380. STEVECO 90-290 20290Q .
PART NUMBER $8.38 No Bid
$4.94
UNIT PRICE
381. STEVECO 90-293 90293Q _
PART NUMBER $8.72 $5.17 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
382. STEVECO 90-340 _
UNIT PRICE
383. STEVECO 90-341 .
UNIT PRICE
384. STEVECO 90-380 _
UNIT PRICE
385. FURNAS #75D54822G "ONLY"
PART NUMBER No Bid $29.04 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
386. FURNAS #75D54772F "ONLY"
PART NUMBER No Bid $46.48 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
387. JOSLYN CLARK #DP2C302-24 _ 45FG20AG _
PART NUMBER No Bid No Bid
$5.55
UNIT PRICE
388. JOSLYN CLARK #DP2C302-120 _ 45FQ20AF _
PART NUMBER No Bid No Bid
$5.55
UNIT PRICE
389. JOSLYN CLARK #DP2C302-240 _ 452C20AG .
PART NUMBER No Bid $5.55 No Bid

UNIT PRICE
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390. JOSLYN CLARK #DP3C303-24 _ 42BF35A5 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $14.17 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
391. JOSLYN CLARK #DP3C303-120 _ 42BF35A5F .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $14.17 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
392. JOSLYN CLARK #DP3C303-240 _ 42BF35A5AG .
PART NUMBER No Bid $14.17 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
393. JOSLYN CLARK #DP3C403-24 _ 42CF35AJ .
PART NUMBER No Bid $15.55 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
394. 3 POLE 40 AMP 120 V CONTACTOR _ 42CF35AF .
PART NUMBER No Bid $15.55 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
395. JOSLYN CLARK #DP3C403-240 _ 42CF35AG .
PART NUMBER No Bid $15.55 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
396. FURNAS #42CE35AJ106 _ 42CF35AJ106 .
PART NUMBER _____ No Bid $23.87 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
397. 3 POLE 50 AMP 115 V CONTACTOR _ 42DF35AF .
PART NUMBER No Bid $39.37 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
398. FURNAS #42DE35AG106 _ 42DF35AG .
PART NUMBER No Bid $39.37 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
399. FURNAS #42GE35AG106 _ 43GE35AG106 .
PART NUMBER No Bid $141.24 No Bid

UNIT PRICE
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400. HONEYWELL #R4220R1014 .
PART NUMBER $70.59 $52.45 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
401. JOSLYN CLARK #DP5C603-240 _ 42EF35AG .
PART NUMBER No Bid 4517 No Bid
UNIT PRICE
402. HONEYWELL CONTACTOR #R4236B-
1052 PART No Bid $106.84 No Bid
NUMBER
UNIT PRICE
PART 2
403. BALANCE OF PRODUCT LINE . . .
DISCOUNT - DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE No Bid £ 60%
O/O
404. DAILY DELIVERY OR AS NEEDED No Bid YES YES
AVAILABLE? YES OR NO
405. BEST POSSIBLE DELIVERY AFTER .
RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER. No Bid £ DR 1 DAY
DAYS
406. FIVE (5) LETTERS FROM
MANUFACTURERS STATING THAT _
YOU'RE AN AUTHORIZED DISTRIBUTOR No Bid YES YES
INCLUDED W ITH BID RESPONSE?
YES OR NO
407. LIST OF MANUFACTURERS THAT No Bid - VES

YOU ARE AN AUTHORIZED DISTRIBUTOR
FOR INCLUDED WITH BID RESPONSE?
YES OR NO




