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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
PRICE SHEET
1. Discount off current catalog including
Shipping & Handling ________ 10.00% 10.00% VARIES BY MFG. 0.00% 0.00% 52% A & B       

30% C 11.00%

2. Catalog Name and Number 
___________________ 2006 APPLIED 

MAINTENANCE 
AMERICA        

2006 FLUID 
POWER 

CONNECTION 
APPLIED 

ARMCHEM 
SAFETY 

CATALOG AND 
ARMCHEM 

GENERAL LINE 
CATALOG

CATALOG 397 
CALL FOR DISC.  

OR USE 
WW.GRAINGER.

COM PRICES 
REFLECT 

DISCOUNTED 
PRICES

NO CATALOG NO CATALOG 2005 - 2006 2006 - 2007

3. Minimum Order Amount (if 
applicable) ________ N/A $50.00 N/A 0.00 0.00 NO MINIMUM $25.00

4. Quote or Contract Number (if 
applicable) ________ N/A N/A N/A - SDOC 07-024 CJ QUOTE #4024696

5. Name, Address and phone number of 
local representative: 
__________________________               
__________________________                
__________________________                 
__________________________

ANGEL M. 
BENITEZ         

3601 VINELAND 
RD. STE., 10      

ORL., FL 32811    
407-422-2115     

FAX 407-422-2270

STEVE NELSON  
2978 

LYNDSCOPE ST. 
ORL., FL 32811   
1-800-886-0423   

EXT. 254        
FAX 954-735-0097

KEVIN BOOTH    
4180 L.B. 

MCLEOD RD     
ORL., FL 32811   
407-468-9595     
407-843-3220     

FAX 407-422-2233

407-935-9600     
FAX 407-943-2004

407-498-3262     
FAX 407-498-3261 

ATTN: JERRY 
JESSIE

DONALD 
RYBURN        

863-660-3131     
FAX 800-437-7952

KAREN KELLY    
8249 PARKLINE 
BLVD., STE. 300  

ORL., FL         
407-851-8089     

FAX 407-855-3676

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-024-CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/20/06@2:00PM                
INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES & 
EQUIPMENT                        
READ BY:LAURA ELAM_
RECORDED BY:CHERYL JESSEE
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-024-CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/20/06@2:00PM                
INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES & 
EQUIPMENT                        
READ BY:LAURA ELAM_
RECORDED BY:CHERYL JESSEE

6. Exclusion if any (how to identify them 
in catalog) ______________           
____________________________            
____________________________             
____________________________

N/A

FIRM DISCOUNT 
IS APPLIED TO 

ONLINE 
ELECTRONIC 
CATALOG AT 

WWW.GRAINGE
R.COM LOGIN IN 
FOR OSCEOLA 

COUNTY 
SCHOOLS

0 DISCOUNT 
STORE PRICING 

IS ALREADY 
DISCOUNTED

0 DISCOUNT 
STORE PRICING 

IS ALREADY 
DISCOUNTED

NONE

7. Catalog or Disk/ CD ROM Prices 
submitted with bid                               
______Yes ______No NO YES

AVAILABLE 
THRU 

WWW.GRAINGE
R .COM

NO CATALOG 
AVAILABLE

NO CATALOG 
AVAILABLE YES YES

8. Sample Price Sheet Completed            
______Yes ______No YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-024-CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/20/06@2:00PM                
INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES & 
EQUIPMENT                        
READ BY:LAURA ELAM_
RECORDED BY:CHERYL JESSEE

Sample Price List
1. DEWALT cordless 14 Volt Complete 
Kit w/ keyless chuck 3/8" Or Equal:         
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

299              
$N/A             

9-11545          
$106.00

1287            
$314.00         
4GA76          
$160.14

#349-103        
$169.00

#349-103        
$169.00

241             
$239.95         

#MPTL144DD    
$155.97

2396            
$202.92         

#93100733       
$169.00

2. MILWAUKEE Electric Circular Saw 7 
1/4" Or Equal:"                                      
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______ 

304              
$N/A             

9-28060          
$119.00

1330            
$275.00         
4WP31          
$137.50

#482-299        
$99.00

#482-299        
$129.00 N/A

2424            
$154.52         

#40000556       
#137.52

3. DEWALT- Orbital Palm Sander 5" Dia.
#DW 420 Or Equal:                                    
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______ 

303              
$N/A             

9-27989          
$62.10

1347            
$124.00         
4ZA17           
$63.24

#786-845        
$69.97

#786-845        
$69.97

214             
$199.95         

#MT1460        
$139.96

2431            
$79.80          

#06335376       
$71.02

4. Continuous frame Loop Handle Hand 
Truck min. 500 lb capacity Or Equal:       
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

PRICE ON 
REQUEST

2411            
$97.50          
3W089          
$87.75

#780-706        
$49.00

#464-768        
$39.90 N/A

3230            
$62.04          

#89743462       
$55.22

5. Commercial Platform Truck min. 750 
lb. Capacity, welded steel 24"W x 42"L 
deck or Equal:                                            
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

PRICE ON 
REQUEST

204             
$504.30         

RCP440-GRA     
$453.87         

24" X 36" 1000 LB.

2407            
$159.00         
3BX77          

$143.10

#717-676        
$143.66         
24" X 36"

N/A

3227            
$159.44         

#05821624       
$141.90
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-024-CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/20/06@2:00PM                
INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES & 
EQUIPMENT                        
READ BY:LAURA ELAM_
RECORDED BY:CHERYL JESSEE

6. SPEEDAIRE Air Compressor portable
5 HP w/ 20 Gallon Tank Oil Lubed Or 
Equal:                                                          
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

329              
$N/A             

9-15726          
$695.00          

1456            
$278.25         
1VW38          
$250.43

#250-012        
$749.00

#158-936        
$259.00        

HORIZONTIAL 
OR VERTICAL 
5HP 26 GAL.

N/A

3892            
$590.90         

3 HP            
#73210247       

$525.90

7. E-A-R Plugs with cords (2000 pr/case)
Or Equal:                                                    
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

100              
$N/A             

311-1252         
$.17 EA.

26              
$648.00         

311-1101        
$583.20         

(10 BOXES OF 
200 PR.)

2549            
$58.95          
5T277           
$53.06

#104-382        
$4.96 PER 3 PK

RED-E-FIT       
#717-665        

$36.29/ CS.      
100 PER CASE

AVAILABLE IN 
INDIVIDUAL 

QTYS           
513             

$3.75 EA.        
#QB100         

$2.62 EA.

2729            
$116.90 PER 500  

#07418114       
$104.04 PER 500

8. Disposable Dust Mask- General 
Industrial                                                   
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

102              
$N/A             

14110094CC      
$.13 EA.

40              
$8.82           
1501            
$7.94

2558            
$7.93           
4VT68           
$7.14

#692-573        
$9.98 PER 50 PK

#692-573        
$9.98 PER 50 PK N/A

2747            
$7.41 PER 50 PK  

#06528673       
$6.59 PER 50 PK

9. Back support Belt w/ suspender 
straps Large 36" to 47"                            
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

PRICE ON 
REQUEST

60              
$15.08          
625-L           
$13.57

2651            
$11.53          
1EC64          
$10.38

#717-516        
$11.67

MCGUIRE 
NICHOLAS       
#717-516        

$11.67          
32" - 46"

N/A

2818            
$9.94           

#88506902       
$8.85

10. UL Approved Gas Can 5 Gallon, 
Double Seamed Bottom detachable 
flexible pour spout 7"                                
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

119              
$N/A             
10801            
$34.91

93              
$109.20         
10821           
$98.28

2493            
$82.45          
2W683          
$74.21

#686-363        
$34.00

SAFETY 5 GAL 
W/FUNNEL       
#686-363        

$34.00

N/A

2962            
$79.16          

#89822993       
$70.45
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-024-CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/20/06@2:00PM                
INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES & 
EQUIPMENT                        
READ BY:LAURA ELAM_
RECORDED BY:CHERYL JESSEE

11. Heavy Duty Fiberglass 6' Step 
Ladder Min. 375 lb. Capacity                    
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

476              
$N/A             

FS1406HD        
$122.20

DAVIDSON       
261             

$128.24         
D2212-065       

$115.42

2045            
$170.25         
4XN72          
$153.23

#118-974        
$89.00

LOUIVILLE 
LADDER         
#118-974        

$89.00

N/A

3327            
$167.40         

#87754768       
$148.99



Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form
PRICE SHEET
1. Discount off current catalog including
Shipping & Handling ________
2. Catalog Name and Number 
___________________

3. Minimum Order Amount (if 
applicable) ________
4. Quote or Contract Number (if 
applicable) ________
5. Name, Address and phone number of 
local representative: 
__________________________               
__________________________                
__________________________                 
__________________________
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BID# SDOC-07-024-CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
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YES YES YES
YES YES YES

3.00% VARIES

PAXTON 
PATTERSON 

TOOLS & 
TECHNOLOGY

SUMMER 2006

PRICE SHEET 
AND SAMPLE 
PRICE ARE 

BLANK AND NO 
CATALOG

N/A $25.00

C717538

BOB LERCZAK   
PAXTON/        

PATTERSON     
5719 W. 65TH ST. 

CHICAGO, IL     
1-800-323-8484   

FAX 708-594-1907

SEE BID SEE BID
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6. Exclusion if any (how to identify them 
in catalog) ______________           
____________________________            
____________________________             
____________________________

7. Catalog or Disk/ CD ROM Prices 
submitted with bid                               
______Yes ______No

8. Sample Price Sheet Completed            
______Yes ______No
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SHIPPING IS 
FREE ON 
ORDERS 

EXCEEDING 
$100.00 ORDERS 
UNDER $100.00 

MUST HAVE 
SHIPPING 

ADDED    
DELIVERIES 

REQUIRING LIFT 
GATE REQUIRES 

FREIGHT 
CHARGES

YES YES

YES YES
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Sample Price List
1. DEWALT cordless 14 Volt Complete 
Kit w/ keyless chuck 3/8" Or Equal:         
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

2. MILWAUKEE Electric Circular Saw 7 
1/4" Or Equal:"                                      
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______ 
3. DEWALT- Orbital Palm Sander 5" Dia.
#DW 420 Or Equal:                                    
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______ 
4. Continuous frame Loop Handle Hand 
Truck min. 500 lb capacity Or Equal:       
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

5. Commercial Platform Truck min. 750 
lb. Capacity, welded steel 24"W x 42"L 
deck or Equal:                                            
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______
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BOSCH 32614-
2G109774       

259             
$260.00         
#109774         
$252.20

NOT AVAILABLE

BOSCH CS10     
238             

$210.00         
#162516         
$203.70

NOT AVAILABLE

DEWALT 
#DZ6451K       

251             
$115.00         
#185064         
$111.55

NOT AVAILABLE

AKRO MILLS 
#R4110SP       

121             
$150.00         
#250918         
$102.69       

NOT AVAILABLE

NO BID NOT AVAILABLE
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6. SPEEDAIRE Air Compressor portable
5 HP w/ 20 Gallon Tank Oil Lubed Or 
Equal:                                                          
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______
7. E-A-R Plugs with cords (2000 pr/case)
Or Equal:                                                    
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______

8. Disposable Dust Mask- General 
Industrial                                                   
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______
9. Back support Belt w/ suspender 
straps Large 36" to 47"                            
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______
10. UL Approved Gas Can 5 Gallon, 
Double Seamed Bottom detachable 
flexible pour spout 7"                                
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______
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CAMPBELL-
HAUSFELD      

WL6502         
473             

$430.00         
#210410         
$356.45

NOT AVAILABLE

NORTH #28-02-50 
100             

$.60/PAIR        
#342588         

$.58 / PAIR

NOT AVAILABLE

BOX OF 50       
101             

$8.95           
#340094         

$8.68

NOT AVAILABLE

NO BID NOT AVAILABLE

NO BID NOT AVAILABLE
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11. Heavy Duty Fiberglass 6' Step 
Ladder Min. 375 lb. Capacity                    
Page #________                                         
List Price $________                                 
Part #________                                           
District Price $_______
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NO BID NOT AVAILABLE


