
PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

Ite
m Description Estim

ated 
Unit 
of 

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

LOT 1

1
 4' High Fencing #9 
gauge fabric, 2" mesh 
(50' rolls)                       

2 rolls 150.00  $       300.00 129.95  $        259.90 LOT 1 - 
NO BID

LOT 1 - NO 
BID 173.20  $       346.40  $140.68  $       281.36 

2
5' High Fencing #9 
gauge fabric, 2" mesh 
(50' rolls)                       

1 roll 200.00  $       200.00 162.15  $        162.15  $               -   216.00  $       216.00 175.70  $       175.70 

3
6' High Fencing #9 
gauge fabric, 2" mesh 
(50' rolls)                       

60 rolls 216.00  $  12,960.00 194.93  $   11,695.80  $               -   258.75  $  15,525.00 211.31  $  12,678.60 

4
7' High Fencing #9 
gauge fabric, 2" mesh 
(50' rolls)                       

1 roll 260.00  $       260.00 227.13  $        227.13  $               -   302.25  $       302.25 246.33  $       246.33 

5
8' High Fencing #9 
gauge fabric, 2" mesh 
(50' rolls)                       

1 roll 300.00  $       300.00 259.33  $        259.33  $               -   345.75  $       345.75 281.35  $       281.35 

6
4' High, Vinyl fencing, 
#9 gauge fabric, 2" 
mesh (50' rolls)              

1 roll 200.00  $       200.00 235.75  $        235.75  $               -   345.75  $       345.75 207.09  $       207.09 

NO YES

Hold Harmless
One original, One copy & 1 CD
Proof of 5 Years in Business 

N/A
YES

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

YES
YES
YES
YES
YES

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

YES
YES
YES
YES

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

YES
YES
YES
YES

YES

YES
YES
YES

YES

N/A

YES
YES
N/A
YES
YES YES

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES

YES

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

YES
YES
YES
YES

YES

YES
YES
YES
YES

YES

YES
YES
N/A
YES
YES

Licenses

YES
YES
YES
YES
YES

YES
YES
YESProof of Insurance

YES
YES

Invitation to Bid Cover Sheet
Completed Bid Submittal Form
Drug Free Certification
Debarment Certification
Emergency/Storm Agreement
Conflict of Interest
References

Addendum #1 YES YES YES
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

7
6' High, Vinyl fencing, 
#9 gauge fabric, 2" 
mesh (50' rolls)              

1 roll 300.00  $       300.00 347.88  $        347.88  $               -   463.50  $       463.50 310.33  $       310.33 

8
1 5/8" Top Rail, Steel 
Pipe, 21 ft.                     100 each 46.00  $    4,600.00 43.95  $     4,395.00  $               -   58.59  $    5,859.00 46.05  $    4,605.00 

9 1 5/8" Vinyl, SS40 
Pipe, Top Rail, 21 ft.     200 each 63.00  $  12,600.00 58.68  $   11,736.00  $               -   83.47  $  16,694.00 61.36  $  12,272.00 

10 2" Line Post, Steel 
Pipe, 9 ft.                       

60 each 25.00  $    1,500.00 23.48  $     1,408.80  $               -   29.34  $    1,760.40 23.65  $    1,419.00 

11
2 1/2" Line Post, Steel 
Pipe, 9 ft.                       10 each 35.00  $       350.00 30.26  $        302.60  $               -   39.50  $       395.00 31.73  $       317.30 

12
2" O.D. Vinyl, SS-40 
Pipe, 10 ft.                     10 each 36.00  $       360.00 34.55  $        345.50  $               -   42.00  $       420.00 36.23  $       362.30 

13 2 1/2" O.D. Vinyl, SS-
40 Pipe, 9 ft.                  

10 each 44.00  $       440.00 41.09  $        410.90  $               -   56.35  $       563.50 43.14  $       431.40 

14 2 1/2" O.D. Vinyl, SS-
40 Pipe, 10 ft.                

10 each 48.00  $       480.00 45.66  $        456.60  $               -   61.50  $       615.00 71.13  $       711.30 

15 3" Steel Pipe 9 ft.          20 each 51.00  $    1,020.00 47.98  $        959.60  $               -   62.55  $    1,251.00 50.32  $    1,006.40 

16 4" Steel Pipe 9 ft.          10 each 80.00  $       800.00 75.43  $        754.30  $               -   98.37  $       983.70 79.22  $       792.20 

17 3" Steel Pipe 9 ft., 
Vinyl, 9 ft.                      

1 each 65.00  $         65.00 60.93  $          60.93  $               -   82.36  $         82.36 64.01  $         64.01 

18 4" Steel Pipe 9 ft., 
Vinyl, 9 ft.                      10 each 115.00  $    1,150.00 98.80  $        988.00  $               -   133.50  $    1,335.00 103.78  $    1,037.80 

19 6' Tension Bars             300 each 2.00  $       600.00 2.10  $        630.00  $               -   3.58  $    1,074.00 3.10  $       930.00 

20 10' Tension Bars           10 each 3.65  $         36.50 4.53  $          45.30  $               -   6.04  $         60.40 6.16  $         61.60 

21 2 1/2" Tension Bands, 
w/nuts and bolts            

1,000 each 0.35  $       350.00 0.39  $        390.00  $               -   0.51  $       510.00 0.56  $       560.00 

22 3" Tension Bands, 
w/nuts and bolts            250 each 0.45  $       112.50 0.51  $        127.50  $               -   0.70  $       175.00 0.51  $       127.50 
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

23
4" Tension Bands, 
w/nuts and bolts            10 each 0.70  $           7.00 0.70  $            7.00  $               -   0.92  $           9.20 0.70  $           7.00 

24
3" Tension Bands, 
w/nuts and bolts            10 each 0.45  $           4.50 0.51  $            5.10  $               -   0.51  $           5.10 0.51  $           5.10 

25
2" Brace Bands, w/nuts 
and bolts                       10 each 0.40  $           4.00 0.41  $            4.10  $               -   0.43  $           4.30 0.41  $           4.10 

26
2 1/2" Brace Bands, 
w/nuts and bolts            50 each 0.45  $         22.50 0.45  $          22.50  $               -   0.58  $         29.00 0.50  $         25.00 

27
3" Brace Bands, w/nuts 
and bolts                       10 each 0.50  $           5.00 0.58  $            5.80  $               -   0.62  $           6.20 0.61  $           6.10 

28
4" Brace Bands, w/nuts 
and bolts                       10 each 0.75  $           7.50 0.77  $            7.70  $               -   0.92  $           9.20 0.82  $           8.20 

29
2 1/2" Brace Bands, 
w/nuts and bolts            10 each 0.45  $           4.50 0.45  $            4.50  $               -   0.58  $           5.80 0.50  $           5.00 

30
2" x 1 5/8" P/S Loop 
Cap                               2 each 1.00  $           2.00 1.18  $            2.36  $               -   1.57  $           3.14 1.12  $           2.24 

31
2 1/2" x 1 5/8"  Loop 
Cap, Vinyl                      2 each 2.50  $           5.00 3.04  $            6.08  $               -   2.90  $           5.80 2.25  $           4.50 

32 1 5/8" Sleeves               2 each 1.00  $           2.00 0.95  $            1.90  $               -   1.26  $           2.52 0.82  $           1.64 

33
1 5/8" Rail-ends, Galv., 
Combination Semi-
Steel                              

50 each 0.80  $         40.00 0.90  $          45.00  $               -   1.41  $         70.50 0.70  $         35.00 

34
2" Dome Cap, Galv., 
Semi-Steel                    2 each 0.60  $           1.20 0.89  $            1.78  $               -   1.22  $           2.44 1.04  $           2.08 

35
2 1/2" Dome Cap, 
Galv., Semi-Steel          15 each 0.65  $           9.75 1.29  $          19.35  $               -   1.40  $         21.00 1.43  $         21.45 

36
4" Dome Cap, Galv., 
Semi-Steel                    15 each 1.50  $         22.50 3.00  $          45.00  $               -   3.10  $         46.50 2.87  $         43.05 

37
3" Dome Cap, Galv., 
Semi-Steel, Vinyl           10 each 1.50  $         15.00 1.51  $          15.10  $               -   2.90  $         29.00 1.64  $         16.40 

Page 3 of 14



PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

38
1 5/8" Aluminum Dome 
Cap                               5 each 0.45  $           2.25 0.47  $            2.35  $               -   0.95  $           4.75 0.46  $           2.30 

39
2 1/2" Aluminum Dome 
Cap                               5 each 0.70  $           3.50 0.72  $            3.60  $               -   0.97  $           4.85 0.73  $           3.65 

40
3" Aluminum Dome 
Cap                               1 each 0.90  $           0.90 0.99  $            0.99  $               -   1.80  $           1.80 0.96  $           0.96 

41
2 1/2" Bulldog Hinges    

30 each 6.50  $       195.00 7.33  $        219.90  $               -   10.25  $       307.50 8.98  $       269.40 

42
3" Bulldog Hinges          

15 each 7.00  $       105.00 7.61  $        114.15  $               -   10.90  $       163.50 9.56  $       143.40 

43 4" Bulldog Hinges          10 each 8.00  $         80.00 8.96  $          89.60  $               -   12.50  $       125.00 10.01  $       100.10 

44 2" x 7' Terminal Post     1 each 20.00  $         20.00 17.50  $          17.50  $               -   28.50  $         28.50 18.43  $         18.43 

45
3" x 9' Terminal Post     

1 each 51.00  $         51.00 47.98  $          47.98  $               -   65.50  $         65.50 50.32  $         50.32 

46 Truss Rod, 11'               1 each 5.00  $           5.00 5.58  $            5.58  $               -   7.50  $           7.50 6.85  $           6.85 

47 Tightener for Truss 
Rod                               1 each 2.00  $           2.00 0.77  $            0.77  $               -   1.02  $           1.02 1.37  $           1.37 

48 Tension Wire, 7 gauge  1 roll 100.00  $       100.00 122.69  $        122.69  $               -   157.50  $       157.50 73.50  $         73.50 

49

GRAND TOTAL "ALL 
OR NONE" LOT 1 
(Add ext. price for 
items #1 thru 
#48=#49)

$  $  39,701.10 
MATH ERROR 

ITEM #21 
CORRECTED 

TOTAL

 $   37,017.35 NO BID  $  50,440.13 
MATH ERROR 

ITEM #4 
CORRECTED 

TOTAL

 $  39,735.71 

50

Best Possible 
Delivery after receipt 
of Purchase Order? Days 2 DAYS NO BID 3 DAYS2 DAYS5 DAYS
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

51
Minimum Order 
Dollar Amount, if 
required?

$

52

Percentage of the 
Districts cost of the 
product that is 
attributed to your fuel 
costs

%

53

Percentage of the 
District's cost of the 
product that is 
associated to the 
costs of the 
commodity 

%

54

Balance of Product 
Line: Discount off 
Manufactures List 
(For the purchase of 
materials only)    

%

LOT 2

55
4' high Galvanized 
chain link fencing          40 linear 

ft 11.16  $       446.40 9.00  $        360.00 12.00  $       480.00 14.00  $       560.00 10.23  $       409.20 

56
4' high Galvanized 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

2 each 80.00  $       160.00 81.00  $        162.00 150.00  $       300.00 60.00  $       120.00 71.34  $       142.68 

57

4' high Galvanized x 4' 
wide single swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

2 each 225.00  $       450.00 210.00  $        420.00 400.00  $       800.00 200.00  $       400.00 228.40  $       456.80 

N/A

10%

95%

10%

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

200.00

15%

100%

10%

100.00

0.01%

100%

20%

100.00

3%

85%

20%
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

58

4' high Galvanized x 10'
wide single swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

1 each 404.00  $       404.00 350.00  $        350.00 630.00  $       630.00 500.00  $       500.00 436.26  $       436.26 

59

4' high Galvanized x 20'
wide single swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

1 each 690.50  $       690.50 495.00  $        495.00 860.00  $       860.00 650.00  $       650.00 601.68  $       601.68 

60

4' high Galvanized x 28'
wide single swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

1 each 969.50  $       969.50 550.00  $        550.00 1300.00  $    1,300.00 910.00  $       910.00 1067.36  $    1,067.36 

61

4' high Galvanized x 20'
wide roll gate including 
gate post, track post, 
with braces                    

1 each 920.00  $       920.00 595.00  $        595.00 935.00  $       935.00 720.00  $       720.00 896.32  $       896.32 

62

4' high Galvanized x 20'
wide cantilever gate 
including gate post, tail 
support post, latch post 
with braces                    

1 each 1357.00  $    1,357.00 980.00  $        980.00 1900.00  $    1,900.00 840.00  $       840.00 1674.40  $    1,674.40 

63 4' high Vinyl Coated 
chain link fencing          700 linear 

ft 13.83  $    9,681.00 10.58  $     7,406.00 13.25  $    9,275.00 18.96  $  13,272.00 13.70  $    9,590.00 

64
4' high Vinyl Coated 
corner post assembly 10 each 101.00  $    1,010.00 76.77  $        767.70 169.00  $    1,690.00 75.00  $       750.00 100.04  $    1,000.40 

65

4' high Vinyl Coated x 
4' wide single swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

2 each 290.00  $       580.00 300.00  $        600.00 445.00  $       890.00 240.00  $       480.00 347.30  $       694.60 

66

4' high Vinyl Coated x 
10' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

1 each 542.00  $       542.00 450.00  $        450.00 700.00  $       700.00 600.00  $       600.00 598.04  $       598.04 
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

67

4' high Vinyl Coated x 
20' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

1 each 892.00  $       892.00 542.00  $        542.00 935.00  $       935.00 780.00  $       780.00 886.13  $       886.13 

68

4' high Vinyl Coated x 
28' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

1 each 1354.70  $    1,354.70 627.00  $        627.00 1390.00  $    1,390.00 990.00  $       990.00 1600.27  $    1,600.27 

69

4' high Vinyl Coated x 
20' wide roll gate 
including gate post, 
track post, with braces  

1 each 975.60  $       975.60 850.00  $        850.00 1175.00  $    1,175.00 864.00  $       864.00 1134.23  $    1,134.23 

70

4' high Vinyl Coated x 
20' wide cantilever gate 
including gate post, tail 
support post, latch post 
with braces                    

1 each 1466.00  $    1,466.00 1400.00  $     1,400.00 1740.00  $    1,740.00 990.00  $       990.00 1999.13  $    1,999.13 

71
6' high Galvanized 
chain link fencing          12,000 linear 

ft 13.55  $162,600.00 11.27  $ 135,240.00 14.40  $172,800.00 14.50  $174,000.00 13.47  $161,640.00 

72
6' high Galvanized 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

100 each 175.00  $  17,500.00 110.00  $   11,000.00 265.00  $  26,500.00 80.00  $    8,000.00 181.49  $  18,149.00 

73

6' high Galvanized x 4' 
wide single swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

20 each 361.50  $    7,230.00 350.00  $     7,000.00 545.00  $  10,900.00 220.00  $    4,400.00 471.45  $    9,429.00 

74

6' high Galvanized x 10'
wide double swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

5 each 645.75  $    3,228.75 520.00  $     2,600.00 810.00  $    4,050.00 575.00  $    2,875.00 769.73  $    3,848.65 
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

75

6' high Galvanized x 20'
wide double swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

5 each 1021.50  $    5,107.50 695.00  $     3,475.00 1200.00  $    6,000.00 690.00  $    3,450.00 1014.73  $    5,073.65 

76

6' high Galvanized x 28'
wide double swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

5 each 1487.50  $    7,437.50 990.00  $     4,950.00 1550.00  $    7,750.00 1050.00  $    5,250.00 1632.03  $    8,160.15 

77

6' high Galvanized x 20'
wide roll gate including 
gate post, safety post, 
track post, with braces  

1 each 1210.00  $    1,210.00 800.00  $        800.00 1160.00  $    1,160.00 820.00  $       820.00 1355.24  $    1,355.24 

78

6' high Galvanized x 20'
wide cantilever gate 
including gate post, tail 
support post, latch post 
with braces                    

5 each 1557.50  $    7,787.50 1400.00  $     7,000.00 1940.00  $    9,700.00 940.00  $    4,700.00 2169.12  $  10,845.60 

79
6' high Vinyl Coated 
chain link fencing          3,500 linear 

ft 17.06  $  59,710.00 13.50  $   47,250.00 17.60  $  61,600.00 19.25  $  67,375.00 17.86  $  62,510.00 

80
6' high Vinyl Coated 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

50 each 240.00  $  12,000.00 154.00  $     7,700.00 300.00  $  15,000.00 90.00  $    4,500.00 259.69  $  12,984.50 

81

6' high Vinyl Coated x 
4' wide single swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

4 each 483.50  $    1,934.00 490.00  $     1,960.00 630.00  $    2,520.00 250.00  $    1,000.00 609.32  $    2,437.28 

82

6' high Vinyl Coated x 
10' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

5 each 864.75  $    4,323.75 725.00  $     3,625.00 935.00  $    4,675.00 675.00  $    3,375.00 1485.79  $    7,428.95 
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

83

6' high Vinyl Coated x 
20' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

2 each 1349.00  $    2,698.00 973.00  $     1,946.00 1303.00  $    2,606.00 815.00  $    1,630.00 1249.24  $    2,498.48 

84

6' high Vinyl Coated x 
28' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

2 each 2084.00  $    4,168.00 1116.00  $     2,232.00 2295.00  $    4,590.00 1100.00  $    2,200.00 2203.33  $    4,406.66 

85

6' high Vinyl Coated x 
20' wide roll gate 
including gate post, 
track post, with braces  

1 each 1444.00  $    1,444.00 1120.00  $     1,120.00 1275.00  $    1,275.00 920.00  $       920.00 1524.49  $    1,524.49 

86

6' high Vinyl Coated x 
20' wide cantilever gate 
including gate post, tail 
support post, latch post 
with braces                    

2 each 1886.75  $    3,773.50 1600.00  $     3,200.00 2180.00  $    4,360.00 1140.00  $    2,280.00 2336.79  $    4,673.58 

87
8' high Galvanized 
chain link fencing          10 linear 

ft 17.26  $       172.60 13.75  $        137.50 20.30  $       203.00 16.50  $       165.00 17.15  $       171.50 

88
8' high Galvanized 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

2 each 199.00  $       398.00 150.00  $        300.00 280.00  $       560.00 95.00  $       190.00 197.66  $       395.32 

89

8' high Galvanized x 4' 
wide single swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

1 each 421.00  $       421.00 400.00  $        400.00 586.00  $       586.00 260.00  $       260.00 478.97  $       478.97 

90

8' high Galvanized x 10'
wide double swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

1 each 737.00  $       737.00 595.00  $        595.00 862.00  $       862.00 600.00  $       600.00 796.63  $       796.63 
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

91

8' high Galvanized x 20'
wide double swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

1 each 1072.00  $    1,072.00 800.00  $        800.00 1280.00  $    1,280.00 750.00  $       750.00 1016.78  $    1,016.78 

92
8' high Vinyl Coated 
chain link fencing          10 linear 

ft 21.75  $       217.50 17.50  $        175.00 24.45  $       244.50 24.00  $       240.00 22.34  $       223.40 

93
8' high Vinyl Coated 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

1 each 268.50  $       268.50 210.00  $        210.00 350.00  $       350.00 125.00  $       125.00 277.51  $       277.51 

94

8' high Vinyl Coated x 
4' wide single swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

1 each 555.25  $       555.25 535.00  $        535.00 722.00  $       722.00 225.00  $       225.00 724.43  $       724.43 

95

8' high Vinyl Coated x 
10' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

1 each 988.00  $       988.00 775.00  $        775.00 1080.00  $    1,080.00 650.00  $       650.00 1086.02  $    1,086.02 

96

8' high Vinyl Coated x 
20' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

1 each 1419.00  $    1,419.00 1120.00  $     1,120.00 1465.00  $    1,465.00 850.00  $       850.00 1403.95  $    1,403.95 

97 10' high Galvanized 
chain link fencing          10 linear 

ft 20.70  $       207.00 15.70  $        157.00 23.00  $       230.00 22.81  $       228.10 20.62  $       206.20 

98
10' high Galvanized 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

1 each 246.75  $       246.75 175.00  $        175.00 300.00  $       300.00 125.00  $       125.00 212.10  $       212.10 

99

8' high Galvanized x 4' 
wide single swing gate 
including gate post with 
braces                           

1 each 421.00  $       421.00 400.00  $        400.00 650.00  $       650.00 300.00  $       300.00 591.95  $       591.95 

100

10' high Galvanized x 
10' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

1 each 826.00  $       826.00 735.00  $        735.00 990.00  $       990.00 700.00  $       700.00 879.83  $       879.83 
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

101 10' high Vinyl Coated 
chain link fencing          

100 linear 
ft

25.44  $    2,544.00 19.50  $     1,950.00 27.55  $    2,755.00 34.00  $    3,400.00 26.83  $    2,683.00 

102
10' high Vinyl Coated 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

10 each 274.85  $    2,748.50 220.00  $     2,200.00 375.00  $    3,750.00 135.00  $    1,350.00 296.34  $    2,963.40 

103

10' high Vinyl Coated x 
4' wide single swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

1 each 595.20  $       595.20 616.00  $        616.00 785.00  $       785.00 320.00  $       320.00 798.32  $       798.32 

104

10' high Vinyl Coated x 
10' wide double swing 
gate including gate post
with braces                    

1 each 1059.00  $    1,059.00 875.00  $        875.00 1190.00  $    1,190.00 740.00  $       740.00 1205.29  $    1,205.29 

105
12' high Galvanized 
chain link fencing with 1
3/4" mesh                      

10 linear 
ft 36.77  $       367.70 24.00  $        240.00 36.15  $       361.50 32.50  $       325.00 36.90  $       369.00 

106
12' high Galvanized 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

1 each 197.20  $       197.20 220.00  $        220.00 365.00  $       365.00 155.00  $       155.00 178.33  $       178.33 

107

12' high Galvanized x 4'
wide single swing gate 
with 1 3/4" mesh  
including gate post with 
b

1 each 476.75  $       476.75 400.00  $        400.00 740.00  $       740.00 375.00  $       375.00 642.13  $       642.13 

108
12' high Vinyl coated 
chain link fencing with 1
3/4" mesh                      

10 linear 
ft 43.67  $       436.70 26.00  $        260.00 38.50  $       385.00 42.50  $       425.00 48.24  $       482.40 

109
12' high Vinyl coated 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

1 each 244.15  $       244.15 150.00  $        150.00 367.00  $       367.00 180.00  $       180.00 228.79  $       228.79 

110

12' high Vinyl Coated x 
4' wide single swing 
gate with 1 3/4" mesh  
including gate post with 
braces                           

1 each 600.00  $       600.00 440.00  $        440.00 790.00  $       790.00 390.00  $       390.00 790.45  $       790.45 
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

111
16' high Galvanized 
chain link fencing          1 each 45.02  $         45.02 27.50  $          27.50 62.15  $         62.15 60.00  $         60.00 44.66  $         44.66 

112
16' high Galvanized 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

1 each 325.50  $       325.50 225.00  $        225.00 470.00  $       470.00 225.00  $       225.00 323.87  $       323.87 

113

16' high Galvanized x 4'
wide single swing gate  
including gate post with 
braces                           

1 each 823.00  $       823.00 625.00  $        625.00 1035.00  $    1,035.00 400.00  $       400.00 885.06  $       885.06 

114 16' high Vinyl Coated 
chain link fencing          10 linear 

ft 55.07  $       550.70 35.00  $        350.00 60.15  $       601.50 80.00  $       800.00 56.23  $       562.30 

115
16' high Vinyl Coated 
corner post assembly 
with braces                    

1 each 438.70  $       438.70 325.00  $        325.00 545.00  $       545.00 250.00  $       250.00 435.11  $       435.11 

116

16' high Vinyl Coated x 
4' wide single swing 
gate  including gate 
post with braces            

1 each 1091.00  $    1,091.00 875.00  $        875.00 1240.00  $    1,240.00 450.00  $       450.00 1176.08  $    1,176.08 

117
20' high Galvanized 
Backstop                       10 linear 

ft 94.68  $       946.80 120.00  $     1,200.00 130.00  $    1,300.00 160.00  $    1,600.00 81.07  $       810.70 

118
20' high Vinyl Coated 
Backstop                       10 linear 

ft 110.78  $    1,107.80 140.00  $     1,400.00 160.00  $    1,600.00 180.00  $    1,800.00 98.82  $       988.20 

119
30' high Galvanized 
Backstop                       10 linear 

ft 147.50  $    1,475.00 150.00  $     1,500.00 263.00  $    2,630.00 200.00  $    2,000.00 143.18  $    1,431.80 

120
30' high Vinyl Coated 
Backstop                       10 linear 

ft 170.45  $    1,704.50 170.00  $     1,700.00 303.00  $    3,030.00 225.00  $    2,250.00 164.81  $    1,648.10 

121
Foul Poles                     

1 each 552.75  $       552.75 325.00  $        325.00 885.00  $       885.00 1050.00  $    1,050.00 763.61  $       763.61 

122
Barrier Gates 24' wide 
double swing                 1 each 799.00  $       799.00 600.00  $        600.00 1120.00  $    1,120.00 850.00  $       850.00 1208.38  $    1,208.38 

123
Barrier Gates 30' wide 
double swing                 1 each 834.00  $       834.00 700.00  $        700.00 1170.00  $    1,170.00 1062.00  $    1,062.00 1370.82  $    1,370.82 
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

124

Construction fence: 6' 
high (includes removal 
with fence company 
retaining material)         

100 linear 
ft 3.00  $       300.00 3.50  $        350.00 4.00  $       400.00 5.00  $       500.00 3.11  $       311.00 

125

Construction fence: 6' 
high with screening 
(includes removal with 
fence company 
retaining material)         

10 linear 
ft 5.50  $         55.00 5.00  $          50.00 9.00  $         90.00 7.00  $         70.00 6.71  $         67.10 

126
Core Drilling Post 
Holes                             100 each 24.00  $    2,400.00 10.00  $     1,000.00 55.00  $    5,500.00 55.00  $    5,500.00 24.00  $    2,400.00 

127
Mobilization charge for 
projects under 300LF 
(excludes backstops)    

10 each 540.00  $    5,400.00 250.00  $     2,500.00 250.00  $    2,500.00 300.00  $    3,000.00 435.00  $    4,350.00 

128

GRAND TOTAL "ALL 
OR NONE" LOT 2 
(Add ext price for 
items #55 thru 
#127=128)                     

$  $360,118.77 
MATH ERROR  

(ADDITION) 
CORRECTED 

TOTAL

 $ 285,270.70  $405,675.65  $345,136.10  $377,735.22 

129

Best Possible 
Delivery after receipt 
of Purchase Order? 

Days

130
Minimum Order 
Dollar Amount, if 
required?

$

131

Percentage of the 
Districts cost of the 
product that is 
attributed to your fuel 
costs 

% 10%5.00%

7 DAYS

NONE WITH 
MOBILIZATION 

CHARGE

15%0.01%

3 DAYS

N/A

3%

5 DAYS

$1.00

2 DAYS

$300.00

5 DAYS

N/A

**Chapco Fence Company - Lowest Bidder, deemed non-responsible as they did not meet the minimum bid requirements.  Recommed Award to the Second 
Lowest, Responsive and Responsible Bidder for Lot 1 & Lot 2
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PRICE SHEET, EXHIBIT "A" BID #SDOC 09-B-007 CJ
FENCING, MATERIALS AND INSTALLATION

All Rite Fence Co., Inc.  
5115 Old Winter Garden 

Road                
Orlando, FL 32811

Bid Opening: September 3, 2008 @ 
2PM                                               
Read By:                                               
Recorded By:

** Chapco Fence, LLC   
4417 13th Street #513   
St. Cloud, FL 34769

Commercial Fence Con. 
1610 N Goldenrod Rd.   

Orlando, FL 32807

KMG Fence, LLC       
917 W. Oakland Ave.    

PO Box 541           
Oakland, FL 34760-0541

Rose Fence Company  
7310 Old Cheney Hwy.  

Orlando, FL 32807

132

Percentage of the 
District's cost of the 
product that is 
associated to the 
costs of the 
commodity 

%

133

Balance of Product 
Line: Discount off 
Manufactures List %

87%

25%

50%

15%

62%

10%

72%

20%

70%

20%
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