REVISED TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-025 KR
Motor Oils, Fluids and Lubricants
10/2/08 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Fleet Products

6510 Golden Groves Lane

Tampa, FL 33610

Florida Detroit Diesel Allison
6850 Presidents Dr.
Orlando, FL 32809

Glade and Grove Supply Co. Inc.
1006 State Road 80
Belle Glade, FL 33430

Completed Invitation To Bid cover page YES YES YES
Completed Bid submittal form YES YES YES
Drug Free Certification YES YES YES
Debarment Certification YES YES YES
Emergency/ Storm related catastrophe YES YES YES
Conflict of Interest form YES YES YES
References YES YES YES
Copy of Occupational License NO YES NO
Proof of Insurance YES YES YES
Hold Harmless Agreement NO YES NO
Copy of Bid submittal on CD? YES YES YES
Technical Specs NO YES YES
Prompt Payment Terms: N/A
% Days; Net 45 Days 0% 30 DAYS N/A
Do you accept electronic funds transfer? If NO
yes, does your firm offer a discount? NO YES N/A
Do you accept purchase/ payment by Visa YES YES YES
Price Sheet
ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Extended | \\ it Cost Extended | \\ it Cost Extended
NO. Cost Cost Cost
Motor Oil 15-W-140, 55 Gallon Drum,
1 |Est.Qty 5 Drums
$ 82341 |$  4,117.05|$ 705.00 |$  3,525.00 | $ 544.45 | '$ 2,722.25
Specify Brand Name
CASTROL HYPURON CASTROL HYPURON VISCOSITY OIL
Motor Oil 15-W-140, 275 Gallon Tote, $31,482.00
) Est. Qty 8 Totes **Math Error
Should be
S 3,935.52 |$31,484.16 S 3,313.75 | S  26,510.00 | $ 3,164.31 | S  25,314.48
Specify Brand Name VISCOSITY OIL **330 GALLON
CASTROL HYPURON CASTROL HYPURON TOTE
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REVISED TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-025 KR
Motor Oils, Fluids and Lubricants
10/2/08 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Fleet Products
6510 Golden Groves Lane
Tampa, FL 33610

Florida Detroit Diesel Allison
6850 Presidents Dr.
Orlando, FL 32809

Glade and Grove Supply Co. Inc.

1006 State Road 80
Belle Glade, FL 33430

Transmission Fluid, 1 Quart,
Est. Qty 5 Quarts S 547 | S 27.35 | N/AIN QTS. S - S 13.07 | S 65.35
Specify Brand Name VALVOLINE VV346 TRANSYND VISCOSITY OIL
Transmission Fluid, 55 Gallon Drum,
Est. Qty 5 Drums
S 1,757.75 | $ 8,788.75 | $ 1,360.00 | S 6,800.00 | $ 54227 | S 2,711.35
Specify Brand Name
BP AUTRAN SYN 295 TRANSYND VISCOSITY OIL
Transmission Fluid, 275 Gallon Tote,
Est. Qty 2 Totes
S 8,788.73 | $ 17,577.46 | $ 6,682.00 | $ 13,364.00 | $ 3,190.08 | $ 6,380.16
Specify Brand Name VISCOSITY OIL **330 GALLON
BP AUTRAN SYN 295 TRANSYND TOTE
Gear Lubricant, 55 Gallon Drum,
Est. Qty 2 Drums S 847.94 | S 1,695.88 | S 71595 | $ 1,431.90 | S 718.00 | S 1,436.00
Specify Brand Name
VALVOLINE VV826 CASTROL AP 85W140 VISCOSITY OIL
Chassis Lubricant, 55 Gallon Drum
Est. Qty 2 Drums S 869.40 | S 1,738.80 | S 1,145.45 | S 2,290.90 | $ 718.00 | S 1,436.00
Specify Brand Name
VALVOLINE VV70119 CASTROL PYROPLEX BLUE VISCOSITY OIL
Wheel Bearing Grease, 5 Gallon Pail
Est. Qty 1 Gallon Pail
S 9261 (S 9261 (S 105.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 97.00 | S 97.00
Specify Brand Name
VALVOLINE VV70132 CASTROL PYROPLEX BLUE VISCOSITY OIL
Gasoline Engine Coolant/Antifreeze, 55
Gallon Drums
Est. Qty 10 Drums
S 450.37 | S 4,503.70 | S 61835 [ S 6,183.50 | $ 611.00 | S 6,110.00
Specify Brand Name
PEAK GLOBAL 50/50 CASTROL EXTENDED LIFE 50/50 VISCOSITY OIL
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REVISED TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-025 KR
Motor Oils, Fluids and Lubricants
10/2/08 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Fleet Products
6510 Golden Groves Lane
Tampa, FL 33610

Florida Detroit Diesel Allison
6850 Presidents Dr.
Orlando, FL 32809

Glade and Grove Supply Co. Inc.

1006 State Road 80
Belle Glade, FL 33430

Diesel Engine Coolant/Antifreeze, 55
10 (Gallon Drums
Est. Qty 11 Drums

S 617.77 | S 6,795.47

S 358.00 | $ 3,938.00

$

683.00 | $ 7,513.00

Specify Brand Name

PEAK FINAL CHARGE 50/50 POWERCOOL 50/50 PREMIXED VISCOSITY OIL
Are you able to meet delivery time
within forty-eight (48) hours? Yes__
11 |No If not,
specify best possible delivery
YES YES YES
12 .
Minimum Order Amount S - S 100.00 N/A

Awarding Coolant to the overall
lowest responsive, responsible
bidder for the respective items.

Awarding Motor Oils and
Transmission Fluid to the overall
lowest responsive, responsible
bidder for the respective items.
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REVISED TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-025 KR
Motor Oils, Fluids and Lubricants
10/2/08 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Highlands Oil Co.
1130 N. Scenic Hwy
Lake Wales, FL 33853

Hydrotex
1155 Oak Creek Court
Winter Springs, FL 32708

Lynch Oil Co.
1244 E. Carroll St.
Kissimmee, FL. 34744

Maudlin International
2300 S. Division Ave.
Orlando, FL 32805

Completed Invitation To Bid cover page YES YES YES YES
Completed Bid submittal form YES YES YES YES
Drug Free Certification YES YES YES YES
Debarment Certification YES YES YES YES
Emergency/ Storm related catastrophe YES YES YES YES
Conflict of Interest form YES YES YES YES
References YES YES YES YES
Copy of Occupational License NO NO NO NO
Proof of Insurance YES YES NO NO
Hold Harmless Agreement NO YES NO YES
Copy of Bid submittal on CD? YES YES NO NO
Technical Specs YES YES NO
Prompt Payment Terms:
% Days; Net 45 Days NO 1% 15 DAYS 0% FLEET CHARGE PROGRAM

Do you accept electronic funds transfer? If
yes, does your firm offer a discount? YES N/A YES N/A YES YES
Do you accept purchase/ payment by Visa YES YES NO NO
Price Sheet
ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Extended Unit Cost Extended
NO. Cost Cost Cost Cost

Motor Oil 15-W-140, 55 Gallon Drum,

1 |Est.Qty 5 Drums
S 62480 |$ 3,124.00 | $ 1,086.49 | S 5,432.45 (S 1,093.00 (S 5,465.00 (S 661.71 |$ 3,308.55
Specify Brand Name CITGO CITGARD 700 SHELL ROTELLA T SYNTH.
SAE 15W40 HYDROTEX HYFILM LEO 5W40 ZSH5071338D
Motor Oil 15-W-140, 275 Gallon Tote,
) Est. Qty 8 Totes
$3,335.75|S 26,686.00 [ $5,281.14 | S 4224912 |S 5,464.25|S 43,714.00 [ N/A N/A
Specify Brand Name CITGO CITGARD 700 SHELL ROTELLA T SYNTH.
SAE 15W40 HYDROTEX HYFILM LEO 5W40
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REVISED TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-025 KR
Motor Oils, Fluids and Lubricants
10/2/08 2:00 PM

Highlands Oil Co.
1130 N. Scenic Hwy

Hydrotex
1155 Oak Creek Court

Lynch Oil Co.
1244 E. Carroll St.

Maudlin International
2300 S. Division Ave.

Lake Wales, FL 33853 Winter Springs, FL 32708 Kissimmee, FL. 34744 Orlando, FL 32805
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping
Transmission Fluid, 1 Quart,
Est. Qty 5 Quarts NO BID NO BID S 9.01|$ 45.05 | NO BID NO BID S 1094 | $ 54.70
Specify Brand Name HYDROTEX HYTORQUE FATF27101Q
Transmission Fluid, 55 Gallon Drum,
Est. Qty 5 Drums
$1,780.53 | S 8,902.65 | $ 1,245.90 | S 6,229.50 | $ 1,175.00 | S 5,875.00 | $ 1,939.55 | § 9,697.75
Specify Brand Name CITGO QUATRASYN SYN.
TRANS. OIL HYDROTEX HYTORQUE SHELL DONAX TX FLUID FATF27101D
Transmission Fluid, 275 Gallon Tote,
Est. Qty 2 Totes
$9,116.00 [ S 18,232.00 | $ 6,097.27 | § 12,19454 |S 591250 (S 11,825.00 | N/A N/A
Specify Brand Name CITGO QUATRASYN SYN.
TRANS. OIL HYDROTEX HYTORQUE SHELL DONAX TX FLUID
Gear Lubricant, 55 Gallon Drum,
Est. Qty 2 Drums S 69267 (S 1,385.34 [ $ 1,583.96 | $ 3,167.92 | $ 650.00 | S 1,300.00 | S 1,423.39 [ S 2,846.78
Specify Brand Name CITGO PREMIUM GEAR OIL
SAE 85W140 HYDROTEX MULTIFILM SHELL SPIRAX HD ZSH5922700055D
Chassis Lubricant, 55 Gallon Drum
Est. Qty 2 Drums S 896.67 S 1,793.34 [ $ 1,293.06 | $ 2,586.12 | S 750.00 | $ 1,500.00 [ S 900.00 | S 1,800.00
Specify Brand Name CITGO LITHOPLEX MP2
GREASE HYDROTEX SUPERSHIELD SHELL RETINAX LX2 ZSH5067715D
Wheel Bearing Grease, 5 Gallon Pail
Est. Qty 1 Gallon Pail
NO BID NO BID S 143.18 (S 143.18 | S 90.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 88.50 | S 88.50
Specify Brand Name HYDROTEX ACCULUBE
**1/5 GALLON SHELL SUPER DUTY GREASE ZSH5067712P
Gasoline Engine Coolant/Antifreeze, 55
Gallon Drums
Est. Qty 10 Drums
NO BID NO BID N/A N/A S 700.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 368.16 | $ 3,681.60
Specify Brand Name
SHELL DEXCOOL AF/COOLANT CC2826
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REVISED TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-025 KR
Motor Oils, Fluids and Lubricants
10/2/08 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Highlands Oil Co.
1130 N. Scenic Hwy
Lake Wales, FL 33853

Hydrotex
1155 Oak Creek Court
Winter Springs, FL 32708

Lynch Oil Co.
1244 E. Carroll St.
Kissimmee, FL. 34744

Maudlin International
2300 S. Division Ave.
Orlando, FL 32805

Diesel Engine Coolant/Antifreeze, 55
10 (Gallon Drums

Est. Qty 11 Drums NO BID NO BID N/A N/A S 465.00 | $ 5,115.00 | S 368.16 | S 4,049.76
Specify Brand Name
SHELL ROTELLA ELC 50/50 CC2826
Are you able to meet delivery time
within forty-eight (48) hours? Yes____
11 |No If not,
specify best possible delivery
YES YES YES YES
12 1 DRUM OR TOTE, ANY
Minimum Order Amount PRODUCT N/A 55 GAL. DRUM N/A

**ALL PRICES STATED ON THIS
PAGE ARE FIRM FOR 6 MONTHS.
SHIPMENTS AFTER THAT WILL
PASS ON ANY PRICE INCREASE
FROM OUR MANUFACTURER.
THE MARGIN WILL REMAIN THE
SAME. PROOF CAN BE
PROVIDED. THIS IS DUE TO THE
VOLITILITY IN THE PETROLEUM
INDUSTRY.

Awarding Gear and Chassis
Lubricant and Wheel Bearing
Grease to the overall lowest

responsive, responsible bidder
for the respective items.
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