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Bid Submittal Form Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
PRICE SHEET
1.  Clarinet, Student, Bb, With Case, 
Yamaha #YCL-250CA ONLY                      
11 Each

#YCL250               
$324.50                
*******                 

Blessing #BCL1080      
$195.00

A/S              
$324.00

A/S                    
$319.00

#YCL-250        
$316.00

A/S                   
$354.00

2.  Flute, Student, With Case, Straight 
Head, Gemeinhardt Series 2SP, Model 
#21619 ONLY                                              
12 Each

A/S                    
$233.00                
********                 

Blessing #FLU1010       
$195.00

A/S              
$251.00

A/S                    
$245.00

A/S             
$228.00

A/S                   
$247.00

3.  Saxophone, Alto, With Case, Yamaha 
#YAS23CA ONLY                                        
1 Each

#YAS23                
$795.00                
********                 

Blessing #BAS2020       
$428.00

A/S              
$781.00

A/S                    
$784.00

A/S             
$777.00

A/S                   
$868.00

4.  Saxophone, Tenor, With Case, 
Yamaha #YTS475CA ONLY                       
1 Each

#YTS475               
$1,559.00

A/S              
$1,531.00

A/S                    
$1,539.00

A/S            
#1,525.00

A/S                   
$1,715.00

5.  Trombone, Standard, With Case, 
Chrome-Plated Yellow Brass, Yamaha 
#YSL-354CA ONLY                                     
11 Each

#YSL-354               
$411.50                
********                 

Blessing #TB1300        
$219.00

#YSL-354C     
$411.00          

(Lacquer)         
*******            

#YSL-354SC      
$511.00          
(Silver) 

A/S                    
$406.00

A/S             
$399.00

A/S                   
$449.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 09-B-069 KB
DATE/TIME: 2-12, 2009 @ 2:00 PM                        
INSTRUMENTS, MUSICAL FOR 
SECONDARY EDUCATION
READ BY:__Kathy Brown
RECORDED BY:__Kathy Brown
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 09-B-069 KB
DATE/TIME: 2-12, 2009 @ 2:00 PM                        
INSTRUMENTS, MUSICAL FOR 
SECONDARY EDUCATION
READ BY:__Kathy Brown
RECORDED BY:__Kathy Brown

6.  Trumpet, Student, Bb, Silver Plated 
Finish, With Case, Yamaha 
#YTR2335SCA ONLY                                 
12 Each

Yamaha Lacquer         
YTR2335               
$410.00                
*******                 

Use Bach #TR300HS    
$524.00                

Silver                  
*********                

Blessing #BTR1124       
$219.00                

(In Lacquer Only)  
A/S              

$509.00
A/S                    

$406.00
A/S             

$452.00
A/S                   

$513.00
7.  Viola, 15", Student, With Case, 
Bellafina Model 360, #71631 ONLY           
3 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Johannes Kohr #K400V 
Outfit                 

$359.00*
8.  Violin Outfit, 4/4 Size, Includes 
Brazilwood Bow Wlith Genuine 
Horsehair And Case, Bellafina Model 50 
#71482 ONLY                                              
6 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Scherl & Roth #R101E4 
Outfit                 

$193.00*    
9.  Can Othe Entities Piggy-Back From 
This Bid?                                                     
______Yes               ________No

No                    
********                 

Yes on Blessing          Yes Yes Yes Yes
10.  Estimated Delivery Time

0-30 0-30 Days 7-10 Days

5-30 Days 
Depending Of 

Item 1-3 Weeks
11.  Bid or Quote umber to be listed on 
Purchase Orders to guarantee these 
prices.  Prices must be firm fixed 
deliverd prices for six (6) months.

09B069KB
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 09-B-069 KB
DATE/TIME: 2-12, 2009 @ 2:00 PM                        
INSTRUMENTS, MUSICAL FOR 
SECONDARY EDUCATION
READ BY:__Kathy Brown
RECORDED BY:__Kathy Brown

12. CONTACT PERSON:____________    
PHONE NUMBER:_______________        
FAX NUMBER:__________________        
E-MAIL ADDRESS:______________

Interstate Music          
13819 W. National Avenue 

New Berlin, WI  53151     
Robert Goodden         

800-982-2263   
bgoodden@interstatemusi

c.com 

Music Man        
2309 N. Dixie Hwy.  
West Palm Beach, 

FL 33407         
John Jarvis        

561-832-3753    
john@musicmaninc

.com

Music Showcase          
402 Oakfield Drive        
Brandon, FL 33511        

Heather                 
813-685-5998   

mso@musicshowcaseonlin
e.com

National 
Educational Music 

Co.             
1181 Rt. 22 East  
Mountainside, NJ 

07092           
Raymond 
Benedetto, 
President        

908-232-6700  
bids@nemc.com

Sam Ash Quikship Corp.  
7726 Cheri Court        
Tampa, FL 33634        

Mark Mcarty            
888-615-5904 x2211     

samashed@samashmusi
c.com

13.  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
14.  Certificate of Debarment?

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
16.  Conflict of Interst Form Signed?

Yes Yes No Yes Yes
17.  List of References?

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
18.  Certificate of Insurance?

No No No Yes No
19.  If no Worker's Comp Insurance - They 
Need the Hold Harmless Agreement Form 
Signed.

No Yes No No Yes
20.  Any Confidential Materials?  If Yes, Is 
the Non-Disclosure Form Signed?

No No Yes No No
NOTES Prices firm for 6 

months **See Bid 
For Additional 
Notes 

*Bellafina is a "private 
label" that can't be 
competitively bid.



Bid Submittal Form Signed
PRICE SHEET
1.  Clarinet, Student, Bb, With Case, 
Yamaha #YCL-250CA ONLY                      
11 Each

2.  Flute, Student, With Case, Straight 
Head, Gemeinhardt Series 2SP, Model 
#21619 ONLY                                              
12 Each

3.  Saxophone, Alto, With Case, Yamaha 
#YAS23CA ONLY                                        
1 Each

4.  Saxophone, Tenor, With Case, 
Yamaha #YTS475CA ONLY                       
1 Each

5.  Trombone, Standard, With Case, 
Chrome-Plated Yellow Brass, Yamaha 
#YSL-354CA ONLY                                     
11 Each

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 09-B-069 KB
DATE/TIME: 2-12, 2009 @ 2:00 PM            
INSTRUMENTS, MUSICAL FOR 
SECONDARY EDUCATION
READ BY:__Kathy Brown
RECORDED BY:__Kathy Brown
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

No Bid No Bid

#YCL-250         
$319.00           

No longer available 
"CA" with Carry All 

Case
A/S               

$317.00
A/S              

$360.00

No Bid No Bid
A/S               

$240.00
A/S               

$227.00
A/S              

$310.00

No Bid No Bid

#YAS23           
$795.00           

No longer available 
"CA" with Carry All 

Case
A/S               

$779.00

#YAS23      
$860.00          
W/O CA

No Bid No Bid

#YTS475          
$1,550.00         

No longer available 
"CA" with Carry All 

Case
A/S               

$1,531.00

#YTS475         
$1,650.00        
W/O CA

No Bid No Bid

#YSL-354         
$411.00           

No longer available 
"CA" with Cary All 

Case
A/S               

$401.00

#YSL-354     
$460.00          
W/O CA



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 09-B-069 KB
DATE/TIME: 2-12, 2009 @ 2:00 PM            
INSTRUMENTS, MUSICAL FOR 
SECONDARY EDUCATION
READ BY:__Kathy Brown
RECORDED BY:__Kathy Brown

6.  Trumpet, Student, Bb, Silver Plated 
Finish, With Case, Yamaha 
#YTR2335SCA ONLY                                 
12 Each

7.  Viola, 15", Student, With Case, 
Bellafina Model 360, #71631 ONLY           
3 Each
8.  Violin Outfit, 4/4 Size, Includes 
Brazilwood Bow Wlith Genuine 
Horsehair And Case, Bellafina Model 50 
#71482 ONLY                                              
6 Each
9.  Can Othe Entities Piggy-Back From 
This Bid?                                                     
______Yes               ________No
10.  Estimated Delivery Time

11.  Bid or Quote umber to be listed on 
Purchase Orders to guarantee these 
prices.  Prices must be firm fixed 
deliverd prices for six (6) months.
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No Bid No Bid

#YAS23           
$465.00           

No longer available 
"CA" with Carry All 

Case
A/S               

$454.00

#YTR2335S       
$480.00          
W/O CA

A/S              
$439.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

A/S              
$499.00

A/S              
$188.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

A/S              
$150.00

Yes No Bid Yes Yes Yes

No Bid 10-15 Days 30 Days
7-10 Days on stock 

items

No Bid
Mary-SCOD-09-B-

069-KB #09B069



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 09-B-069 KB
DATE/TIME: 2-12, 2009 @ 2:00 PM            
INSTRUMENTS, MUSICAL FOR 
SECONDARY EDUCATION
READ BY:__Kathy Brown
RECORDED BY:__Kathy Brown

12. CONTACT PERSON:____________    
PHONE NUMBER:_______________        
FAX NUMBER:__________________        
E-MAIL ADDRESS:______________

13.  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form
14.  Certificate of Debarment?

16.  Conflict of Interst Form Signed?

17.  List of References?

18.  Certificate of Insurance?

19.  If no Worker's Comp Insurance - They 
Need the Hold Harmless Agreement Form 
Signed.

20.  Any Confidential Materials?  If Yes, Is 
the Non-Disclosure Form Signed?

NOTES
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Shar Products 
Company.        

2465 S. Industrial 
Hwy.             

Ann Arbor, MI 
48104            

866-742-7261     
Paula Leshkevich   

schools@sharmusi
c.com

Suzuki Corp       
PO Box 710459    

Santee, CA 92072-
0459             

Tricia Barlay       
800-854-1594 x120 
tbarlay@suzukicorp

.com

Taylor Music, Inc.    
513 S Main        
PO Box 670      

Aberdeen, SD 
57402-0670        

Mary McKinney     
605-225-1335 

mary@1800usaban
d.com

Washington Music 
Sales Center, Inc. 
11151 Veirs Mill 

Road  Wheaton, MD 
20902             

Dennis Parker       
301-946-3448   

dennisp@chucklevins
.com

The Woodwind & 
Brasswind        

4004 Technology 
Drive            

South Bend, IN 
46628           

800-346-4448   
ttoth@wwbw.com

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes No Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

No No Yes No No

No No No No No

No Yes No No No


