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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
MWBE - Certified Business Program? No Yes No No Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Catalog Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes
ltem # [PRICE SHEET
Completed
1 [Discount % Off Supplies % 12% 12% wrong price 10-75% 18% Up to 20% 15%
sheet
0,
2 |Discount % Off Equipment % 12% 12% 10-75% 18% 10-15% 1;(;;‘:3
$100.QO for free $5.00 for
shipping .
rrrx discount
3 [Minimum Order Amount (if applicable) $50.00 $50.00 EEEEE No Minimum $50.00
SIS0 @l $498.00 for free
items with a C
delivery

"Truck" symbol




TABULATION SHEET FOR: v S
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK % 3 2 %
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN o N g S 2 5 S g o 8 X
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM 228 _ =gy |2 X =) 58 s3I & ~
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT - 205 &9 § g g = 25 =8 7 o <
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID n s E piE= P % it S ok § o i s « sa
READ BY: SR g3 228 |2 8% 388 ze 2 s g
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PENDING BOARD APPROVAL L@ E o ©E Sa9 ” . 3 g ¢ P I SZ20
@92 Lys =89 2s0% 28 & WY s5e °8 o
<AH = <~ = <N < Eaowm m4da mnmd0mn mdg=
: : SDOC-10-B- SDOC-10-B-
4  |Quote or Contract Number (if applicable) |2009223757SS 015 015-KB/LK D62801
5 |Can other entities piggy back from this bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contact Person / Sales Representative Dan Parravano | Don Sprague CSu:trSir::qeer Pat Scorzetti | Paul Kozlow | Scott Powell
2028
1743 Open P.O. Box 43- 8252 Neda Shepherd 100 North
Address Field Loop 0747 P.0. Box 500 Street Road Road
#307
6
Citv. State. Zi Brandon, FL  [South Miami, FL Sugar Land, TX| Spring Hill, FL | Mulberry, FL |McElhattan, PA
Y. » 4IP 33510 33243 77487 34606 33860 17748

Phone #

813-833-6419

800-962-4041

800-365-2837

352-293-1943

727-251-7072

800-233-8467

Fax #

813-833-6419

305-665-1800

281-295-1310

352-688-8161

888-201-7631

800-578-1064




TABULATION SHEET FOR:

: o
2] o
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK % 3 2 %
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN o O s 8 23 S s 9 g 8 X
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM 228 _ =gy |2 X =) 58 s3I & ~
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT - 205 &9 § g g > % Z3 =8 7 o <
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID 2 8= 0O 2 oF 832 gs © 8 a
READ BY: 3P - 7230 522 |& BE 388 58 = ST 8
RECORDED BY: 538 gEm 232 |3 BS 283 | 2382 | £EE
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL NS E = o E -2 s 23 es2 N g @ S Z
© ©o £ ~ o ~ o [
853 tos 28% |gs0® 88§ | U858 | S8
<= <X =S IS < Eadh Mo aanS [R=
Excludes: Joy Discount varies |Exclusions: Excludes:
Carpets and by product Items marked ImageMouse,
drop ship items manufacturer - |with T, are not Scan Pro,

(DS) in the
Active Play and
Playground
sections, sale
flyers or internet
orders

see attached list

eligible for
discount,
furniture &
equipment with
a check mark
symbol are
subject to
minimum
delivery charge,
call 800-523-
1490 option #2
for freight quote

ScanPro 1000,
ScanPro 2000,
Security
Systems and
Acccessories,
and Books and
Automation
Division
products
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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
MWBE - Certified Business Program? No Yes No No No No No
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Catalog Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
ltem # [PRICE SHEET
5%
*
Completed Completed Completed discl:r(])iz?eedsor
1 [Discount % Off Supplies % wrong price wrong price 12% wrong price 25% 5% free shippind on
sheet sheet sheet . bping
items listed
below
5%
*Includes
2 |Discount % Off Equipment % 12% 25% 5% discounted or
free shipping on
items listed
below
$100.00 for free
shipping
. . . *kkkk
3 [Minimum Order Amount (if applicable) $750.00 on N/A $25.00 $25.00
items with a

"Truck" symbol
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Bid
4 |Quote or Contract Number (if applicable) 2009223758SS 10&2}85' #8302FT30| BQ15142/5F
0/650
5 |Can other entities piggy back from this bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contact Person / Sales Representative Dan Parravano Tami Kipphut M|ch_ael Linda Vana
Klein Huyear
. 13201
Address LA Ol (FE P.O. Box 260 | Arrington P.0. Box 530
Loop 21709 Route 4
Road
6
Citv. State. Zi Brandon, FL Rifton, NY Grandview, | Carlinville, IL
Y. » 4IP 33510 12471 MO 64030 62626
Phone # 813-833-6419 800-571-8198 8020;‘2"8' 800-223-3517
Fax # 813-833-6419 800-865-4674 | 516781 | 550.754.5154

9295
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80 & <9 g z 9 3 d5w 5 E2xnf |sz8¢| £5F7
oo =S ONO SR O=x> OZQW |[OFA0 CRNKS)
Excludes: Excluded: [Exceptions:
Factory Direct All items Chemicals,
items with an marked with |live/preserved
"' sale the symbol |specimens,
catalogs, *F.O.B. media, special
internet orders Factory, all |orders, factory
other direct,
catalogs, clearance and
sale flyers |sales items, and
and offers  [quantity
Fkkkk disscounts
UPS size  |*****
items "free [Add freight to
freight" on |chemicals,
orders of live/preserved
$300.00 or |speciments,
more but media, factory
not items direct, large
with a "+", |equipement and
items with  [furniture
the "+" "free
freight with
order of
$650.00 or

more
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BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT -
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID

READ BY:

RECORDED BY:

PENDING BOARD APPROVAL

Brodhead Garrett
P.O. Box 8101

Mansfield, OH 44901

C And R Products
7495 SW 38th St

Ocala, FL 34474

Childcraft Education

1156 Four Star Drive

Mount Joy, PA 17552

Classroom Products

Warehouse

225 N Fairway Drive

Vernon Hills, IL 60061

Community Products LLC

Rifton Equipment

2255 Plate Clove Road

Elka Park, NY 12427-1014

Constructive Playthings/U.S.

Toy
Grandview, MO 64030

13201 Arrington Road

21709 State Route 4 North
Carlinville, IL 62626-3535

CYNMAR Corporation

Items with
the "*"
symbol
F.O.B.,
Factory are
excluded
from free
freight

*kkkk
Bidding
F.O.B.
Shipping
Point; not
delivered;
for orders
under the
"free freight”
amounts will
have freight
added

Will extend the
free shipping
offer as long as
possible, but
unable to
commit through
October of 2012
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PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT -
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID

READ BY:

RECORDED BY:

PENDING BOARD APPROVAL

Brodhead Garrett

P.O. Box 8101

Mansfield, OH 44901

C And R Products

7495 SW 38th St

Ocala, FL 34474
Childcraft Education

1156 Four Star Drive
Mount Joy, PA 17552
Classroom Products
Warehouse

225 N Fairway Drive
Vernon Hills, IL 60061
Community Products LLC
Rifton Equipment

2255 Plate Clove Road
Elka Park, NY 12427-1014
Constructive Playthings/U.S.
Toy

13201 Arrington Road
Grandview, MO 64030

21709 State Route 4 North
Carlinville, IL 62626-3535

CYNMAR Corporation

*Microscopes &
accessories,
carts, balances
& scales, lab
equipment &
accessories,
meters,
thermometers,
pipets/micropipe
ts, microbiology,
hardware,
tubing,
plasticware/glas
sware,
measurement,
physics, earth
science,
biology, kits,
chemistry,
health/safety,
furniture
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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
MWBE - Certified Business Program? Yes No No Yes No No No No
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Catalog Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
ltem # |PRICE SHEET
Math - 20%
*kkkk
Completed o i . 0
1 |Discount % Off Supplies % 15% wrong price [ el 3-5% 15% 26% Instock| 4o
EE— exceptions 10% consumable
sheet —
Reading - 6%
Math - 20%
*kkkk
. . 28%
0, o
2 |Discount % Off Equipment % % 15% with | - Science 3-5% N/A Excluding 24%
exceptions 10% :
I electronics
Reading - 6%
$150.00 for
$100.00 for free freight,
N _ _ free shipping, $100.00 for excl_udmg,
3 |Minimum Order Amount (if applicable) $50.00 add $7.00 for L N/A N/A Live,
free shipping
orders under Hazardous
$100.00 and Motor

Freight ltems
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PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN i S . H 4 SN 5 9
o 250 © SIS S5 D = DO o 4
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM s R oS Q = 8 52 €89 g & Z 2
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT - S 5889 Ni 09° 29 3 g3 £ 5 02
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID Zw 28« §° £3= @2 g 5 % O 0HES £5x
READ BY: R 389 S 5 Z 2 T 33 Oy Ly 32§
RECORDED BY: 05¢g E5 o 3] S8 S X2 s S== | 655%
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL Qs 2 IR Qs Qaog 8o & 850 v Z & %o 3
o e 235 0% <25 | 285 | 255 | s9% | 585
0¥s= An = wao O B> oS W oS E o & m LS
. . SDOC-10-B- [OCPS #10-B- 10-B-015- | SS-231640-
4 |Quote or Contract Number (if applicable) C73084 015-KB/LK 015-KB/LK 27191 B11010 KBILK 09F
5 |Can other entities piggy back from this bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Contact Person / Sales Representative Michele Grindle NS Glenn Meloni |Bill Whiteman| Carole Tilley Hz_arnet St_eve
Tuzzeo Risher Steinfeld
4810 Forest
Address Run Road P.O. Box 7046 Exlescigve 2157 Turner | 232 N. Main Tuérlr?k())gr
Fhkkk T Drive Church Road Street Drive Y
P.O. Box 7488
6 Boynton Hanover
City, State, Zip Madison, W1 Oakland, NJ Bea)cl:h FL Elgin, IL McDonough, | Bushnell, FL Park IL
53704 07436 33436 60123 GA 30252 33513 60133
800-445- 800-624- 352-793-
Phone # 800-750-3428 800-770-8010 5085 %3227 2926 678-296-2646 2745 800-955-1177
561-369- 800-610- 352-793-
Fax # 888-392-9402 201-891-5689 7700 5005 770-954-1023 2778 800-955-4763
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RECORDED BY: 05% =) R S8T S X2 g3 SS= | 855
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL s 2 3 =R Qg Qo g 8o 89 0 Z 2 55 3
g8 | 235 | 29% £S5 | 382 | 355 | 8% | 28¢&
og = [a NI wa O wwo > W w W LD W m LT
Exceptions: Excluded: Excludes: Excludes: Excludes:
Calculators & |Special Agent Calculators Items that
Peripherals, promotions, |programs end with "ND"
CBLs, CBRs, |quotes, (TTL4, Key Fokkkk
probes, brochures Skills, Motor freight
Navigator and bid prices|WriteBrain) charges are
systems, (prefixed by |site licenses, calculate on
software, BD), catalog |networks, the type of
stopwatches/ti |items with the [factory direct delivery
mers, or letter "P" in  |itms and required and
overhead the third other weight,
projectors position discount Hazardous
kkdkok (XXP-X) offers Materials fee
Shipping including of $19.00 per
applies to special order will be
calculators, bundled charged
storage packages where
products, kckdkk applicable
oversize & drop software
shipped items orders add
from factory 6% with a
$9.95

minimum
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handling fee
of $6.00 on

all orders

*kkkk

No Shipping

on software
$1,000.00 or

more
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On-line orders:
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box - MUST
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CATALOG DISCOUNT BID

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
READ BY:

DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM

BID#_SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL

RECORDED BY:
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BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK S ~ e 3 5 15 9
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN o 2 3 N o | S © E S5 @
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM 29 59 %8 N 3 o © o Y 28 o * g
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT - .05 29 2o c 2 53 |E a o) Q 5 € 3% JoxX
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID gge L3 5= 338 To |8 ®< s o| §£8 >3
READ BY: G B x £¢Z pall s Y £2 14 53| 3 Z|J5<| &Sk
: 5573 g 2< o= SX | €59 |¢ 59 = 4| £00 % ©
RECORDED BY: 293 S g g 255 | E3T |2 82| <8 = | 8uc< g8 ¢
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL S35 w2 F S Zw > and |S S| 85 B 206 3 =l
222 | 823 232 | 8§22 | 255 [2sB2| 85ss | 288 | §9¢%
L oT L ® Z O®mI T oo IS £ £ 00 Y A X 1 O 0o
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
MWBE - Certified Business Program? No No Yes Yes No Yes No No Yes
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Catalog Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
ltem # [PRICE SHEET
10% off
Completed Completed Sgitréirt?og':)th
1 [Discount % Off Supplies % wrong price 28% 30% 2% wrong price 0% 17% 5% xrrn
sheet sheet 3% off balance
of catalog
28%
2 |Discount % Off Equipment % Fkkxx 30% No Bid 0% 17% 5% 3%
12% Furniture
Under
$100.00
add $10.00
*kkk i i
Over Add shipping to
N . . $100.00 orders except
3 [Minimum Order Amount (if applicable) None 25.00 $100.00 add 1'0% $100.00 None software
R orders over
over $150.00
$10,000.00
free

shipping
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READ BY: ;3 2¢Z - 9 oY 5> |2 8& 3 £ | g8« 85K
s § =2 o = = X c = a o e s o A0 n 2o
RECORDED BY: 523 € g =@ >3 5 2z= |2 88 o = o . - 235 ¢
58 0 £ C 3 < egn D E>S |8 OF cl = £ou g c R
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL £ 5 Vg2 [l s w > owny > = K 2 4 9 € m )
o %) >~Z % O O I Ke) < [} 5 .20 ol o = QW0 = g
83 © o = R E | 235 |[EYR0| I9TT | *3 & §Q5
LoI Lo =Z ORI Too IS £ L£00 X X J J o O i NI
Per Bid
4 |Quote or Contract Number (if applicable) C-025243816-F al GO LA 9/8/2010 C1108 #spoc-10{ F-SPOC-10-
100831 B-015-KB/LK
B-015
5 |Can other entities piggy back from this bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes MG (‘.Nlth
exceptions)
. . Aaron .
Contact Person / Sales Representative Henry Law John Seale Carrie Lee Claflin Brad Kaplan | Ron Mohl | Don McNeill
PO Box
4043 Ashland 1135 Arbor Lrar S i 2695 E. P.O. Box
Address Drive Glenn Circle kckdkok Corporate |Eldorado Lake|Dominquez 10636
913 E. Drive Drive Street
Jefferson
6 Colorado
Citv. State. Zi Douglasville, | Winter Springs, | Pittsburg, Springs. CO Eustis, FL |Carson, CA| Eugene, OR
y, State, 2p GA 30135 FL32708 | KS 66762 P 80% T 32736 90895 97440
866-622- 800-888- |800-334-2014| 800-421-
Phone # 404-731-5441 | 407-399-9786 1003 9191 5460 5354 800-877-9378
800-443- 719-593- 310-537-
Fax # 770-627-3858 | 407-540-0669 2960 2446 336-293-1109 7990 800-815-5154
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other School equipment, wide|lesson plans discounts, gift discount
Specialty format and whole certificates,
catalogs or laminaters, class outdoor
flyers, live shredders and |curriculums playground
specimens, parts/service kckdkok structures,
hazardous Minimum parts,
materials and $50.00 for surfacings or
products with a repairs on services of
prefix of "L", "H" non-warranty playground,
or "T", Motor items lofts,
Freight add a kckdkok computers &
minimum Returned accessories,
$75.00 or a items may assessments
12% of line be charged & screening
value up to 15% materials, "All
restocking About ECERSH
fee R", "All About
ITERS-R", Tot
Tree (#96616
and items on
pages 182-
183 in
Infant/Toddler

catalog
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Drug Free Workplace Certification Form Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Catalog Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
ltem # [PRICE SHEET
Completed Discount varies 5% 3% or call for
1 |Discount % Off Supplies % 22% wrong 11% per catalog - see 60% Removed at 3% 00" 0%
. : pricing
price sheet below for list end of order
Discount varies 5%
. . 3% or call for .
2 |Discount % Off Equipment % 24% 11% per catalog - see 30% Removed at 3% ficin No Bid
below for list end of order pricing
N/A $100.00 for
$150.00 for| Add free freight,
3 |Minimum Order Amount (if applicable) N/A 0 $50.00 0 free shipping under N/A
shipping to all $100.00 add
orders $10.00
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Customer
Number
**k%
: : SDOC-10-B- PIT-909-011
4 [Quote or Contract Number (if applicable) 015-KB/LK N/A 38192 None 112*85506 QT71951 | C7288101 100831
Catalog Key
Code
5 |Can other entities piggy back from this bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
. Sonya .
Contact Person / Sales Representative Ms. Gail B_r ad Dave Johnson | Samuels/April Custom er Dori Bob Lerczak Mgk
Rosenberg Reisner . Service Haggerty Watson
Richards
PO Box
8249 : 9728
1705 Wharf Parkiilne | 901 Janesvile | 8801 BISCMe | oo poy | Kevin | 72235 1708
Address Blvd. . Sayre
Road Blvd. Avenue 2308 View
. Ste. 102 Aveneu 913 E.
Suite 300 Cove
Jefferson
6
Citv. State. Zi Sarasota, FL Orlando, FL| Fort Atkinson, Miami, FL Omaha, NE| Orlando, | Chicago, IL | Pittsburg,
Y. » 4IP 34231 32809 W1 53538 33138 68103-2308 | FL 32836 60638 KS 66762
800-861- 407-851- 800-228- | 800-772- | 800-323- 800-835-
Phone # 6172 gogy | B00-o58-9595 | 877-441-6463 | .05 700 x514| 8484 0686
941-870- 407-855- 800-327- | 916-786- | 708-594- 800-533-
Fax# 4922 3676 920-563-8296 | 305-759-9955 8904 7565 1907 8104
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Made ("Z" items 5%) Custom CareerPlus |material
changes to |**** imprint, modules, charge of
bid Early express paxton action [$30.00 to
paragraphs |Learning,Consu delivery lab modules, |items
mer Sciences, kckdkok growing up  |marked in
PE & Team See bid for ready the catalog
Sports, Reading shipping modules, kckdkok
Resources, charges for ADMIN, Minimum
Hands-On- orders building skills |$50.00 for
Health, Special under CTAs, repairs on
Ed.,Agricultural: $150.00 Herman non-
10% kckdkok Miller warranty
Fkkkk Online order furniture and |items
Elem. Math & system smith kckdkok
Science, does not systems Returned
Geometry recognize furniture items may
Algebra, Math: bid, call (these may |be charged
15% customer be purchased |up to 15%
kckdkok service to under this bid, |restocking
Science: 17% manually but not fee
apply discount)

discount
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Add Shipping Inside See bid for
To: Clay, delivery, shipping
plaster, delivery on  |charges
modelling trucks with
material totaling liftgates,
50 Ibs or more, installation,
paper and kraft setup, debris
rolls (500" and removal and
1,000’ rolls), training not
linoleum rolls, included
furniture,

equipment, live
material,
chemicals and
items with "Z"
prefix or truck
logo
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Sax Arts:
o b .
20% listed in Education Bogen Bpgen Apogee
Red on all Essentials Completed General Engineered Sound
1 [Discount % Off Supplies % 2% 12% in-stock o wrong price|  30% Products Systems | International
Supp“eS & 3A) Off Sheet *kkkk *kkkk *kkkk
teaching ENP No Bid No Bid No Bid
materials
Sax Arts
. . : 10% 3% off
0, 0, 0, 0, 0, 0, 0,
2 |Discount % Off Equipment % 2% No Bid furniture & ENP 35% 36% 36% 15%
equipment
$10.00 for
discount N/A
*kkkk *kkkk
Add $75.00 for | $69.00 for
shipping to | free freight | free freight
ItemS II’] *kkkk *kkkk
3 |Minimum Order Amount (if applicable) $25.00 catalog Under Under $20.00 $100.00 100.00 100.00
labeled $25.00 add |$69.00 add
F.O.B./Drop $7.95 $7.59
Ship shipping shipping &
*kkkk $500
between $25{ handling

$75 add 15%
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catalog, sale [shipping &
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READ BY: nL "L "L "L "L "L "L nL S » LS
RECORDED BY: £22 | §28 | S28 | £28 | S22 | £28 | $28 | £28 | £z38
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL T2 3 T2 2 T3 9 g2 2 8= 3 g2 3 g3 8 €= % g =9
c’ow c’ow c’ow c’ow c’ow c’ow c’ow c’ow c’ow
Q0N © Q0N © Q0N © Q0N © Q0N © Q0N © Q0N © Q0N © Q0N ©
n 40 n 440 n 40 n 440 n 40 n 40 n 40 n 40 n 40
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
MWBE - Certified Business Program? No No No No No No No No No
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Catalog Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
ltem # [PRICE SHEET
Alll—Tga?r?d Ashly Community Crown Prol?eicsli\(/l)nal Profii_ional Lowell ngu(rfg QSC
1 [Discount % Off Supplies % . ****f ****f ****f i rrrx ****f e ****f
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 |Discount % Off Equipment % 11% 22% 21% 26% 15% 21% 25% 30% 21%
3 |Minimum Order Amount (if applicable) 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
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CATALOG DISCOUNT BID ‘gml-l-_ *gml-l-_ *gmu-_ *gmu: *gmui *gmu: *gmu: gm"". gm""_
READ BY: nL "L "L "L "L "L "L nL S » LS
RECORDED BY: £22 | §28 | S28 | £28 | S22 | £28 | $28 | £28 | £z38
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL T2 3 T2 2 T3 9 g2 2 8= 3 g2 3 g3 8 €= % g =9
o @ o @ o @ o @ o @ o @ o @ o @ o @
25 © 25 © 25 © 25 © 25 © 25 © 25 © 25 © 25 ©
n 40 n 40 n 40 n 40 n 40 n 40 n 40 n 40 n 40
4 |Quote or Contract Number (if applicable)
5 |Can other entities piggy back from this bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contact Person / Sales Representative Chuck Chuck Chuck Chuck Chuck Chuck Chuck Chuck Chuck
P Gilmore Gilmore Gilmore Gilmore Gilmore Gilmore Gilmore Gilmore Gilmore
Address 152 Wilshire | 153 Wilshire | 154 Wilshire | 155 Wilshire | 156 Wilshire | 157 Wilshire | 158 Wilshire | 159 Wilshire | 160 Wilshire
Blvd. Blvd. Blvd. Blvd. Blvd. Blvd. Blvd. Blvd. Blvd.
6
Citv. State. Zi Casselberry, | Casselberry, | Casselberry, | Casselberry, | Casselberry, | Casselberry, | Casselberry, | Casselberry, | Casselberry,
4 » £IP FL 32709 FL 32710 FL 32711 FL 32712 FL 32713 FL 32714 FL 32715 FL 32716 FL 32717
Phone # 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644-
8992 8993 8994 8995 8996 8997 8998 8999 9000
Fax # 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644- 407-644-
9628 9629 9630 9631 9632 9633 9634 9635 9636
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TABULATION SHEET FOR: S S [y
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK S S ) R 2 o 7 R
L~ L~ -2 8 @ Q Tp) g u
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN s O s o T = I o) =R = 3 @
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM o 8N | 2_% §a g 8 g 12 8| ¢ g 83 |5 &
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT - £E39 £E39 283 g 2 2 5§ |5 | 235 | o028 >zE
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID %ﬁ; :%ﬁ; s8¢ 5 ggg SER| 5859 | SE€< |8a¢
. pust — = o - —~~ —
RECORDED BY: 58 | £58 55y cGs | Sxz | S5 550 | FEe |283
. 2= = 2= = e [72] — = 0 § =S — O mn = = m
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL £§22 £§22 £Z2 ¢ Q38 E@g 556 228 | 225 (3989
528% | 534 295 gng | 500/ 58¢e| 8505 | £3£ |83
n -0 n -0 nmZ2 0N < m no<o]l ninO nooum =< O 40 oM
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
MWBE - Certified Business Program? No No Yes Yes No No No No No
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Catalog Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
ltem # [PRICE SHEET
20% Math &
Science
= 0 *kkkk
Shure Soundtube . R . Completed | Completed
. . Discount varies 15% . .
1 [Discount % Off Supplies % kkdkk kkkk 5% 0% wrong price [wrong price 10%
No Bid No Bid per catalog - see Calculators sheet sheet
below for list K
0% Pre-K &
Kindergarten
20% Math &
Science
0_5% *kkkk
: : 0
2 |Discount % Off Equipment % 20% 20% Blesrt AL 5% 15% 0% No Bid
per catalog - see Calculators
below for list ke
0% Pre-K &
Kindergarten
$50.00
*kkkk
Add $5.00 to
3 |Minimum Order Amount (if applicable) 100.00 100.00 N/A None any live $20.00 N/A
material order
less than
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PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN Lo Lo = 5 = 8|S 0 5 s
o 2 o 2 S< 3 c I a o ° IS 2
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM 2 . & @ . N sorE 3 3 |2 8| ¢ _& €3 |3 o
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT - £E39 £E39 283 g 2 2 5§ |SZR| 285 | o288 (223
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID ‘gm'-'-_ ‘gm'-'-_ 3 S <« T g =R %88 ggg ':.g: %5(3
READ BY: nL S ?L 3 EEZO 2079 s 852 | 858« | 2558 |3%s
: vZ g vE 3 ° E & = 2 T = Scd| g%0 | €38 23
RECORDED BY: S 9 g S 9 9 €23 R Qo =35§ ags | 838 gg.g er g
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 23 8= 9 €5 5 9 7 E EQ2, 555 ] 322 | =g |28e9
52% | 2348 g8 5 giig | Ecogp|sge| 805 | E32 |89sq
n -0 n -0 nmZ2 n<m no<o|l nin O noum < O FH0 oM
, . SDOC-10-B-
4 |Quote or Contract Number (if applicable) 74684 015KBILK 38193 N/A
5 |Can other entities piggy back from this bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
. Chuck Chuck . Bryan Dave Marisa Frank
Contact Person / Sales Representative Gilmore Gilmore Michele Throm Thompson Johnson Chopp Mavigliano
i I 5201
161 Wilshire | 156 Wilshire | 3155 Northwood 4 Easy |755 Rockwell 15353 71st
Address Pelham .
Blvd. Blvd. Pkwy Street Avenue Road Driver N
6 Bound Palm Beach
City, State, Zip Casselberry, | Casselberry, | Norcross, GA Brook. NJ Fort Atkinson, |Greenville, Gardens. FL
FL 32718 FL 32713 30071 08805 WI153538 |SC 29615 33418
407-644- 407-644- 800-895- 800-277- 561-748-
Phone # 9001 8996 407-923-2731 2804 800-777-8817 8737 4564
407-644- 407-644- 866-560- 800-978- 561-748-
Fax # 9637 9632 800-333-0712 8699 800-317-2194 7379 4075
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n 40 n 40 nm?2z N < m no<o|l nin O nownm < O Fd0 M
Sportime/Fitness Exceptions:
& Sport: 22% off Items marked
items beginning with a truck
with "1" & "3", 5% logo, live
off drop ship materials

items beginning
with "2" & "4"
*kkkk
Abilitations/Integra
tions/Speech Bin:
5% off items
beginning with "1"
& "3", drop ship
items beginning
with "2" & "4" no
discount

*kkkk




8TVEE

14 ‘suapires yoeag wed
N 1Q1ST.L €GEST
SaINJUaA 1Se0D aInseal ]

¥70ST Vd "eluosqio
peoy eluosqlo LeSy
a1 (vsn) H4L

6S10-2.026 VO ‘9dles
6G70T. X0d 'O'd
uoneiodiod pnzns

GT96Z IS ‘9lliAugei

‘PY weyjed 10¢s
suonealgqnd Jadnqg Jadns

S50

-8EGES UISUOISIAN ‘UOSUI Y
e G5/ x0g "O'd
Buiurea] nwwing

G0880 [N >oolg punog
19041S Aseq v
Aoelay o] sdais

TL00E VO ‘SS0I0I0N
"And SPOOMULION GGTE
[euoneulaiu| swnlods

Exclusions: Other
bids, special sale

or Educator's Net
Price, special
pricing or

installation

L0/zg 14 ‘Ausgiessed
‘PAIG BJIYS|IM 0ST
BpLIOo|H JO swaisAs aineubis

L0/zg 14 ‘Ausgiassed
‘PAIG BJIYS|IM 0ST
BpLIOo|H JO swaisAs ainjeubis

CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT -
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
READ BY:

DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL

RECORDED BY:




8TVEE

14 ‘suapires yoeag wed
N 1Q1ST.L €GEST
SaINJUaA 1Se0D aInseal ]

¥70ST Vd "eluosqio
peoy eluosqlo LeSy
a1 (vsn) H4L

6S10-2.026 VO ‘9dles
6G70T. X0d 'O'd
uoneiodiod pnzns

GT96¢ OS ‘9||IAusaI9
‘PY weyjed 10¢s
suonealgqnd Jadnqg Jadns

S50
-8EGES UISUOISIAN ‘UOSUI Y
e G5/ x0g "O'd
Buiurea] nwwing

G0880 [N >oolg punog
19041S Aseq v
Aoelay o] sdais

TL00E VO ‘SS0I0I0N
"And SPOOMULION GGTE
[euoneulaiu| swnlods

L0/zg 14 ‘Ausgiessed
‘PAIG BJIYS|IM 0ST
BpLIOo|H JO swaisAs aineubis

L0/zg 14 ‘Ausgiassed
‘PAIG BJIYS|IM 0ST
BpLIOo|H JO swaisAs ainjeubis

CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT -
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
READ BY:

DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL

RECORDED BY:




TABULATION SHEET FOR: g >§
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK g k= g >
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN © g —;éu i
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM > S0 4
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT - z 2 Tg =y
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID S > <5
READ BY: O~ 3 209
£ O ¢ 5= 2
RECORDED BY: -l z 3 S
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 82 2 x = Eo
= T SN 8~
S8w <328
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form Yes Yes
MWBE - Certified Business Program? Yes No
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form Yes Yes
Catalog Yes Yes
ltem # [PRICE SHEET
Completed
1 [Discount % Off Supplies % wrong 23%
price sheet
2 |Discount % Off Equipment % 23%
3 |Minimum Order Amount (if applicable) $50.00




TABULATION SHEET FOR: g >§
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK g k= g >
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN © g —;éu i
DATE/TIME: 9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM > S0 4
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT - z 2 Tg =y
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID S > <5
READ BY: 0o~ 3 __g SNL
€0 ¢ 5= 2
RECORDED BY: - s 8 z 3 S
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 82 2 x = Eo
= T SN 8~
S8wn <32
4 |Quote or Contract Number (if applicable)
5 |Can other entities piggy back from this bid? Yes
Contact Person / Sales Representative Keisa
Sensabaugh
285 West
Central
Address Parkway
Ste 1708
6 Altamonte
City, State, Zip Springs, FL
32714

Phone #

407-786-8855

Fax #

407-786-8810
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Valiant Imc
55 Ruta Ct

S Hackensack, NJ 07606-

Xerox Audio Visual Solutions
285 West Central Parkway

Altamonte Springs, FL 32714-

2579
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