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Bid Submittal Form Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
PRICE SHEET

GROUP I   "All Or None"
1.1  Bookcase, 3-Shelf-Metal, Black, 
Hon #S42ABC ONLY           32 each        No Bid No Bid $127.20 No Bid No Bid $81.60 $73.43 
1.2  Chair, Managerial, Mid-Back, 
W/Loop Arms, Grade III, BR Portfolie 
#BR19 Oxford Fabric, Hon #4002 ONLY 
24 each No Bid No Bid

Fabric Discontinued 
$183.25 No Bid No Bid $114.00 $107.44 

1.3  Desk, Double Pedestal, 
Mahogany/Black, Hon #38155 ONLY      
16 each No Bid No Bid

Mahogany/Charcoal 
$658.75 No Bid No Bid $450.00 $424.12 

1.4  Drawer, Center, Metal, Black, Hon 
#D2 ONLY               16 each No Bid No Bid $89.90 No Bid No Bid $63.20 $45.03 
1.5  File Cabinet, 4-Drawer, Letter, 
Locking, Vertical, Black, Hon #314P 
ONLY                            16 each    No Bid No Bid $254.25 No Bid No Bid $174.00 $156.59 
1.6  Table, Conference, Oval, 96"L x 
48"W, Mahogany, Hon #LA4896H 
ONLY                           1 each No Bid No Bid $455.85 No Bid No Bid $298.80 $281.61 
1.7  Table Base, Conference, 
Mahogany, Hon #BLCP01 ONLY             
1 each No Bid No Bid $319.75 No Bid No Bid $218.00 $205.46 
1.8  Group I Installation Charge No Bid No Bid $496.00 No Bid No Bid $650.00 Included
1.9  Group I Grand Total No Bid No Bid $25,786.40 No Bid No Bid $17.509.20 $15,427.23
Group II   "All Or None"  (Unless Items 

In Section V Are Awarded)
2.1  Chair, Student, 14", Chrome Legs, 
Plastic Shell, Black, Artco Bell #7103 
Or Equal                  180 each No Bid No Bid

Virco #9014        
$26.42

Scholar Craft        
#SC123            
$16.85

Royal  #1101.14  
$21.20 No Bid No Bid

2.2  Chair, Student, 16", Chrome Legs, 
Plastic Shell, Black, Artco Bell #7105 
Or Equal                 216 each No Bid No Bid

Virco #9016        
$29.98

Scholar Craft        
#SC125            
$18.45

Royal #1101.16  
$22.79 No Bid No Bid

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM                     
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM                     
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

2.3  Chair, Student, 18", Chrome Legs, 
Plastic Shell, Black, Artco Bell #7107 
Or Equal                  200 each No Bid No Bid

Virco #9018        
$32.36

Scholar Craft        
#SC127            
$19.17

Royal #1101.18  
$25.69 No Bid No Bid

2.4  Chair, Student, 18", Castered Five-
Star Base, Black, Artco Bell #7P90 Or 
Equal                 16 each No Bid No Bid

Virco #9050        
$51.70

Scholar Craft        
#SC110            
$53.31

Royal #1182     
$72.97 No Bid No Bid

2.5  Desk, Student, Adjustable, 22" to 
30", Flat Top, 18" x 24", Plastic 
Laminate Surface On High Density 
Particleboard, Plastic Book Box, 
mahogany/Black, Artco Bell #DA0D Or 
Equal                          110 each No Bid No Bid

Virco #785       
Walnut/Bk         

$51.90

Scholar Craft        
#SC3200PCFB       

$35.41
Royal #1607     

$49.92 No Bid No Bid
2.6  Group II Installation Charge No Bid No Bid $464.00 $636.00 $2,120.00 No Bid No Bid
2.7  GROUP II GRAND TOTAL No Bid No Bid $24,703.48 $16,236.26 $7,611.20 (?) No Bid No Bid

Group III   "Item-By-Item"
3.1  Table, Actitity, 24" x 72", 
Adjustable, Mahogany, Virco #482472 
Or Equal                       34 each No Bid

Allied #FC2472MA  
$62.40

Walnut Top        
$119.81

Scholar Craft        
#FS949RE2472-2140  

$83.99
Royal #2228A   

$112.43 No Bid No Bid

3.2  Installaion Charge For Item #3.1 No Bid $6.00 $264.00 $102.00 $340.00 No Bid No Bid
3.3  Tables, Activity, 30" x 60", 
Adjustable, Mahogany, Virco #483060 
Or Equal                      30 each No Bid

Allied #FC3060MA  
$62.40

Walnut Top        
$114.00

Scholar Craft        
#FS949RE3060-2140  

$77.59
Royal #2237A   

$114.76 No Bid No Bid

3.4  Installation Charge For Item #3.3 No Bid $6.00 $264.00 $90.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid

3.5  OPTIONAL:  Book Box for 30" x 
60" Activity Table, Black    180 each No Bid

Allied #BB1        
$11.50

Ubox             
$11.35

Scholar Craft        
#2950CS           

$8.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.6  Installation Charge for Item #3.5 No Bid $1.00 $264.00 $90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3.7  Table, Kidney, 48" x 72", 
Adjustable, 21- - 29", Mahogany, Virco 
#48KID72 Or Equal       16 each No Bid

Alllied #FC472KMA  
$96.00

Walnut Top        
$324.76

Scholar Craft        
#FS949KD4872-2140  

$116.42
Royal #2268E 

$170.68 No Bid No Bid

3.8  Installation Charge For Item #3.7 No Bid $6.00 $165.00 $48.00 $160.00 No Bid No Bid
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM                     
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

3.9  Table, Round, 36", Adjustable, 21" -
29", Mahogany, Virco #4836R Or Equal  
16 each No Bid

Allied 
#FC36CRUMA(?)   

$49.60
Walnut Top       

$106.74

Scholar Craft        
#FS949RD36-2140    

$63.46 
Royal #2244B   

$112.74 No Bid No Bid

3.10  Installation Charge For Item #3.9 No Bid $6.00 $165.00 $48.00 $160.00 No Bid No Bid
3.11  Tables, Round, 48", Adjustable, 
21" - 29", Mahogany, Virco #4848R Or 
Equal                         25 each No Bid

Allied 
#FT4ERCRMA(?)  

$69.20
Walnut Top        

$131.08

Scholar Craft        
#FS949RD48-2140    

$83.00
Royal #2266B   

$115.24 No Bid No Bid

3.12  Installation Charge For Item #3.11 No Bid $6.00 $198.00 $75.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid

Group IV   "Item-By-Item"

4.1  Chair Cart, Holds A Minimum of 8 
Student chairs, Virco #HCT789 Or 
Equal                              1 each No Bid No Bid $230.36

National Public 
Seating            

#DY-9000           
$104.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.2  Installation Charge For Item #4.1 No Bid No Bid 0 $3.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.3  Shelving, Metal, 36 x 18 x 84, 
Includes All Clips, Post And Shelving, 
Tennsco #Q05-3618S (OAP-84) Or 
Equal                            2 each $99.95 No Bid $138.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.4  Shelving, Metal, 36 x 18 x 84, 
Includes All Clips, Post And Shelving, 
Tennsco #Q05-318A (OAP-84) Or Equal 
10 each $94.95 No Bid $138.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.5  Installation Charge For Items 4.3 
and 4.4 $790.00 No Bid $92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.6  Table Cart, For 60", 72" and Round 
Tables, Virco #HRTT1 Or Equal              
1 each No Bid No Bid $819.89

Scholar Craft        
#FS0160           
$272.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.7  Installation Charge For Item #4.6 No Bid No Bid $46.00 $3.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group V   "Alternates"
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM                     
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

5.1  Desk, Student, Adjustable Legs 
From 26" to 42", Steel Frame 
Construction, With Pendulum 
"Footrest Bar" And Book Box, 
Mahogany/Black (If  awarded, this 
would replace Item #2.4), Sunway, Inc. 
Alphabetter Student Desk Or Equal        
110 each No Bid No Bid

#1204GR      
Standard Top      

Beige            
$276.50

Safco #1202BE      
$240.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.2  Stool, Adjustable From 21" to 
35.5", To Match Item #5.1, Steel 
Construction, Tip Resistant Leg 
Design, With Metal, Swivel Glide, 
FourSided Bar Connect Between Legs, 
13" W Square Seat, 5/8" Thick Wood 
Material Covered In Kydex 
Thermoplastic (If awarded this would 
reduce the quantity of Item #2.3, 
Sunway, Inc. Or Equal        110 each No Bid No Bid

#1205BE          
Beige            

$129.35
Safco      #1205BL    

$112.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.3  Installation Charge For Items 5.1 
and 5.2 No Bid No Bid $464.00 $1,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.4  Tables, 36"W x 48"L, With Storage 
And Clear Paper Trays, Workspace For 
6 Students, Adjustable Legs From 24" 
To 31", Mahogany (If awarded this 
woud replace Item #3.3) Jonti-Craft 
#55234JC Or Equal    30 each No Bid No Bid $326.09 $262.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.5  Installation Charge For Item #5.4 No Bid No Bid $528.00 $90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Group VI "Bid Requirements"

6.1  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
6.2  Certificate Of Debarment Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
6.3  Conflict Of Interest Form Signed? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
6.4  List Of References? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
6.5  Certificate Of Insurance? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM                     
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

6.6  If No Worker's Comp Insurance - 
They Need The Hold Harmless 
Agreement For Signed. No No No No No No No
6.7  Any confidential Materials?  If Yes, 
Is The Non-Disclosure Form Signed?

No No No No No No No
6.8                                                             
CONTACT PERSON ___________           
PHONE NUMBER __________________  
FAX NUMBER _____________________  
E-MAIL ADDRESS _________________ Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid



Bid Submittal Form Signed
PRICE SHEET

GROUP I   "All Or None"
1.1  Bookcase, 3-Shelf-Metal, Black, 
Hon #S42ABC ONLY           32 each        
1.2  Chair, Managerial, Mid-Back, 
W/Loop Arms, Grade III, BR Portfolie 
#BR19 Oxford Fabric, Hon #4002 ONLY 
24 each
1.3  Desk, Double Pedestal, 
Mahogany/Black, Hon #38155 ONLY      
16 each
1.4  Drawer, Center, Metal, Black, Hon 
#D2 ONLY               16 each
1.5  File Cabinet, 4-Drawer, Letter, 
Locking, Vertical, Black, Hon #314P 
ONLY                            16 each    
1.6  Table, Conference, Oval, 96"L x 
48"W, Mahogany, Hon #LA4896H 
ONLY                           1 each
1.7  Table Base, Conference, 
Mahogany, Hon #BLCP01 ONLY             
1 each
1.8  Group I Installation Charge
1.9  Group I Grand Total
Group II   "All Or None"  (Unless Items 

In Section V Are Awarded)
2.1  Chair, Student, 14", Chrome Legs, 
Plastic Shell, Black, Artco Bell #7103 
Or Equal                  180 each
2.2  Chair, Student, 16", Chrome Legs, 
Plastic Shell, Black, Artco Bell #7105 
Or Equal                 216 each

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

No Bid $73.44 No Bid No Bid $88.40 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $107.44 No Bid No Bid $123.50 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $424.12 No Bid No Bid $550.88 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $45.03 No Bid No Bid $68.47 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $156.60 No Bid No Bid $188.50 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $281.62 No Bid No Bid $323.70 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $205.46 No Bid No Bid $266.87 No Bid No Bid
No Bid $755.00 No Bid No Bid $1,130.00 No Bid No Bid
No Bid $16,182.72 No Bid No Bid $20,438.97 No Bid No Bid

Academia      
#ACD-124     

$19.67 No Bid No Bid $15.65
Royal #1101-14CH 

$16.45 No Bid No Bid
Academia      
#ACD-126     

$21.91 No Bid No Bid $17.64 
Royal #1101-16CH 

$18.42 No Bid No Bid



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

2.3  Chair, Student, 18", Chrome Legs, 
Plastic Shell, Black, Artco Bell #7107 
Or Equal                  200 each
2.4  Chair, Student, 18", Castered Five-
Star Base, Black, Artco Bell #7P90 Or 
Equal                 16 each
2.5  Desk, Student, Adjustable, 22" to 
30", Flat Top, 18" x 24", Plastic 
Laminate Surface On High Density 
Particleboard, Plastic Book Box, 
mahogany/Black, Artco Bell #DA0D Or 
Equal                          110 each
2.6  Group II Installation Charge
2.7  GROUP II GRAND TOTAL

Group III   "Item-By-Item"
3.1  Table, Actitity, 24" x 72", 
Adjustable, Mahogany, Virco #482472 
Or Equal                       34 each

3.2  Installaion Charge For Item #3.1
3.3  Tables, Activity, 30" x 60", 
Adjustable, Mahogany, Virco #483060 
Or Equal                      30 each

3.4  Installation Charge For Item #3.3 

3.5  OPTIONAL:  Book Box for 30" x 
60" Activity Table, Black    180 each
3.6  Installation Charge for Item #3.5
3.7  Table, Kidney, 48" x 72", 
Adjustable, 21- - 29", Mahogany, Virco 
#48KID72 Or Equal       16 each

3.8  Installation Charge For Item #3.7
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Academia      
#ACD-128     

$22.03 No Bid No Bid $19.74 
Royal #1101-18CH 

$19.62 No Bid No Bid
Academia      
#ACD-158     

$43.96 No Bid No Bid $74.43 
Royal #1182      

$56.57 No Bid No Bid

Academia      
#ACD-1100WS 

$40.77 No Bid No Bid $33.08 
Royal #1607      

$31.76 No Bid No Bid
$1,172.33 No Bid No Bid Included 2,233.00 No Bid No Bid
$19.039.55 No Bid No Bid $15,404.92 $17,495.44 No Bid No Bid

Academia      
#GS-2472ADJ  

$108.22 No Bid No Bid $78.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$341.02 No Bid No Bid Included No Bid No Bid No Bid

Academia      
#GS-3060ADJ  

$106.05 No Bid No Bid $74.50 

Classroom Select  
#AT1230BK    

$63.53 No Bid No Bid

$300.90 No Bid No Bid Included $150.00 No Bid No Bid

#GS-B        
$10.03 No Bid No Bid $19.73 

Royal #0350      
$10.85 No Bid No Bid

$472.00 No Bid No Bid Included $720.00 No Bid No Bid
Academia      

#GS-4872ADJ  
$148.57 No Bid No Bid $152.80 

Classroom Select  
#AT1275BK       

$125.82 No Bid No Bid

$160.48 No Bid No Bid Included $80.00 No Bid No Bid



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

3.9  Table, Round, 36", Adjustable, 21" -
29", Mahogany, Virco #4836R Or Equal  
16 each

3.10  Installation Charge For Item #3.9
3.11  Tables, Round, 48", Adjustable, 
21" - 29", Mahogany, Virco #4848R Or 
Equal                         25 each

3.12  Installation Charge For Item #3.11

Group IV   "Item-By-Item"

4.1  Chair Cart, Holds A Minimum of 8 
Student chairs, Virco #HCT789 Or 
Equal                              1 each

4.2  Installation Charge For Item #4.1
4.3  Shelving, Metal, 36 x 18 x 84, 
Includes All Clips, Post And Shelving, 
Tennsco #Q05-3618S (OAP-84) Or 
Equal                            2 each
4.4  Shelving, Metal, 36 x 18 x 84, 
Includes All Clips, Post And Shelving, 
Tennsco #Q05-318A (OAP-84) Or Equal 
10 each
4.5  Installation Charge For Items 4.3 
and 4.4

4.6  Table Cart, For 60", 72" and Round 
Tables, Virco #HRTT1 Or Equal              
1 each

4.7  Installation Charge For Item #4.6
Group V   "Alternates"
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Academia      
#GS-36-ADJ    

$96.67 No Bid No Bid $64.36 

Classroom Select 
#AT1282BK      

$60.87 No Bid No Bid

$151.04 No Bid No Bid Included $80.00 No Bid No Bid

Academia      
#GS-48-ADJ    

$111.33 No Bid No Bid $77.15 

Classroom Select  
#AT1280BK       

$76.08 No Bid No Bid

$236.00 No Bid No Bid Included $125.00 No Bid No Bid

National Public 
Seating        

#SCHD-2A     
$103.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid

National Public 
Seating          

#DY-9000        
$99.48 No Bid No Bid

$14.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $109.20 No Bid $98.09 $119.56 $95.00 

No Bid No Bid $105.60 No Bid $94.91 $116.28 $92.00 

No Bid No Bid $254.88 No Bid $300.00 $200.00 $300.00 
National Public 

Seating        
#NTT-60R     
$150.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid

National Public 
Seating          
#DY60R          
$170.89 No Bid No Bid

$14.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

5.1  Desk, Student, Adjustable Legs 
From 26" to 42", Steel Frame 
Construction, With Pendulum 
"Footrest Bar" And Book Box, 
Mahogany/Black (If  awarded, this 
would replace Item #2.4), Sunway, Inc. 
Alphabetter Student Desk Or Equal        
110 each
5.2  Stool, Adjustable From 21" to 
35.5", To Match Item #5.1, Steel 
Construction, Tip Resistant Leg 
Design, With Metal, Swivel Glide, 
FourSided Bar Connect Between Legs, 
13" W Square Seat, 5/8" Thick Wood 
Material Covered In Kydex 
Thermoplastic (If awarded this would 
reduce the quantity of Item #2.3, 
Sunway, Inc. Or Equal        110 each
5.3  Installation Charge For Items 5.1 
and 5.2

5.4  Tables, 36"W x 48"L, With Storage 
And Clear Paper Trays, Workspace For 
6 Students, Adjustable Legs From 24" 
To 31", Mahogany (If awarded this 
woud replace Item #3.3) Jonti-Craft 
#55234JC Or Equal    30 each

5.5  Installation Charge For Item #5.4
Group VI "Bid Requirements"

6.1  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form
6.2  Certificate Of Debarment 
6.3  Conflict Of Interest Form Signed?
6.4  List Of References?
6.5  Certificate Of Insurance?
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No Bid No Bid
Safco #1204  

$246.95
Artco Bell    
$214.16 $245.22 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
Safco #1205  

$109.45
Artco Bell    
$42.00 $108.98 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $1,875.00 Included $1,430.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $290.19 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $180.00 No Bid No Bid

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes No Yes No Yes No Yes



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

6.6  If No Worker's Comp Insurance - 
They Need The Hold Harmless 
Agreement For Signed.
6.7  Any confidential Materials?  If Yes, 
Is The Non-Disclosure Form Signed?

6.8                                                             
CONTACT PERSON ___________           
PHONE NUMBER __________________  
FAX NUMBER _____________________  
E-MAIL ADDRESS _________________
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No No No No No No No

No No No No No No No

Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid Yes, See Bid



Bid Submittal Form Signed
PRICE SHEET

GROUP I   "All Or None"
1.1  Bookcase, 3-Shelf-Metal, Black, 
Hon #S42ABC ONLY           32 each        
1.2  Chair, Managerial, Mid-Back, 
W/Loop Arms, Grade III, BR Portfolie 
#BR19 Oxford Fabric, Hon #4002 ONLY 
24 each
1.3  Desk, Double Pedestal, 
Mahogany/Black, Hon #38155 ONLY      
16 each
1.4  Drawer, Center, Metal, Black, Hon 
#D2 ONLY               16 each
1.5  File Cabinet, 4-Drawer, Letter, 
Locking, Vertical, Black, Hon #314P 
ONLY                            16 each    
1.6  Table, Conference, Oval, 96"L x 
48"W, Mahogany, Hon #LA4896H 
ONLY                           1 each
1.7  Table Base, Conference, 
Mahogany, Hon #BLCP01 ONLY             
1 each
1.8  Group I Installation Charge
1.9  Group I Grand Total
Group II   "All Or None"  (Unless Items 

In Section V Are Awarded)
2.1  Chair, Student, 14", Chrome Legs, 
Plastic Shell, Black, Artco Bell #7103 
Or Equal                  180 each
2.2  Chair, Student, 16", Chrome Legs, 
Plastic Shell, Black, Artco Bell #7105 
Or Equal                 216 each

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

V
IR
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, A

R
 7

20
32

Yes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Virco #2014 or 
#9014      $17.00

Virco #2016 or 
#9016     $18.47



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

2.3  Chair, Student, 18", Chrome Legs, 
Plastic Shell, Black, Artco Bell #7107 
Or Equal                  200 each
2.4  Chair, Student, 18", Castered Five-
Star Base, Black, Artco Bell #7P90 Or 
Equal                 16 each
2.5  Desk, Student, Adjustable, 22" to 
30", Flat Top, 18" x 24", Plastic 
Laminate Surface On High Density 
Particleboard, Plastic Book Box, 
mahogany/Black, Artco Bell #DA0D Or 
Equal                          110 each
2.6  Group II Installation Charge
2.7  GROUP II GRAND TOTAL

Group III   "Item-By-Item"
3.1  Table, Actitity, 24" x 72", 
Adjustable, Mahogany, Virco #482472 
Or Equal                       34 each

3.2  Installaion Charge For Item #3.1
3.3  Tables, Activity, 30" x 60", 
Adjustable, Mahogany, Virco #483060 
Or Equal                      30 each

3.4  Installation Charge For Item #3.3 

3.5  OPTIONAL:  Book Box for 30" x 
60" Activity Table, Black    180 each
3.6  Installation Charge for Item #3.5
3.7  Table, Kidney, 48" x 72", 
Adjustable, 21- - 29", Mahogany, Virco 
#48KID72 Or Equal       16 each

3.8  Installation Charge For Item #3.7
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32

Virco #2018 or 
#9018        $19.70
Virco #2260 PGC  

or #9260PGC     
$79.00

Virco #785        
$32.01

$1,256.00 
$4,777.10 ?

$68.91 

$238.00 

$63.97 

$210.00 

Virco Ubook      
$6.00

$1.00/Ubook

$126.07 

$112.00 



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

3.9  Table, Round, 36", Adjustable, 21" -
29", Mahogany, Virco #4836R Or Equal  
16 each

3.10  Installation Charge For Item #3.9
3.11  Tables, Round, 48", Adjustable, 
21" - 29", Mahogany, Virco #4848R Or 
Equal                         25 each

3.12  Installation Charge For Item #3.11

Group IV   "Item-By-Item"

4.1  Chair Cart, Holds A Minimum of 8 
Student chairs, Virco #HCT789 Or 
Equal                              1 each

4.2  Installation Charge For Item #4.1
4.3  Shelving, Metal, 36 x 18 x 84, 
Includes All Clips, Post And Shelving, 
Tennsco #Q05-3618S (OAP-84) Or 
Equal                            2 each
4.4  Shelving, Metal, 36 x 18 x 84, 
Includes All Clips, Post And Shelving, 
Tennsco #Q05-318A (OAP-84) Or Equal 
10 each
4.5  Installation Charge For Items 4.3 
and 4.4

4.6  Table Cart, For 60", 72" and Round 
Tables, Virco #HRTT1 Or Equal              
1 each

4.7  Installation Charge For Item #4.6
Group V   "Alternates"
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$61.26 

$112.00 

$76.33 

$175.00 

$107.45 

$15.00 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$396.93 

$40.00 



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

5.1  Desk, Student, Adjustable Legs 
From 26" to 42", Steel Frame 
Construction, With Pendulum 
"Footrest Bar" And Book Box, 
Mahogany/Black (If  awarded, this 
would replace Item #2.4), Sunway, Inc. 
Alphabetter Student Desk Or Equal        
110 each
5.2  Stool, Adjustable From 21" to 
35.5", To Match Item #5.1, Steel 
Construction, Tip Resistant Leg 
Design, With Metal, Swivel Glide, 
FourSided Bar Connect Between Legs, 
13" W Square Seat, 5/8" Thick Wood 
Material Covered In Kydex 
Thermoplastic (If awarded this would 
reduce the quantity of Item #2.3, 
Sunway, Inc. Or Equal        110 each
5.3  Installation Charge For Items 5.1 
and 5.2

5.4  Tables, 36"W x 48"L, With Storage 
And Clear Paper Trays, Workspace For 
6 Students, Adjustable Legs From 24" 
To 31", Mahogany (If awarded this 
woud replace Item #3.3) Jonti-Craft 
#55234JC Or Equal    30 each

5.5  Installation Charge For Item #5.4
Group VI "Bid Requirements"

6.1  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form
6.2  Certificate Of Debarment 
6.3  Conflict Of Interest Form Signed?
6.4  List Of References?
6.5  Certificate Of Insurance?
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC 010-B-045 KB
DATE/TIME: 12-16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM           
FURNITURE FOR THACKER 
AVENUE ELEMENTARY WING
READ BY:__
RECORDED BY:__

6.6  If No Worker's Comp Insurance - 
They Need The Hold Harmless 
Agreement For Signed.
6.7  Any confidential Materials?  If Yes, 
Is The Non-Disclosure Form Signed?

6.8                                                             
CONTACT PERSON ___________           
PHONE NUMBER __________________  
FAX NUMBER _____________________  
E-MAIL ADDRESS _________________
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