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Project Area 1 NO BID NO BID

1. Network Architect-Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 2 3 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 4 5

2. Network Architect-Advanced 4 NO BID 4 3 3 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 4 5

3. Network Architect-Expert 4 NO BID 4 4 2 NO BID 2 4 1 4 5

4. Network Engineer-Intermediate 2 NO BID 2 1 2 NO BID | NOBID 2 1 2 5

5. Network Engineer-Advanced 3 NO BID 4 3 3 NO BID | NOBID 3 1 3 5

6. Network Engineer-Expert 3 NO BID 3 3 3 NO BID 3 3 1 3 5

7. Network Analyst-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 4 NO BID | NOBID 4 1 4 5

8. Network Analyst-Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 2 5 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 4 5

9. Network Analyst-Advanced 3 NO BID 3 2 4 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 3 5

10. Network Analyst-Expert 2 NO BID 2 3 3 NO BID 2 2 1 2 5

11. Network Administrator-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID | NO BID 4 2 4 5

12. Network Administrator- 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID | NO BID 5 2 4 5

Intermediate

13. Network Administrator-

Advanced 3 NO BID 4 1 4 NO BID | NOBID 4 1 3 5

14. Network Administrator-Expert 3 NO BID 3 2 4 NO BID 1 4 2 3 5

15. Network Technician-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID [ NOBID 4 3 4 5

16. Network Technician-

Intermediate 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID | NOBID 3 2 3 4

17. Network Technician-Advanced 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NOBID | NOBID 3 > 3 3

18. Network Technician-Expert 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID 1 3 3 3 3

19.N k i ialist-

9. Network Security Specialist 4 NO BID 4 3 4 NOBID | NO BID 4 1 4 5
Intermediate
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PRICING

SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

Scores are as follows:
If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points
If the Price is = to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points

2
3
5 59 If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points

DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM d—>3 ~ % 3 § If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam n oSN | §5<«
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker Esg |22

» - | ®O S

) C:; 'g % O 8 E Points 4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point

S & | 285 owest $ Highest $

E865 | S5«

Range - Range -

Project Area 1 Low Add 20% | Add 20% | Add 20% | Add 20% High |Difference|Divide by 5
1. Network Architect-Intermediate NO BID 3 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 150.00 90.00 18
2. Network Architect-Advanced NO BID 2 70.00 89.00 108.00 127.00 146.00 165.00 95.00 19
3. Network Architect-Expert NO BID 3 80.00 99.00 118.00 137.00 156.00 175.00 95.00 19
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate NO BID 4 60.00 73.00 86.00 99.00 112.00 125.00 65.00 13
5. Network Engineer-Advanced NO BID 4 70.00 86.00 102.00 118.00 134.00 150.00 80.00 16
6. Network Engineer-Expert NO BID 4 80.00 97.00 114.00 131.00 148.00 165.00 85.00 17
7. Network Analyst-Entry NO BID 5 47.00 61.60 76.20 90.80 105.40 120.00 73.00 14.6
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate NO BID 5 60.00 74.00 88.00 102.00 116.00 130.00 70.00 14
9. Network Analyst-Advanced NO BID 5 70.00 84.00 98.00 112.00 126.00 140.00 70.00 14
10. Network Analyst-Expert NO BID 5 80.00 94.00 108.00 122.00 136.00 150.00 70.00 14
11. Network Administrator-Entry NO BID 5 39.00 54.20 69.40 84.60 99.80 115.00 76.00 15.2
12. Network Administrator- NO BID 5 60.00 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 | 115.00 | 55.00 11
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator-
Advanced NO BID 5 70.00 79.00 88.00 97.00 106.00 115.00 45.00 9
14. Network Administrator-Expert NO BID 5 80.00 90.00 100.00 110.00 120.00 130.00 50.00 10
15. Network Technician-Entry NO BID 5 38.00 53.40 68.80 84.20 99.60 115.00 77.00 15.4
|16' Network Technician- NO BID 5 39.73 | 54.78 69.84 84.89 99.95 | 11500 | 7527 | 15.054
ntermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced | 5 gy 4000 | 5500 | 70.00 8500 | 100.00 | 115.00 | 75.00 15
18. Network Technician-Expert NO BID 43.82 61.06 78.29 95.53 112.76 130.00 86.18 17.236
19. Network Security Specialist- NO BID 5 65.59 83.47 10135 | 11924 | 13712 | 15500 | 89.41 | 17.882
Intermediate
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20. Network Security Specialist- 4 NO BID 4 4 4 NO BID 3 4 1 4 5
Advanced
21. Web Applications Programmer- 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NOBID | NO BID 5 1 5 5
Entry
22. Web ;_Appllcatlons Programmer- 4 NO BID 4 4 4 NO BID 1 4 1 4 5
Intermediate
23. Web Applications Programmer- 3 NO BID 4 4 4 NOBID | NO BID 4 1 3 5
Advanced
24. Web Applications Programmer- 3 NO BID 3 4 3 NOBID | NO BID 3 1 3 5
Expert
25. Web Designer-Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID 1 4 3 4 5
26. Web Designer-Advanced 1 NO BID 1 2 1 NO BID | NOBID 2 3 1 4
27. YVeb Security Specialist-No 3 NO BID 3 4 3 NO BID 3 3 1 3 5
Variance
28. Telecommunication Engineer-
9 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID | NO BID 5 1 5 5
Entry
29. Telecommunication Engineer-
Intermediate 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID | NO BID 5 1 5 5
30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced 4 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID | NO BID 5 1 5 5
31. Telecommunication Engineer-
E 9 4 NO BID 4 4 4 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 4 5
xpert
2. Tel ication Technician-
Z elecommunication Technician 4 NO BID 4 1 4 NOBID | NOBID 4 2 4 4
ntry
. Tel ication Technician-
3. Telecommunication Technician 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NOBID | NOBID 4 2 4 4
Intermediate
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PRICING

SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

Scores are as follows:
If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points
If the Price is = to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points

(@)]
=
2
) ] 5 5 _g © If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM 5 ~ g a N\ If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker S5 | <L
w5 - ©T O c =
»C e g o 8 > Points 4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point
% g E > g % Lowest $ Highest$
H8s5 | SRy
i%vgf‘tc"zzrk Security Specialist- NO BID 5 80.00 99.00 118.00 13700 | 15600 | 17500 | 95.00 19
E:"tvwveb Applications Programmer- | g ) 5 50.00 67.00 84.00 101.00 | 11800 | 13500 | 85.00 17
22. Web Applications Programmer- |\ o 5 5 60.00 77.00 94.00 111.00 128.00 | 14500 | 85.00 17
Intermediate
izv":::e‘gpp"cat'°"s Programmer- | 5 gip 5 70.00 87.00 104.00 12100 | 13800 | 15500 | 85.00 17
Ei‘p‘;v:b Applications Programmer- | gy 5 80.00 97.00 114.00 13100 | 14800 | 16500 | 85.00 17
25. Web Designer-Intermediate NO BID 5 45.00 62.00 79.00 96.00 113.00 | 130.00 | 85.00 17
26. Web Designer-Advanced NO BID 5 55.00 67.00 79.00 91.00 103.00 | 115.00 | 60.00 12
f,:riv:::esecu"ty Specialist-No NO BID 5 65.00 92.00 119.00 14600 | 173.00 | 20000 | 135.00 27
28. Tel ication Engineer-
Entwe ecommunication Enginee NO BID 5 37.00 66.60 96.20 125.80 | 155.40 | 18500 | 148.00 | 296
29. Telecommunication Engineer- 1\ 5 ) 5 45.00 78.00 111.00 | 14400 | 17700 | 210.00 | 165.00 33
Intermediate ) : ) ) ) ) )
30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced NO BID 5 56.00 90.80 125.60 16040 | 19520 | 230.00 | 174.00 34.8
31. Telecommunication Engineer-
Expert NO BID 5 65.00 99.00 133.00 167.00 | 20100 | 23500 | 170.00 34
32. Tel ication Technician-
Entwe ecommunication Technician-1 o BID 5 25.00 43.00 61.00 79.00 97.00 | 11500 | 90.00 18
Tel ication Technician-
33. Telecommunication Technician- | o 5 34.00 50.20 66.40 82.60 98.80 | 115.00 | 81.00 16.2
Intermediate
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34. Telecommunication Technician-
Advanced 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NOBID | NOBID 4 2 4 4
35. Security Analyst-Entry 5 NO BID 5 2 5 NOBID | NOBID 5 1 5 5
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID | NO BID 5 1 5 5
37. Security Analyst-Advanced 5 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID 3 5 1 5 5
38. Security Analyst-Expert 5 NO BID 5 4 5 NOBID | NOBID 5 1 5 5
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry 4 NO BID 4 3 5 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 4 5
40. Groupware Specialist- 3 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID 1 4 1 3 5
Intermediate
41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced 3 NO BID 4 3 4 NOBID | NOBID 4 1 3 5
‘éi‘tzy“ems Software Programmer- | NO BID 4 4 5 NO BID | NOBID 5 1 5 5
43. Syste_ms Software Programmer- 4 NO BID 4 4 5 NO BID 9 4 1 4 5
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer- 3 NO BID 3 4 5 NOBID | NO BID 3 1 4 5
Advanced
‘éi‘pi‘r’ftems Software Programmer- 3 NO BID 3 4 5 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 3 5
46. Systems Administrator-Entry 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 3 4
47. Systems Administrator- 3 NO BID 2 1 5 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 3 4
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator- 1 NO BID 1 1 5 NOBID | NO BID 2 1 2 5
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert 3 NO BID 3 2 5 NO BID 1 4 4 3 5
50. §ystems Security Specialist-No 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID 5 5 1 5 5
Variance
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Scores are as follows:
If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points

If the Price is = to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points

If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points
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=
5
5 % 2
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM 5 ~ g 3 § If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
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X S8 |2 S5 TR Highest $
EFS30 | oRe
4. Tel ication Technician-
34. Telecommunication Technician- |\ - o 5 43.00 57.40 71.80 86.20 10060 | 115.00 | 72.00 14.4
Advanced
35. Security Analyst-Entry NO BID 5 47.00 67.60 88.20 108.80 129.40 150.00 | 103.00 20.6
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate | NO BID 5 60.00 82.00 104.00 126.00 148.00 | 170.00 | 110.00 22
37. Security Analyst-Advanced NO BID 5 68.57 94.66 120.74 146.83 172.91 | 199.00 | 13043 | 26.086
38. Security Analyst-Expert NO BID 5 80.00 106.00 132.00 158.00 184.00 210.00 | 130.00 26
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry NO BID 5 35.00 57.00 79.00 101.00 123.00 | 145.00 | 110.00 22
40. Groupware Specialist- NO BID 5 47.00 67.60 88.20 108.80 129.40 | 150.00 | 103.00 20.6
Intermediate
41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced | 5 5y 5 55.00 75.00 95.00 115.00 13500 | 155.00 | 100.00 20
‘é":"ti‘/ys‘e’“s Software Programmer- | 4 5y 4 50.00 73.00 96.00 119.00 | 142.00 | 165.00 | 115.00 23
43. Systems Software Programmer- | ) o 4 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 | 150.00 | 90.00 18
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer- | ) o 4 70.00 87.00 104.00 121.00 138.00 | 155.00 | 85.00 17
Advanced
‘éi‘p?r’ftems Software Programmer- | \ 5/ 4 80.00 97.00 114.00 131.00 148.00 | 165.00 | 85.00 17
46. Systems Administrator-Entry NO BID 5 38.48 47.78 57.09 66.39 75.70 85.00 46.52 9.304
47. Systems Administrator- NO BID 5 49 52 57.62 65.71 73.81 81.90 90.00 | 40.48 8.096
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator- NO BID 5 68.00 74.40 80.80 87.20 93.60 | 100.00 | 32.00 6.4
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert | NO BID 5 80.00 90.00 100.00 110.00 120.00 | 130.00 | 50.00 10
f’,g'r:l‘r’;t:ms Security Specialist-No | 5/ 4 63.00 84.40 105.80 127.20 14860 | 170.00 | 107.00 214
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Total Vendor Scores
181 NO BID 185 127 209 NO BID 26 192 69 184 239
Divide by 50 for Score
3.62 NO BID 3.70 2.54 418 NO BID 1.86 3.84 1.38 3.68 4.78
Project Area 2 NO BID NO BID | NO BID
1. Network Architect-Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 2 3 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 4 5
2. Network Architect-Advanced 4 NO BID 4 3 3 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 4 5
3. Network Architect-Expert 3 NO BID 4 3 2 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 4 5
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate 2 NO BID 2 1 2 NO BID | NO BID 2 1 2 5
5. Network Engineer-Advanced 2 NO BID 3 2 2 NOBID | NOBID 3 1 3 3]
6. Network Engineer-Expert 3 NO BID 3 3 3 NOBID | NOBID 3 1 3 S
7. Network Analyst-Entry 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID [ NOBID 4 1 3 5
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 1 4 NO BID [ NO BID 4 1 4 5
9. Network Analyst-Advanced 3 NO BID 3 2 3 NO BID [ NO BID 4 1 3 5
10. Network Analyst-Expert 1 NO BID 2 3 3 NO BID [ NOBID 2 1 2 5
11. Network Administrator-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID [ NO BID 4 2 4 5
12. Network Administrator- 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID | NOBID 5 2 4 5
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator- 3 NO BID 4 1 4 NOBID | NOBID 4 2 3 5
Advanced
14. Network Administrator-Expert 2 NO BID | NO BID 1 3 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 2 5
15. Network Technician-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID [ NOBID 4 3 4 5
16. Network Technician- 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID | NOBID 3 3 3 4
Intermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID | NO BID 3 2 3 3
18. Network Technician-Expert 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID | NO BID 3 2 3 3
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DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM ﬂ—>3 ~ (qi 3 § If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker 55 | <52

(% C:; S 8 (% é > Points 4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point

¥ g E g N < Lowest $ Highest $

E83S5 [S5R%
Total Vendor Scores

NO BID 235
Divide by 50 for Score

NO BID 4.70
Project Area 2 NO BID
1. Network Architect-Intermediate NO BID 3 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 150.00 90.00 18
2. Network Architect-Advanced NO BID 3 70.00 88.00 106.00 124.00 142.00 160.00 90.00 18
3. Network Architect-Expert NO BID 2 80.00 97.00 114.00 131.00 148.00 165.00 85.00 17
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate NO BID 4 60.00 72.00 84.00 96.00 108.00 120.00 60.00 12
5. Network Engineer-Advanced NO BID 4 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 130.00 145.00 75.00 15
6. Network Engineer-Expert NO BID 4 80.00 96.00 112.00 128.00 144.00 160.00 80.00 16
7. Network Analyst-Entry NO BID 5 47.00 60.60 74.20 87.80 101.40 115.00 68.00 13.6
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate NO BID 5 60.00 73.00 86.00 99.00 112.00 125.00 65.00 13
9. Network Analyst-Advanced NO BID 5 70.00 83.00 96.00 109.00 122.00 135.00 65.00 13
10. Network Analyst-Expert NO BID 5 80.00 93.00 106.00 119.00 132.00 145.00 65.00 13
11. Network Administrator-Entry NO BID 5 39.00 54.20 69.40 84.60 99.80 115.00 76.00 15.2
12. Network Administrator- NO BID 5 60.00 | 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 | 115.00 | 55.00 11
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator- NO BID 5 70.00 79.00 88.00 97.00 106.00 | 115.00 | 45.00 9
Advanced
14. Network Administrator-Expert NO BID 5 80.00 87.00 94.00 101.00 108.00 115.00 35.00 7
15. Network Technician-Entry NO BID 5 38.00 53.40 68.80 84.20 99.60 115.00 77.00 15.4
16. Network Technician- NO BID 5 39.73 | 5478 69.84 84.89 99.95 | 115.00 | 7527 | 15.054
Intermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced NO BID 5 40.00 55.00 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 75.00 15
18. Network Technician-Expert NO BID 5 43.82 58.06 72.29 86.53 100.76 115.00 71.18 14.236
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19. Netwc_)rk Security Specialist- 4 NO BID 4 3 4 NOBID | NO BID 4 1 4 5

Intermediate

20. Network Security Specialist- 4 NO BID 4 4 4 NOBID | NO BID 4 1 4 5

Advanced

?n'tgeb Applications Programmer- 5 NO BID 4 3 5 NOBID | NOBID 5 1 5 5

22. Web Applications Programmer- 3 NO BID 4 3 4 NOBID | NOBID 4 1 3 5

Intermediate

23. Web Applications Programmer- 3 NO BID 3 3 4 NOBID | NO BID 3 1 3 5

Advanced

E‘)‘(‘p‘gr‘:b Applications Programmer- 3 NO BID 3 4 3 NOBID | NOBID 3 1 3 5

25. Web Designer-Intermediate 3 NO BID 3 1 3 NOBID | NOBID 3 2 3 4

26. Web Designer-Advanced 1 NO BID 1 2 1 NO BID | NO BID 1 3 1 5

27. Web Security Specialist-No 3 NO BID 3 3 3 NOBID | NO BID 3 1 3 5

Variance

Ei:‘.t;l'yelecommunlcatlon Engineer- 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NOBID | NO BID 5 4 5 5

29. Telec?mmunlcatlon Engineer- 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NOBID | NOBID 5 1 5 5

Intermediate

30. Telecommunication Engineer- 4 NO BID 5 4 5 NOBID | NO BID 5 1 4 5

Advanced

31. Telecommunication Engineer- 4 NO BID 4 4 5 NOBID | NOBID 4 1 4 5

Expert

Zi.t;l'yelecommunlcatlon Technician- 4 NO BID 4 1 4 NOBID | NO BID 4 5 4 4

33. TeIechmunlcatlon Technician- 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NOBID | NO BID 4 5 4 4

Intermediate
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PRICING

SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

Scores are as follows:
If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points
If the Price is = to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points

(@)]
=
3
‘ 5 5 _g If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM 5 ~ g a § If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker S5 | <L
w5 - ©T O c =
»C8| 202 >rome. | [4Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Gt
X S8 |2 S5 TR Highest $
EFS30 | oRe
19. Network Security Specialist- NO BID 5 65.59 82.47 99.35 116.24 13312 | 150.00 | 84.41 16.882
Intermediate
20. Network Security Specialist- NO BID 5 80.00 98.00 116.00 134.00 152.00 | 170.00 | 90.00 18
Advanced
E:"tvwveb Applications Programmer- | \ 5 5 50.00 65.00 80.00 95.00 110.00 | 125.00 | 75.00 15
22. Web Applications Programmer- | 4 5 5 60.00 75.00 90.00 105.00 120.00 | 135.00 | 75.00 15
Intermediate
23. Web Applications Programmer- | 5y 5 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 130.00 | 145.00 | 75.00 15
Advanced
E‘)‘(‘p‘z’r‘:b Applications Programmer- | o 5 80.00 96.00 112.00 128.00 144.00 | 160.00 | 80.00 16
25. Web Designer-Intermediate NO BID 5 45.00 54.00 63.00 72.00 81.00 90.00 | 45.00 9
26. Web Designer-Advanced NO BID 5 55.00 67.00 79.00 91.00 103.00 | 115.00 | 60.00 12
27. Web Security Specialist-No NO BID 5 65.00 90.00 115.00 140.00 165.00 | 190.00 | 125.00 25
Variance
E?"t:ye'ewmm”"'catm“ Engineer- | \6BID 5 37.00 64.60 92.20 119.80 14740 | 175.00 | 138.00 27.6
29. Telecommunication Engineer- | 4 5 5 45.00 76.00 107.00 138.00 169.00 | 200.00 | 155.00 31
Intermediate
30. Telecommunication Engineer- | 5 5 5 56.00 89.80 123.60 157.40 191.20 | 225.00 | 169.00 33.8
Advanced
Zl‘pz:emmm”"'catm“ Engineer- | \6BID 5 65.00 98.00 131.00 164.00 197.00 | 230.00 | 165.00 33
:‘:"tLe'emmm”"'catm“ Technician- | 5 g|p 5 25.00 43.00 61.00 79.00 97.00 | 11500 | 90.00 18
33. Telecommunication Technician-| 4 5 5 34.00 50.20 66.40 82.60 98.80 | 115.00 | 81.00 16.2
Intermediate
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PRICING

SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR: " o % . ”
©
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK B - IS ﬁ % = 2 5 S
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN | S o S5 S o g S c o 2
6§25 83 8o (32 I 3o ° 2 555 S ?
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM NG |2 2 o D 2 S J 2 3 D IR ® 3 3 o - E
< ~ —_— re) ~ 5
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES | §%& [§@ 382 S85 (g & 285 | ul8 |280hw 59 26 02 | & ¥
=R £<-—oo Céoo £33 _|_cj:oo cHo [l 8 o a ‘£ © ae®
READ BY: _Laura Elam o5k omg% S |3 Y gD | el |Z oYk gk 2L | 4OH Egi
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker seflsssa|e2r |t g Ler | 387|588 88|98 |58 |Cey
o9 ) N S - |5 o s | o o220 229 | 20§53 a 5
6885058 808|358 808 |eS¢(c22 | 588|685 |80g|5RE
i) e r=] c E . e Q.= 2 £ = . c c ow =™ £ e < D ¢ RS c c g
CERkE |53 6|l oz |ESXE[ 225 |00 (|2 o 538 | O B¥ RV SR @
ST |5 68| oo |cocEl Es | 0SS = |2STE LRT |28 28| 5% 9
O~ M0l ORO0 |[OnNaA D U0 |W-O [0 ECHF [ S-S5 | a0 | C=X
34. Telecommunication Technician- 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NOBID | NO BID 4 ° 3 3
Advanced
35. Security Analyst-Entry 5 NO BID 5 2 5 NO BID | NOBID 5 1 5 5
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID | NO BID 5 1 5 5
37. Security Analyst-Advanced 4 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID [ NO BID 5 1 5 5
38. Security Analyst-Expert 4 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID | NO BID 5 1 5 5
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry 4 NO BID 4 3 5 NO BID | NOBID 4 1 4 5
40. Groupware Specialist- 3 NO BID 3 3 4 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 3 5
Intermediate
41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced 3 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID | NOBID 3 1 3 5
;i'tf‘yyg‘tems Software Programmer- 5 NO BID 4 4 5 NO BID | NO BID 5 1 5 5
43. Syste_ms Software Programmer- 4 NO BID 4 4 5 NOBID | NOBID 4 1 4 5
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer- 3 NO BID 3 3 4 NOBID | NO BID 3 1 3 5
Advanced
‘éi‘pi‘r’ftems Software Programmer- 3 NO BID 3 3 4 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 3 5
46. Systems Administrator-Entry 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID | NO BID 3 2 3 4
47. Systems Administrator- 3 NO BID 2 1 5 NOBID | NOBID 3 1 3 4
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator- 1 NO BID 1 1 5 NOBID | NO BID 3 3 2 5
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert 1 NO BID 1 1 5 NO BID | NO BID 1 4 1 5
50. §ystems Security Specialist-No 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NOBID | NO BID 5 1 5 5
Variance
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PRICING

SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

Scores are as follows:
If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points

If the Price is = to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points

If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points

(@)]
=
5
5 % 2
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM 5 ~ g 3 § If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker S5 | <L
w5 - ©T O c =
»CG8 | £02¢2 > Points | 4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point
S E .g N £ Lowest $ Highest $
H8s5 | SRy
34. Telecommunication Technician- | 5 5 5 43.00 57.40 71.80 86.20 10060 | 115.00 | 72.00 14.4
Advanced
35. Security Analyst-Entry NO BID 5 47.00 65.60 84.20 102.80 121.40 | 140.00 | 93.00 18.6
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate | NO BID 5 60.00 80.00 100.00 120.00 140.00 | 160.00 | 100.00 20
37. Security Analyst-Advanced NO BID 5 68.57 92.86 11714 141.43 165.71 | 190.00 | 12143 | 24.286
38. Security Analyst-Expert NO BID 5 80.00 104.00 | 128.00 152.00 176.00 | 200.00 | 120.00 24
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry NO BID 5 35.00 55.00 75.00 95.00 115.00 | 135.00 | 100.00 20
40. Groupware Specialist- NO BID 5 47.00 65.60 84.20 102.80 121.40 | 140.00 | 93.00 18.6
Intermediate
41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced | NO BID 5 55.00 73.00 91.00 109.00 127.00 | 14500 | 90.00 18
‘éi‘tzy“ems Software Programmer- | \ 5/ 4 50.00 71.00 92.00 113.00 134.00 | 155.00 | 105.00 21
43. Systems Software Programmer- | ) o 4 60.00 76.00 92.00 108.00 124.00 | 14000 | 80.00 16
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer- | ) o 4 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 130.00 | 145.00 | 75.00 15
Advanced
‘éi‘p?r’ftems Software Programmer- | \ 5,y 3 80.00 95.00 110.00 125.00 140.00 | 155.00 | 75.00 15
46. Systems Administrator-Entry NO BID 5 38.48 47.78 57.09 66.39 75.70 85.00 46.52 9.304
47. Systems Administrator- NO BID 5 49.92 57.94 65.95 73.97 81.98 90.00 | 40.08 8.016
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator- NO BID 5 68.00 74.40 80.80 87.20 93.60 | 100.00 | 32.00 6.4
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert | NO BID 5 80.00 86.00 92.00 98.00 104.00 | 110.00 | 30.00 6
f,:r:,{,it:ms Security Specialist-No | 5/ 4 63.00 82.40 101.80 121.20 14060 | 160.00 | 97.00 19.4
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PRICING SCORE SHEET
TABULATION SHEET FOR: ” o % . ”
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK ® _5 3 £ = 2 S
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN | S o S5 S o g S c o 2
5§25 |88 8o (32 I 3o ° 2 5535 > ?
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM NG |2 2 o D 2 o J 2 3 D IR ® 3 3 o = E
< - |2 vl = - =
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES | §%& [§@ 382 S85 (g & 285 | ul8 |280hw 59 Z & 22| & 9
=R £<-—oo Céoo £33 _|_cj:oo cHo [l 8 o o c® ae®
READ BY: _Laura Elam o5k omg% S |3 Y gD | el |Z oYk g gk | 508 Egi
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker se8|ESED 222 | el £ | 38 s8=%cs88 388|382 |Scy
EoZ |aet | cB |8e x|l S s |OsaF| 233|262 o .| ED
S08 8558 808|358 508|238 |s22 838|655 |868|suE
ENS G326/ 825 [ESZE 826|006 |820%| 698|228 ( 8038|833
62C R385/ 326|384 8w a6 |weS 68wz ES8S | S8 885 |5F¢
Add Vendor Scores
170 NO BID 174 115 203 NO BID [ NOBID 184 74 175 238
Divide by 50
3.40 NO BID 3.55 2.30 4.06 NO BID | NO BID 3.68 1.48 3.50 4.76
Project Area 3 NO BID | NO BID NO BID
1. Network Architect-Intermediate NO BID | NO BID 4 2 3 1 NO BID 4 2 4 5
2. Network Architect-Advanced NO BID | NO BID 4 3 2 1 NO BID 4 1 4 5
3. Network Architect-Expert NO BID | NO BID 4 3 1 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate NO BID | NO BID 2 1 2 2 NO BID 2 1 1 5
5. Network Engineer-Advanced NO BID | NO BID 3 2 2 1 NO BID 2 1 2 5
6. Network Engineer-Expert NO BID | NO BID 2 3 2 1 NO BID 2 1 2 5
7. Network Analyst-Entry NO BID [ NOBID 3 1 4 3 NO BID 4 1 3 5
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate NO BID [ NOBID 3 1 4 2 NO BID 4 1 3 5
9. Network Analyst-Advanced NO BID [ NOBID 3 1 3 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5
10. Network Analyst-Expert NO BID [ NOBID 2 3 3 1 NO BID 3 2 2 5
11. Network Administrator-Entry NO BID [ NOBID 4 1 5 2 NO BID 4 3 4 5
12. Network Administrator- NO BID | NOBID 4 1 5 2 NO BID 5 3 4 5
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator- NO BID | NO BID 4 1 5 1 NO BID 4 3 4 5
Advanced
14. Network Administrator-Expert NOBID | NOBID | NOBID 3 4 1 NO BID 4 3 4 5
15. Network Technician-Entry NO BID [ NOBID 4 1 5 2 NO BID 4 3 4 5
16. Network Technician- NOBID | NOBID 3 1 4 2 NO BID 3 3 3 4
Intermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced NO BID | NO BID 3 1 4 2 NO BID 3 3 3 3
18. Network Technician-Expert NO BID | NO BID 3 1 4 2 NO BID 3 3 3 3
19. Netwc_)rk Security Specialist- NOBID | NOBID 4 ° 4 1 NO BID 4 1 4 5
Intermediate
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR: o Scores are as follows:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK £ If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN . E o If the Prl.ce is > to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of pr.lces_— 4 pqlnts
5 c 2 If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points

DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM d—>3 ~ % 3 § If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker S5 | <L

» - ® O S -

@ C:; 'g g o 8 E Pomts 4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point

ﬁ é g E § 5 owest $ Highest $

o O O~ K
Add Vendor Scores

NO BID 234
Divide by 50

NO BID 4.68
Project Area 3 NO BID
1. Network Architect-Intermediate NO BID 3 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 150.00 90.00 18
2. Network Architect-Advanced NO BID 3 70.00 86.00 102.00 118.00 134.00 150.00 80.00 16
3. Network Architect-Expert NO BID 3 80.00 94.00 108.00 122.00 136.00 150.00 70.00 14
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate NO BID 4 60.00 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 115.00 55.00 11
5. Network Engineer-Advanced NO BID 4 70.00 82.00 94.00 106.00 118.00 130.00 60.00 12
6. Network Engineer-Expert NO BID 4 80.00 94.00 108.00 122.00 136.00 150.00 70.00 14
7. Network Analyst-Entry NO BID 5 47.00 60.60 74.20 87.80 101.40 115.00 68.00 13.6
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate NO BID 5 60.00 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 115.00 55.00 11
9. Network Analyst-Advanced NO BID 5 70.00 81.00 92.00 103.00 114.00 125.00 55.00 11
10. Network Analyst-Expert NO BID 5 80.00 95.00 110.00 125.00 140.00 155.00 75.00 15
11. Network Administrator-Entry NO BID 5 39.00 54.20 69.40 84.60 99.80 115.00 76.00 15.2
12. Network Administrator- NO BID 5 60.00 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 | 115.00 | 55.00 11
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator- NO BID 5 70.00 81.00 92.00 103.00 | 114.00 | 125.00 | 55.00 11
Advanced
14. Network Administrator-Expert NO BID 5 80.00 94.00 108.00 122.00 136.00 150.00 70.00 14
15. Network Technician-Entry NO BID 5 38.00 53.40 68.80 84.20 99.60 115.00 77.00 15.4
16. Network Technician- NO BID 5 39.73 54.78 69.84 84.89 99.95 | 115.00 | 7527 | 15.054
Intermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced NO BID 5 40.00 55.00 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 75.00 15
18. Network Technician-Expert NO BID 5 43.82 58.06 72.29 86.53 100.76 115.00 71.18 14.236
19. Network Security Specialist- NO BID 5 65.59 81.47 97.35 11324 | 12912 | 14500 | 7941 | 15.882
Intermediate
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR: ” o % . ”

RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK B - IS ﬁ % = iy ﬂ_>3 _§

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN | S o S5 S o g S c o 2
§°s 83 8o (22 I 30 o o 5§35 | 3

DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM "5 L 2 % 3 S& | 83 s |68 2 3 R o & o3

< - |2 vl = - =

"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES | §%& [§@ 382 S85 (g & 285 | ul8 |280hw 59 Z & 22| & 9
=R £<-—oo Céoo £33 _|_cj:oo cHo [l 8 o o c® ae®

READ BY: _Laura Elam o5k omg% S |3 Y gD | el |Z oYk g gk | 508 Egi

RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker se8|ESED 222 | £l 20 | 387 [5585%| e8| 988|387 |Csy
€08 [ne X S 8o a8 | w loO=al| 229|252 3~ 5
5608|8508 E0g|358 5808|2822 {E838|685|268|58¢
SRS 555 225 [ESEE[ 825|905 2295 538|228 |3858| 583
SPC RpeS SRS [Cadml nso |[w2s [083m2 E8E |SCS|a865|63¢%

20. Network Security Specialist- NOBID | NOBID 4 3 4 1 NO BID 4 4 4 5

Advanced

?n'tgeb Applications Programmer- |\, 5\ | No BID 4 3 5 2 NO BID 5 1 5 5

22. Web Applications Programmer- | 5/ | o gip 4 3 3 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5

Intermediate

23. Web Applications Programmer- NOBID | NO BID 4 4 4 1 NO BID 4 1 3 5

Advanced

E‘)‘(‘p‘gr‘:b Applications Programmer- |\ 5\ | No BID 4 4 4 1 NO BID 4 2 3 5

25. Web Designer-Intermediate NOBID | NOBID 3 1 4 1 NO BID 4 3 3 4

26. Web Designer-Advanced NOBID | NOBID 3 3 3 1 NO BID 3 ) 2 )

27. Web Security Specialist-No NO BID | NOBID 3 3 3 2 NO BID 3 1 3 5

Variance

Ei:‘.t;l'yelecommunlcatlon Engineer- NOBID | NO BID 5 5 5 5 NO BID 5 1 5 5

29. Telec?mmunlcatlon Engineer- NOBID | NOBID 4 3 5 5 NO BID 5 1 4 5

Intermediate

30. Telecommunication Engineer- NOBID | NO BID 5 4 5 3 NO BID 5 1 4 5

Advanced

31. Telecommunication Engineer- NOBID | NOBID 4 4 5 3 NO BID 4 1 4 5

Expert

Zi.t;l'yelecommunlcatlon Technician- NOBID | NO BID 4 1 4 5 NO BID 4 3 4 4

33. TeIechmunlcatlon Technician- NOBID | NO BID 4 1 5 1 NO BID 4 3 4 4

Intermediate

34. Telecommunication Technician- NOBID | NO BID 4 ° 5 1 NO BID 4 3 4 4

Advanced
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR: o Scores are as follows:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK £ If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN § If the Price is = to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points
‘ ] 5 5 _g © If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points

DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM 5 ~ g a N If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker S5 | <L

w5 - ©T O c =

»08 | Lo ¢ > Points | 14 points 3 Points 2Points | |1 Point

S E ERY £ Lowest $ Highest $

H8s5 | SRy
i%vg‘:‘tc"zzrk Security Specialist- NO BID 5 80.00 97.00 114.00 131.00 148.00 | 165.00 | 85.00 17
E:"tvwveb Applications Programmer- | \ 5 5 50.00 63.00 76.00 89.00 102.00 | 115.00 | 65.00 13
22. Web Applications Programmer- | 5 5 60.00 73.00 86.00 99.00 112.00 | 125.00 | 65.00 13
Intermediate
izv":::e‘gpp"cat'°"s Programmer- | \ 5 g1 5 70.00 86.00 102.00 118.00 134.00 | 150.00 | 80.00 16
E‘)‘(‘p‘z’r‘:b Applications Programmer- | \ 5 5 80.00 101.00 122.00 143.00 164.00 | 185.00 | 105.00 21
25. Web Designer-Intermediate NO BID 5 45.00 56.00 67.00 78.00 89.00 | 100.00 | 55.00 11
26. Web Designer-Advanced NO BID 5 55.00 74.00 93.00 112.00 131.00 | 150.00 | 95.00 19
f,:riv;'::esecu”ty Specialist-No NO BID 5 65.00 88.00 111.00 134.00 157.00 | 180.00 | 115.00 23
E?"tLe'emmm”"'catm“ Engineer- | 5 BID 5 37.00 62.60 88.20 113.80 139.40 | 165.00 | 128.00 256
29. Telecommunication Engineer- | 4 5 5 45.00 74.00 103.00 132.00 161.00 | 190.00 | 145.00 29
Intermediate
Z%vz‘ﬂgzgmm”"'catm“ Engineer- | \6BID 5 56.00 88.80 121.60 154.40 18720 | 220.00 | 164.00 32.8
Zl‘pz:emmm”"'catm“ Engineer- | o BID 5 65.00 97.00 129.00 161.00 193.00 | 225.00 | 160.00 32
:‘:"tLe'emmm”"'catm“ Technician- |\ 515 5 25.00 43.00 61.00 79.00 97.00 | 11500 | 90.00 18
33. Telecommunication Technician-| 4 5 5 34.00 50.20 66.40 82.60 98.80 | 115.00 | 81.00 16.2
Intermediate
i‘;vz‘;'gzgmm”"'catm“ Technician- |\ 515 5 43.00 61.40 79.80 98.20 116.60 | 135.00 | 92.00 18.4
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PRICING SCORE SHEET
TABULATION SHEET FOR: " o % 5 ”
RFP#SDOC-06-103-LK B - IS ﬁ % = 2 5 S
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN | S o S5 S o g S c o 2
5§25 |88 8o |32 I e ° 2 5535 > ?
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM NG |2 2 o D 2 S J 2 3 3 IR ® 3 3 o - E
< ~ - e} ~ ol
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES | §%& [§@ 382 S85 (g & 285 | ul8 |280hw 59 Z & 0o (& ¥
=R £<-—oo Céoo £33 _|_cj:oo cHo [l 8 o o ‘£ © ae®
READ BY: _Laura Elam o5k omg% S |3 Y gD | el |Z oYk g gk | 508 Egi
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker 528 |EssE| L L | £l 20 | 387 [5585%| e8| 988|387 |Csy
€009 @ " S |s e s |l» . [O=sa =232 262 8 - 5
6885058 808|358 808 |eS¢(c22 | 588|685 |80g|5RE
o < cC = c E . c a5 2 £ = _. c c ow =™ £ e < D ¢ RS c c g
CERSE |53 6| 29Z5 |ESXE[2LZ3 |0 2 2F| 5838 | 9B | 283c| c83 @
SO T |30 = o= [60GE| Enxs | NS [ES283| RS |28 | 28| 228
O F MNd0] ON0 [Onad| WewO |WeO [0 EvF- | =S5 |00 | O
35. Security Analyst-Entry NO BID | NO BID 5 1 5 3 NO BID 5 1 5 5
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate NO BID | NO BID 5 2 5 3 NO BID 5 1 5 5
37. Security Analyst-Advanced NO BID [ NOBID 5 3 5 3 NO BID 5 1 4 5
38. Security Analyst-Expert NO BID | NO BID 5 4 5 2 NO BID 5 1 4 5
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry NO BID | NO BID 4 3 5 2 NO BID 4 1 3 5
40. Groupware Specialist- NO BID | NOBID 3 3 4 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5
Intermediate
41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced| NO BID | NO BID 3 3 4 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5
‘éi‘tf‘yyg‘tems Software Programmer- | g5 | NO BID 4 4 5 3 NO BID 5 1 5 5
43. Syste_ms Software Programmer- NOBID | NOBID 4 3 5 9 NO BID 4 1 4 5
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer- NOBID | NO BID 3 3 4 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5
Advanced
‘éi‘pi‘r’ftems Software Programmer- |\ 51 | NO BID 3 3 4 2 NO BID 3 1 3 5
46. Systems Administrator-Entry NO BID | NO BID 3 1 4 1 NO BID 3 2 3 4
47. Systems Administrator- NOBID | NOBID 3 1 5 1 NO BID 3 3 3 4
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator- NO BID | NO BID 2 1 5 1 NO BID 3 3 2 5
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert NO BID | NO BID 2 1 5 1 NO BID 3 5 2 5
50. §ystems Security Specialist-No NOBID | NOBID 5 3 5 1 NO BID 5 1 5 5
Variance
Total Vendor Scores NO BID | NO BID 177 112 205 81 NO BID 188 93 172 239
Divide by 50
NO BID | NOBID 3.61 2.24 4.10 1.62 NO BID 3.76 1.86 3.44 4.78

Page 17 of 24




PRICING

SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

Scores are as follows:
If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points
If the Price is = to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points
If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points

(@)]
=
5
5 % 2
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM d—>3 ~ % 3 § If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker S5 | <L
w5 - ©T O c =
</>)’ €] '8 g o 8 3 RIS 4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point
S E ERY £ Lowest $ Highest $
H8s5 | SRy
35. Security Analyst-Entry NO BID 5 47.00 63.60 80.20 96.80 113.40 | 130.00 | 83.00 16.6
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate | NO BID 5 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 | 150.00 | 90.00 18
37. Security Analyst-Advanced NO BID 5 68.57 90.86 113.14 135.43 157.71 | 180.00 | 111.43 | 22.286
38. Security Analyst-Expert NO BID 5 80.00 102.00 | 124.00 146.00 168.00 | 190.00 | 110.00 22
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry NO BID 5 35.00 53.00 71.00 89.00 107.00 | 125.00 | 90.00 18
40. Groupware Specialist- NO BID 5 47.00 63.60 80.20 96.80 113.40 | 130.00 | 83.00 16.6
Intermediate
41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced | NO BID 5 55.00 71.00 87.00 103.00 119.00 135.00 80.00 16
‘éi‘tzy“ems Software Programmer- | \ 5,y 4 50.00 69.00 88.00 107.00 126.00 | 145.00 | 95.00 19
43. Systems Software Programmer- | o 4 60.00 74.00 88.00 102.00 116.00 | 130.00 | 70.00 14
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer- | ) o 3 70.00 83.00 96.00 109.00 122.00 | 135.00 | 65.00 13
Advanced
‘éi‘p?r’ftems Software Programmer- | \ 5,y 3 80.00 93.00 106.00 119.00 132.00 | 145.00 | 65.00 13
46. Systems Administrator-Entry NO BID 5 38.48 47.78 57.09 66.39 75.70 85.00 46.52 9.304
47. Systems Administrator- NO BID 5 49.52 58.62 67.71 76.81 85.90 95.00 | 45.48 9.096
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator- NO BID 5 68.00 75.40 82.80 90.20 97.60 | 105.00 | 37.00 7.4
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert | NO BID 5 80.00 87.00 94.00 101.00 108.00 | 115.00 | 35.00 7
f’,g'r:l‘r’;t:ms Security Specialist-No | 5 gy 5 63.00 80.40 97.80 115.20 132.60 | 150.00 | 87.00 17.4
Total Vendor Scores NO BID 235
Divide by 50
NOBID | 4.70
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©
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Project Area 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. Network Architect-Intermediate 2 NO BID | NO BID 1 1 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

2. Network Architect-Advanced 3 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

3. Network Architect-Expert 2 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

4. Network Engineer-Intermediate 1 NO BID | NOBID 1 2 3 NO BID | NO BID 2 NO BID 5

5. Network Engineer-Advanced 1 NO BID | NOBID 2 1 2 NO BID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

6. Network Engineer-Expert 1 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 1 NO BID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

7. Network Analyst-Entry 3 NO BID | NO BID 1 4 4 NO BID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

8. Network Analyst-Intermediate 2 NO BID | NO BID 1 4 3 NO BID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

9. Network Analyst-Advanced 1 NO BID | NO BID 1 1 1 NO BID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

10. Network Analyst-Expert 1 NO BID | NO BID 3 2 1 NO BID | NO BID 3 NO BID 5

11. Network Administrator-Entry 3 5 NO BID 1 5 3 NO BID [ NOBID 2 NO BID 4

12. Network Administrator- 3 3 NO BID 1 5 3 NOBID | NOBID 2 NO BID 5

Intermediate

13. Network Administrator- 2 2 NO BID 1 4 1 NO BID | NO BID 2 NO BID 4

Advanced

14. Network Administrator-Expert 2 2 NO BID 2 3 1 NO BID | NO BID 3 NO BID 4

15. Network Technician-Entry 3 5 NO BID 1 5 3 NO BID | NO BID 3 NO BID 4

16. Network Technician- 3 3 NO BID 1 4 2 NOBID | NOBID 3 NO BID 4

Intermediate

17. Network Technician-Advanced 3 3 NO BID 1 3 2 NO BID | NOBID 3 NO BID 3

18. Network Technician-Expert 2 2 NO BID 1 3 2 NO BID | NOBID 2 NO BID 2

19. Network Security Specialist- 3 3 NO BID 2 3 2 NOBID | NO BID 1 NO BID 4

Intermediate

20. Network Security Specialist- 3 3 NO BID 3 3 1 NO BID | NO BID 1 NO BID 4

Advanced

?n'tgeb Applications Programmer- 4 4 NO BID 2 5 NO BID | NO BID 4 1 NO BID 5
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PRICING

SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN

Scores are as follows:
If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points
If the Price is = to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points

()]
£
3
‘ ] 5 5 _g If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM d—>3 ~ % a § If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker S5 | <L
® S < ® O c -
»C 'g g O 8 E Pomts 4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1_P°i”t
ﬁ S s E N < owest $ Highest $
FoO | OoRix
Project Area 4
1. Network Architect-Intermediate 5 1 55.00 65.00 75.00 85.00 95.00 105.00 50.00 10
2. Network Architect-Advanced 5 1 65.00 77.00 89.00 101.00 113.00 125.00 60.00 12
3. Network Architect-Expert 5 1 80.00 91.00 102.00 113.00 124.00 135.00 55.00 11
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate 3 3 50.00 61.40 72.80 84.20 95.60 107.00 57.00 11.4
5. Network Engineer-Advanced 5 3 60.00 71.20 82.40 93.60 104.80 116.00 56.00 11.2
6. Network Engineer-Expert 5 3 75.00 85.20 95.40 105.60 115.80 126.00 51.00 10.2
7. Network Analyst-Entry 5 5 47.00 57.60 68.20 78.80 89.40 100.00 53.00 10.6
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate 5 5 53.50 63.00 72.50 82.00 91.50 101.00 47.50 9.5
9. Network Analyst-Advanced 5 5 62.50 70.60 78.70 86.80 94.90 103.00 40.50 8.1
10. Network Analyst-Expert 5 4 70.00 82.40 94.80 107.20 119.60 132.00 62.00 12.4
11. Network Administrator-Entry 5 5 35.00 48.00 61.00 74.00 87.00 100.00 65.00 13
12. Network Administrator- 5 5 5250 | 62.00 71.50 81.00 90.50 | 100.00 | 47.50 9.5
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator- 5 4 60.00 68.00 76.00 84.00 92.00 | 100.00 | 40.00 8
Advanced
14. Network Administrator-Expert 5 4 65.00 76.00 87.00 98.00 109.00 120.00 55.00 11
15. Network Technician-Entry 5 5 35.00 48.00 61.00 74.00 87.00 100.00 65.00 13
16. Network Technician- 5 5 39.73 | 5178 63.84 75.89 87.95 | 100.00 | 6027 | 12.054
Intermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced 5 5 40.00 52.00 64.00 76.00 88.00 100.00 60.00 12
18. Network Technician-Expert 5 5 43.82 55.06 66.29 77.53 88.76 100.00 56.18 11.236
19. Network Security Specialist- 5 5 53.00 67.40 81.80 96.20 110.60 | 125.00 | 72.00 14.4
Intermediate
20. Network Security Specialist- 5 4 63.00 | 77.40 91.80 10620 | 12060 | 135.00 | 72.00 14.4
Advanced
E:]'tvwveb Applications Programmer- 5 5 47.00 56.60 66.20 75.80 8540 | 95.00 | 48.00 9.6
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PRICING SCORE SHEET
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22. Web Applications Programmer- 2 2 NO BID 2 3 NO BID | NOBID 2 1 NO BID 5

Intermediate

23. Web Applications Programmer- 1 2 NO BID 2 3 NO BID | NOBID 2 1 NO BID 5

Advanced

E‘)‘(‘p‘z’r‘:b Applications Programmer- 1 1 NO BID 3 3 NO BID | NO BID 2 1 NO BID 5

25. Web Designer-Intermediate 3 3 NO BID 1 4 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 4 NO BID 4

26. Web Designer-Advanced 1 2 NO BID 2 2 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 5 NO BID 4

27. Web Security Specialist-No 1 1 NO BID 2 2 NO BID | NOBID 2 1 NO BID 4

Variance

E?"t;e'ewmm”"'catm“ Engineer- 5 NO BID | NO BID 3 5 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID 1 NO BID 5

29. Telecommunication Engineer- 4 NO BID | NOBID 3 5 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID 1 NO BID 4

Intermediate

30. Telecommunication Engineer- 4 NO BID | NOBID 4 5 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID 1 NO BID 5

Advanced

El‘p::emmm”"'catm“ Engineer- 3 NO BID | NOBID 4 4 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID 1 NO BID 5

Ei‘t:ye'ewmm”"'catm“ Technician- 4 NO BID | NOBID 1 5 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID 3 NO BID 4

33. Telecommunication Technician- 4 NO BID | NOBID 1 5 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID 2 NO BID 4

Intermediate

34. Telecommunication Technician- 3 NO BID | NO BID 1 5 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 2 NO BID 3

Advanced

35. Security Analyst-Entry 4 NO BID | NO BID 1 5 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

36. Security Analyst-Intermediate 4 NO BID | NO BID 2 5 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

37. Security Analyst-Advanced 3 NO BID | NO BID 3 4 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5

38. Security Analyst-Expert 3 NO BID | NO BID 3 4 NOBID | NOBID | NO BID 1 NO BID 5
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR: o Scores are as follows:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK £ If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN . E If the Prl.ce |§ > to the 2nd column of prllces - But < then the 3rd column of pr.lces_= 4 pqlnts
‘ ] 5 o) _g © If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points

DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM 5 ~ g a N If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker S5 | <L

w5 - ©T O c =

»C 'g g o 8 E Pomts 4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point

S5 E 8 % owest $ Highest $

HE8S5 | SQ%
22. Web Applications Programmer- 5 5 60.00 69.00 78.00 87.00 96.00 | 105.00 | 45.00 9
Intermediate
23. Web Applications Programmer- 5 4 68.50 77.80 87.10 96.40 105.70 | 115.00 | 46.50 9.3
Advanced
E‘)‘(‘p‘z’r‘:b Applications Programmer- 5 4 75.00 87.00 99.00 111.00 123.00 | 135.00 | 60.00 12
25. Web Designer-Intermediate 5 5 45.00 54.00 63.00 72.00 81.00 90.00 | 45.00 9
26. Web Designer-Advanced 5 5 55.00 67.00 79.00 91.00 103.00 | 115.00 | 60.00 12
27. Web Security Specialist-No 5 5 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 | 150.00 | 90.00 18
Variance
E?"tLe'emmm”"'catm“ Engineer- 5 5 28.00 52.40 76.80 101.20 125.60 | 150.00 | 122.00 24.4
29. Telecommunication Engineer- 5 5 33.00 59.40 85.80 112.20 138.60 | 165.00 | 132.00 26.4
Intermediate
30. Telecommunication Engineer- 5 5 47.00 75.60 104.20 132.80 161.40 | 190.00 | 143.00 28.6
Advanced
Zl‘pz:ewmm”"'catm“ Engineer- 5 5 55.00 83.00 111.00 139.00 167.00 | 195.00 | 140.00 28
:‘:"tLe'emmm”"'catm“ Technician- 5 5 25.00 40.00 55.00 70.00 85.00 | 100.00 | 75.00 15
33. Telecommunication Technician- 5 5 34.00 47.20 60.40 73.60 86.80 | 100.00 | 66.00 13.2
Intermediate
34. Telecommunication Technician- 5 5 43.00 54.40 65.80 77.20 88.60 | 100.00 | 57.00 11.4
Advanced
35. Security Analyst-Entry 5 5 42.00 55.60 69.20 82.80 96.40 | 110.00 | 68.00 13.6
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate 5 5 52.50 68.00 83.50 99.00 114.50 | 130.00 | 77.50 155
37. Security Analyst-Advanced 5 5 58.00 74.40 90.80 107.20 123.60 140.00 82.00 16.4
38. Security Analyst-Expert 5 5 65.00 82.00 99.00 116.00 133.00 | 150.00 | 85.00 17

Page 22 of 24




PRICING SCORE SHEET
TABULATION SHEET FOR: . o 2 . ,,,
©

REP# SDOC-06-103-LK ® _5 8 £ = L2 5

PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN | S o S5 S o g S o 2
5= 122 2 o =2 I =, oo &35 N 3

DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM $58 82, |58 |82 3| 8¢ = |53 0 33 o S 23

= ~ —_— A ~ s

"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES | §%& [§@ 382 S85 (g & 285 | ul8 |280hw 59 2O o2 < 3
S0 £<E-—OO C<>:OO E% _|_c§:oo CWVWO (S| T © [ ‘= 0 Q_gm

READ BY: _Laura Elam o5k oo oS S S Y gD | el |Z oYk gk 2L | 4OH ggi

RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker 528 |EssE| L L | £l 20 | 387 [5585%| e8| 988|387 |Csy
To02 |waw - |3 e | » o< p 2 0 25> 2= [
208|858 ESg|558 a0g |28 (20588 (685 | 80¢|SuE
Sl5lesqcl Eoc (253 El 52 ¢ g los |l Eam < @ |l 2 | eWE
EN~-0 |55 G| 82 |ES5¥El ez | T Do 58 | wBx | 93 3@
ST |50 S oo |[606E| Ens | Mo |25 €RQT | 258|282 | 593
M-k N0 OO |[Owwam|] WnO W—0O |[Oedm<| £+« S« S [ Ke) e Y4

39. Groupware Specialist-Entry 2 NOBID | NO BID 1 5 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 NO BID 4

40. Groupware Specialist- 2 NO BID | NOBID 2 4 NOBID | NOBID 2 1 NO BID 4

Intermediate

41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced 2 NO BID | NO BID 2 4 NO BID | NO BID 2 1 NO BID 4

‘éi‘tf‘yysmms Software Programmer- 4 4 NO BID 3 5 NO BID | NO BID 5 1 NO BID 5

43. Systems Software Programmer- 3 3 NO BID 2 5 NO BID | NO BID 3 1 NO BID 5

Intermediate

44. Systems Software Programmer- 1 1 NO BID 2 4 NO BID | NOBID 2 1 NO BID 5

Advanced

‘éi‘pi‘r’ftems Software Programmer- 1 1 NO BID 2 4 NO BID | NO BID 1 1 NO BID 5

46. Systems Administrator-Entry 3 4 NO BID 1 4 NO BID | NO BID 3 3 NO BID 4

47. Systems Administrator- 3 2 NO BID 1 5 NO BID | NO BID 3 3 NO BID 4

Intermediate

48. Systems Administrator- 1 1 NO BID 1 5 NO BID | NOBID 2 4 NO BID 5

Advanced

49. Systems Administrator-Expert 1 1 NO BID 1 4 NO BID | NO BID 2 4 NO BID 4

50. Systems Security Specialist-No 4 3 NO BID 2 5 NOBID | NOBID | NOBID 1 NO BID 4

Variance

Total All Vendor Scores 125 66 NO BID 94 184 35 NO BID 40 86 NOBID | 223

Divide by 50 2.50 254 | NOBD | 1.88 3.68 206 | NOBID | 2.50 172 | NOBID | 4.46
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PRICING

SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:

Scores are as follows:

RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK .g If the Price is = to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points
> If the Price is = to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points
(7))

PAGES GO éCROSS THEN DOWN 5 5 _g If the Price is = to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM ﬂ—>3 ~ (qi a § If the Price is = to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES 25| 228 If the Price is = to the 5th column of prices - But < to the 6th column of prices = 1 point
READ BY: _Laura Elam 2SS | 85<
RECORDED BY:_Lisa Kesecker S5 | <L

w5 - ©T O c =

(/>)’ €] 'g g o 8 3 RIS 4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point

ﬁ = g E 8 % Lowest $ Highest $

EFS30 | oRe
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry 4 5 35.00 47.00 59.00 71.00 83.00 95.00 | 60.00 12
40. Groupware Specialist- 5 5 47.00 58.60 70.20 81.80 93.40 | 105.00 | 58.00 116
Intermediate
41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced 5 5 55.00 67.00 79.00 91.00 103.00 115.00 60.00 12
g‘tz"“ems Software Programmer- 5 4 50.00 65.00 80.00 95.00 110.00 | 125.00 | 75.00 15
43. Systems Software Programmer- 5 3 60.00 69.00 78.00 87.00 96.00 | 105.00 | 45.00 9
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer- 5 2 65.00 75.00 85.00 95.00 105.00 | 115.00 | 50.00 10
Advanced
‘é‘:’('pi‘r’ftems Software Programmer- 5 2 70.00 81.00 92.00 103.00 114.00 | 125.00 | 55.00 11
46. Systems Administrator-Entry 4 5 38.48 47.78 57.09 66.39 75.70 85.00 46.52 9.304
47. Systems Administrator- 5 5 49.52 57.62 65.71 73.81 81.90 90.00 | 40.48 8.096
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator- 5 5 63.00 70.40 77.80 85.20 92.60 | 100.00 | 37.00 7.4
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert 5 4 68.00 76.40 84.80 93.20 101.60 110.00 42.00 8.4
50. Systems Security Specialist-No 5 4 58.00 72.40 86.80 101.20 115.60 | 130.00 | 72.00 14.4
Variance
Total All Vendor Scores 248 215
Divide by 50 4.96 4.30
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